

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: July 22, 2019
Bid: #19-25 Copy Paper

Vendor City/State	Graphic 14 Mundelein IL			Lewis Paper Wheeling IL			Midland Paper Wheeling IL			Paper 101 Ankeny IA			Tiles in Style Naperville IL			Veritiv Jacksonville FL			Warehouse Direct Des Plaines IL		
Original Signature	Yes			Yes			Yes			Yes			Yes			Yes			Yes		
Certification	Yes			Yes			Yes			Yes			Yes			Yes			Yes		
References	Yes			Yes			Yes			Yes			Yes			Yes			Yes		
Paper size	Yr 1	Yr 2	Yr 3, optional	Yr 1	Yr 2	Yr 3, optional	Yr 1	Yr 2	Yr 3, optional	Yr 1	Yr 2	Yr 3, optional	Yr 1	Yr 2	Yr 3, optional	Yr 1	Yr 2	Yr 3, optional	Yr 1	Yr 2	Yr 3, optional
8-1/2 X 11	\$31.10	\$34.80	No bid	\$39.75	\$42.75	No bid	\$31.80	\$32.80	\$34.30	\$30.95	\$32.45	\$33.95	\$42.89	\$46.19	\$49.49	\$31.50	\$34.50	\$37.50	\$36.20	\$38.10	No bid
8-1/2 X 14	\$49.60	\$55.95	No bid	\$42.75	\$45.75	No bid	\$43.75	\$44.75	\$46.25	\$39.55	\$41.40	\$43.31	\$59.79	\$64.39	\$68.99	\$45.00	\$49.00	\$53.50	\$56.20	\$56.20	No bid
11 X 17	\$39.00	\$43.95	No bid	\$45.75	\$48.75	No bid	\$34.30	\$35.30	\$36.80	\$31.10	\$32.60	\$34.10	\$68.89	\$74.19	\$79.49	\$35.50	\$39.00	\$42.50	\$42.45	\$45.23	No bid
Exceptions	No			No			See bid			Quoting all items as a group			No			No			No		

Publicly posted & advertised as required by law. Received 7 bids