

Summary Sheet
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: September 13, 2019
Bid: #19-42 Getac In-Car Camera System

Vendor City/State	Howard Technology Ellisville MS				Ultra Strobe Crystal Lake IL				Watchguard Allen TX
Signature	Yes				Yes				<i>No Bid</i>
Certification & References	Yes				Yes				
Items	Yr 1 9/13/19- 11/30/20	Yr 2, optional 12/1/20- 11/30/21	Yr 3, optional 12/1/21- 11/30/22	Yr 4, optional 12/1/22- 11/30/23	Yr 1 9/13/19- 11/30/20	Yr 2, optional 12/1/20- 11/30/21	Yr 3, optional 12/1/21- 11/30/22	Yr 4, optional 12/1/22- 11/30/23	
OVCXXXXXAXX1 Getac VR-X20 i3 LTE-DVR (VR-X20-i3) Integrated 4GB RAM+128GB SSD + Battery Backup + WIFI + GPS + Crash Sensor, DVR mounting bracket, A/V input cable, 4G LTE, 1 year hardware warranty	\$3409.00	\$3409.00	No bid	No bid	\$2740.00	\$2850.00	\$2970.00	\$3090.00	
ONX01U Getac Wireless Mic (WM-T2400) 2.4GHz Complete kit – Receiver, Transmitter, lapel, holster, cable	\$474.00	\$474.00	No bid	No bid	\$415.00	\$435.00	\$455.00	\$475.00	
ONX04U Getac Wireless Mic (WM-T2400) Home Charger Base, includes AC adapter	\$85.00	\$85.00	No bid	No bid	\$77.95	\$84.00	\$89.00	\$94.00	
OPX01X Getac Display (CU-D50) 5” touch display, includes 16ft. cable	\$260.00	\$260.00	No bid	No bid	\$249.00	\$260.00	\$270.00	\$285.00	
ORM02X Getac Cabin Camera (CA-MF50S) Analog, infrared, includes cable set	\$110.00	\$110.00	No bid	No bid	\$99.00	\$105.00	\$110.00	\$115.00	
ORN04X Getac ZeroDark FHD IP Camera (CA-NF21-N(50)), Wind Shield mount, includes 25ft cable	\$390.00	\$390.00	No bid	No bid	\$369.00	\$385.00	\$400.00	\$420.00	
OIA03X Mounting Bracket (visor); Front Camera <u>AND</u> Display (CU-D50) for Charger	\$62.00	\$62.00	No bid	No bid	\$59.00	\$61.00	\$63.00	\$65.00	
OIA01X Mounting Bracket (visor); Universal for Display (CU-D50) <u>ONLY</u>	\$51.00	\$51.00	No bid	No bid	\$39.00	\$41.00	\$43.00	\$45.00	
OUA031 Getac Cloud – Yearly Plan 3 (Cloud 60G/month, SW maintenance) Quantity = 1 per year per unit	\$750.00	\$750.00	No bid	No bid	\$520.00	\$530.00	\$545.00	\$560.00	
Installation Cost per unit (optional); must be certified Getac installer	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$360.00	\$375.00	\$400.00	\$425.00	
Exceptions	No				No				

