

McHenry County Government Center
Adam Letendre, Director of Purchasing
Administration Building Room 200
Woodstock, IL 60098

September 4, 2019

ADDENDUM #1

**Bid #19-35 Jail Paper Products
Due September 11, 2019 no later than 2:00PM (CST)**

Additions & Clarifications to BID

- Question #1:** Can you send me a copy of the Previous Award Tabulation for the above-indicated Bid Opportunity
Response: Refer to the attached summary; however, specifications & scope have changed.
- Question #2:** Do you know what other items are approved for the following line items: #1, #2, #4, #5 Is there a list?
Response: Bidders should offer the items identified or equivalents. Equivalent items will be evaluated based upon samples and specifications. There is no list of pre-approved equivalent items.
- Question #3:** Does the County issue a contract award for each item, or do we have to bid on every item to be considered a responsive bidder?
Response: There will be only one contract award. Bidders should bid on every item.
- Question #4:** For Item #4, Kimberly Clark Wypall 05812, I show this sku as 90 towels per pack, 12 packs per case. Your bid shows different quantities. Please clarify.
Response: #4 should be Kimberly Clark L30 Wypall Towels, SKU #05812, 12.5"X12", quarter fold, strong and absorbent. 90 towels per pack/12 packs per case.
- Question #5:** Can you please provide me with the previous award information and tabulations?
Response: Refer to the attached summary; however, specifications & scope have changed.
- Question #6:** How many locations will be utilizing this contract?
Response: Initially one (1), but others may utilize the contract, as needed.
- Question #7:** Can we supply our private label closest to the name brand paper products?
Response: Yes
- Question #8:** Do you know a rough estimate of how many would be ordered at a time or assume qty 1 or minimum?
Response: Bid price should be based on the minimum or Qty of 1. The County may order each item in different quantities. Toilet paper is normally 16 cases to a pallet and individual order can be 1-4 pallets. Folded paper towels are ordered by 35-40 cases and individual order is normally 1 pallet. All other items would ordered as needed (1 case to 6 cases).
- Question #9:** Please clarify the minimum 2 year contract and we can put in optional pricing for year 3 and 4?
Response: Yes
- Question #10:** Can you please send the pricing paid on the open bid (I assume it was a 4 year) as well as your current provider
Response: Refer to the attached summary; however, specifications & scope have changed. The current provider is HP Products, however each year was awarded to multiple vendors.

All Other Terms and Conditions of the Bid Remain the Same

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: Sept 26, 2016
 Bid/RFP #:16-51 Provide Chem/Supplies

Vendor:	Warehouse Direct								
City/State:	Des Plaines IL								
Original Signature	yes								
Mandatory Pages	yes								
Remove & re-award line 7 & 8; Does not meet ACA Hazard Standard									
ITEM	Approx Qty annually	Size Pkg.	UNIT COST Base Year 12/1/16-11/30/17	TOTAL COST Base Year 12/1/16-11/30/17	UNIT COST Year 2 (optional) 12/1/17-11/30/18	TOTAL COST Year 2 (optional) 12/1/17-11/30/18	UNIT COST Year 3 (optional) 12/1/18-11/30/19	TOTAL COST Year 3 (optional) 12/1/18-11/30/19	
Germisept EPA Registered, "concentrate" to be used in a dilution system) 4-1 gallon containers/case	400	Case (quoting 2 gallons/case \$59.15 x 2)	\$118.30	\$47,320.00					
Kleen & Klear, "concentrate" to be used in a dilution system; 4-1 gallon containers/case	100	Case (quoting 2 gallons/case \$106.95 x 2)	\$213.90	\$21,390.00					
Clear Printed Chemical Labeled Quart Bottles	1/ea	50/box ea chem	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	
Windex Wipes Canister	10	Canister 9/case	\$38.00	\$380.00	\$40.86	\$408.60	\$43.93	\$439.30	
Clorox Wipe Canister	16	Canister 4/pkg	\$27.55	\$440.80	\$29.62	\$473.92	\$31.84	\$509.44	
Toilet Bowl Brushes	60	Each	\$1.00	\$60.00	\$1.07	\$64.20	\$1.15	\$69.00	
Non Para Urinal Block w/Screen	8	12/case	\$13.45	\$107.60	\$14.46	\$115.68	\$15.54	\$124.32	
La Grosse Brothers Plunger w/handle	6	6/case	\$26.10	\$156.60	\$28.06	\$168.36	\$30.17	\$181.02	

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: Sept 26, 2016
Bid/RFP #:16-51 Provide Chem/Supplies

Milwaukee Dustless Poly Multi Level Scrub Brush	4	10 Inch 12/case	\$133.80	\$535.20	\$143.88	\$575.52	\$154.68	\$618.72
Scrub Brush w/24" Handle White	12	12/case	\$105.00	\$1,260.00	\$112.80	\$1,353.60	\$121.32	\$1,455.84
Gojo Moisturizing Hand Cream Refill	3	800 ml 12/case	\$80.00	\$240.00	\$80.00	\$240.00	\$92.48	\$277.44
Gojo Instant Hand Sanitizer Refill	20	800 ml 12/case	\$95.40	\$1,908.00	\$102.58	\$2,051.60	\$110.02	\$2,240.00
Gojo 800 ml Dispensers	6	12/case	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Gojo Orange Hand Cleaner	2	4.5 lb Tub 6/case	\$82.00	\$164.00	\$88.17	\$176.34	\$94.79	\$189.58
Foaming Hand Antibacterial Skin Cleanser Refill	45	Foaming Hand Antibacterial Skin Cleanser Refill	\$33.15	\$1,491.75	\$35.64	\$1,603.80	\$38.32	\$1,724.40
800 ml Dispensers	6	12/case	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Pour Bottle top	1	48/box	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Spray Trigger for Quart Bottles	4	12/box	\$8.40	\$33.60	\$9.00	\$36.00	\$9.60	\$38.40
Tampax Tampons	8	200/case	\$58.70	\$469.60	\$63.11	\$504.88	\$67.86	\$542.88
Feminine Guards	16	250/case	\$38.25	\$612.00	\$41.12	\$657.92	\$44.21	\$707.36
Avery Dennison Manilla Ship Tags Strung Size #4	4	500/box	\$42.00	\$168.00	\$45.16	\$180.64	\$48.55	\$194.20
Reloc Reclosable Poly Bag	10	6 X 9 1000/case	\$22.15	\$221.50	\$23.81	\$238.10	\$25.60	\$256.00
Reloc Reclosable Poly Bag	6	12 X 12 1000/case	\$53.95	\$323.70	\$58.01	\$348.06	\$62.37	\$374.22
Garbage Bags Large Clear Flat Property Bags	30	250/case	\$25.65	\$769.50	\$27.90	\$837.00	\$30.00	\$900.00

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: Sept 26, 2016
 Bid/RFP #:16-51 Provide Chem/Supplies

Garbage Bags Medium Clear Flat	20	250/case	\$20.65	\$413.00	\$22.17	\$443.40	\$23.84	\$476.80
Garbage Bags Large Green Flat	45	250/case	\$22.80	\$1,026.00	\$24.51	\$1,102.95	\$26.35	\$1,185.75
Garbage Bags Medium Green Flat	25	250/case	\$24.65	\$616.25	\$26.50	\$662.50	\$28.50	\$712.50
Jaguar Red Bio Bag	1	24 X 23 250/case	\$14.50	\$14.50	\$15.95	\$15.95	\$16.76	\$16.76
Jaguar Red Bio Bag	2	30 X 36 250/case	\$29.00	\$58.00	\$31.18	\$62.36	\$33.53	\$67.06
Jaguar Red Bio Bag	3	40 X 46 250/case	\$21.15	\$63.45	\$22.74	\$68.22	\$24.45	\$73.35
Rough Floor Mop Heads	8	12/box	\$99.00	\$792.00	\$106.44	\$851.52	\$114.48	\$915.84
Seco Rubbermaid Gripper wet Mop Fiberglass handle	15	12/box	\$89.25	\$1,338.75	\$95.96	\$1,439.40	\$103.32	\$1,549.80
Tampico Black push Broom Head	7	18 inch 12/box	\$39.00	\$273.00	\$41.93	\$293.51	\$45.08	\$315.56
Fiberglass Broom Handle	15	12/box	\$70.75	\$1,061.25	\$76.07	\$1,141.05	\$81.79	\$1,226.85
Unison Angle Poly Broom	8	1 loose	\$5.80	\$46.40	\$6.23	\$49.84	\$6.70	\$53.60
Corn Broom	2	1 loose	\$7.58	\$15.16	\$8.15	\$16.30	\$8.76	\$17.52
Rubbermaid Security Bucket w/Basket Wringer	3	1/box	\$66.20	\$198.60	\$71.18	\$213.54	\$76.53	\$229.59
Rubbermaid Bucket w/ Wringer	1	1 set	\$53.85	\$53.85	\$57.90	\$57.90	\$62.25	\$62.25
Heavy Duty Dust Pan Plastic	2	12/case	\$19.90	\$39.80	\$21.39	\$42.78	\$23.00	\$46.00
Heavy Duty Cleaning Caddy	1	6/case	\$34.65	\$34.65	\$37.25	\$37.25	\$40.05	\$40.05
Rubbermaid Soft Wastebasket 8-10 Qt	4	12/case	\$81.60	\$326.40	\$87.72	\$350.88	\$94.32	\$377.28
Rubbermaid Red Bio Step-On Container	1	1/box	\$87.00	\$87.00	\$93.54	\$93.54	\$100.58	\$100.58

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: Sept 26, 2016
Bid/RFP #:16-51 Provide Chem/Supplies

Rubbermaid Roughneck Totes Bronze	50	14 Gallon 1 loose	\$15.65	\$782.50	\$16.82	\$841.00	\$18.09	\$904.50
Rubbermaid Trash Cans	3	40 Gallon 1 loose	\$67.15	\$202.50	\$72.58	\$217.54	\$78.03	\$234.09
Rubbermaid Trash Cans	2	32 Gallon 1 loose	\$31.75	\$63.50	\$34.13	\$68.26	\$36.70	\$73.40
Rubbermaid Recycle Waste Can	4	14 Gallon 1 loose	\$39.50	\$158.00	\$42.47	\$169.88	\$45.66	\$182.64
Rubbermaid 4 wheel Flat Bed Cart	1	1 loose	\$415.00	\$415.00	\$446.23	\$446.23	\$479.77	\$479.77
Squeegee w/Metal Handle	4	18 inch 1 loose	\$15.75	\$63.00	\$16.93	\$67.72	\$18.20	\$72.80
Squeegee w/Metal Handle	2	14 inch 1 loose	\$13.25	\$26.50	\$14.24	\$28.48	\$15.32	\$30.64
Squeegee w/Plastic Handle	2	12 inch 1 loose	\$12.50	\$25.00	\$13.44	\$26.88	\$14.45	\$28.90
Squeegee w/Plastic Handle	2	6 inch 1 loose	\$3.85	\$7.70	\$4.13	\$8.26	\$4.45	\$8.90
Eye Wash Station solution	3	4/box	\$63.00	\$189.00	\$67.74	\$203.22	\$72.83	\$218.49
MDB Nylon 10" Truck Wash Brush	1	6/box	\$49.50	\$49.50	\$53.22	\$53.22	\$57.23	\$57.23
Red Non-Sequential Numbered Tamper Seals	1	500/box	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Rubbermaid Parts/Cart Wheels/ Bucket Wheels	2	12/loose	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Scott Toilet Paper	1100	80 Rolls/box	\$31.65	\$34,815.00	\$34.03	\$37,433.00	\$36.59	\$40,249.00
Scott C-Fold Paper Towels	450	25pk of 175twl/case	\$33.25	\$14,962.50	\$35.75	\$16,087.50	\$39.44	\$17,748.00
Kimberly Clark Wype-All	20	18pk of 56twl/case	\$39.50	\$790.00	\$42.47	\$849.40	\$45.66	\$913.20
Scott Jumbo Roll Toilet Paper	15	6 X 200/case	\$22.75	\$341.25	\$24.46	\$366.90	\$26.30	\$394.50

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: Sept 26, 2016
 Bid/RFP #:16-51 Provide Chem/Supplies

Scott Toilet Paper Dispenser Metal	1	1 loose as needed	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Scott C-Fold Paper Towel Dispenser Plastic	2	1 loose as needed	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Tuffskin Liners Coreless Roll Bags .62 ml	200	40 X 48 250/case	\$28.00	\$5,600.00	\$30.10	\$6,020.00	\$32.37	\$6,474.00
Essential Industries Drain Opener Non-Acid	4	12 qt./case	\$25.00	\$100.00	\$26.88	\$107.52	\$28.90	\$115.60
Plexi Shine Aerosol Glass Cleaner	8	12 /case	\$29.90	\$239.20	\$32.15	\$257.20	\$34.57	\$276.56
Sani Kleen Aerosol Germicide	8	12 /case	\$40.30	\$322.40	\$43.33	\$346.64	\$46.59	\$372.72
Total Care Aerosol-Toilet Bowl Cleaner (not an aerosol)	10	12 qt/case	\$27.00	\$270.00	\$29.03	\$290.30	\$31.21	\$312.10
Buckeye Blue Multi-Purpose Floor Soap, "concentrate" to be used in a dilution system	8	5 gal. box (did not quote a concentrate)	\$42.25	\$338.00	\$45.43	\$363.44	\$48.84	\$390.72
TOTAL			\$3,050.58	\$144,270.46	\$2,917.62	\$81,229.70	\$3,143.92	\$87,847.02
EXEPTIONS:								
What is the number of days after placing order that product will be delivered to dock:	1 - 5			\$85,418.86		\$91,828.98		\$99,201.18
Sent to bidders. Responses from:								
			Base Year	\$88,120.46				
			Option Year 2	\$94,732.70				
			Option Year 3	\$102,363.02				
			Total	\$285,216.18				

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: Sept 26, 2016
 Bid/RFP #:16-51 Provide Chem/Supplies

Vendor:	Elkhorn Chemicals								
City/State:	Elkhorn WI								
Original Signature	yes								
Mandatory Pages	yes								
ITEM	Approx Qty annually	Size Pkg.	UNIT COST Base Year 12/1/16-11/30/17	TOTAL COST Base Year 12/1/16-11/30/17	UNIT COST Year 2 (optional) 12/1/17-11/30/18	TOTAL COST Year 2 (optional) 12/1/17-11/30/18	UNIT COST Year 3 (optional) 12/1/18-11/30/19	TOTAL COST Year 3 (optional) 12/1/18-11/30/19	
Germisept EPA Registered, "concentrate" to be used in a dilution system) 4-1 gallon containers/case	400	Case /per GALLON/4per case	\$32.00	\$12,800.00	\$34.00	\$13,600.00	\$35.00	\$14,000.00	
Kleen & Klear, "concentrate" to be used in a dilution system; 4-1 gallon containers/case	100	Case/per gallon	\$22.00	\$550.00	\$5.75	\$575.00	\$6.00	\$600.00	
Clear Printed Chemical Labeled Quart Bottles	1/ea	50/box ea chem/Per bottle price	\$0.90	\$0.90	\$0.90	\$0.90	\$0.90	\$0.90	
Windex Wipes Canister	10	Canister 9/case	\$42.50	\$425.00	\$44.50	\$445.00	\$45.00	\$450.00	
Clorox Wipe Canister	16	Canister 4/pkg. 6 per pkg	\$28.45	\$455.20	\$29.75	\$476.00	\$30.00	\$480.00	
Toilet Bowl Brushes	60	Each	\$0.90	\$54.00	\$0.90	\$54.00	\$0.90	\$54.00	
Non Para Urinal Block w/Screen	8	12/case	\$19.50	\$156.00	\$20.00	\$160.00	\$21.00	\$168.00	
La Grosse Brothers Plunger w/handle	6	6/case quoted EACH	\$42.00	\$252.00	\$42.00	\$252.00	\$42.00	\$252.00	
Milwaukee Dustless Poly Multi Level Scrub Brush	4	10 Inch 12/case quoted EACH	\$120.00	\$480.00	\$132.00	\$528.00	\$144.00	\$576.00	

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: Sept 26, 2016
Bid/RFP #:16-51 Provide Chem/Supplies

Scrub Brush w/24" Handle White	12	12/case	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Gojo Moisturizing Hand Cream Refill	3	800 ml 12/case	\$100.00	\$300.00	\$105.00	\$315.00	\$107.00	\$321.00
Gojo Instant Hand Sanitizer Refill	20	800 ml 12/case 1000ml, 8/cs	\$75.00	\$1,500.00	\$78.00	\$1,560.00	\$79.00	\$1,580.00
Gojo 800 ml Dispensers	6	12/case	\$20.00	\$120.00	\$20.00	\$120.00	\$20.00	\$120.00
Gojo Orange Hand Cleaner	2	4.5 lb Tub 6/case	\$85.00	\$170.00	\$87.00	\$174.00	\$88.00	\$176.00
Foaming Hand Antibacterial Skin Cleanser Refill	45	Foaming Hand Antibacterial Skin Cleanser Refill	\$40.00	\$1,800.00	\$42.00	\$1,890.00	\$43.00	\$1,935.00
800 ml Dispensers	6	12/case 1000ml item, Quoted EACH	\$60.00	\$360.00	\$60.00	\$360.00	\$60.00	\$360.00
Pour Bottle top	1	48/box	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Spray Trigger for Quart Bottles	4	12/box Quoted EACH	\$9.00	\$36.00	\$9.60	\$38.40	\$10.02	\$40.80
Tampax Tampons	8	200/case	\$63.00	\$504.00	\$65.00	\$520.00	\$66.00	\$528.00
Feminine Guards	16	250/case	\$44.00	\$704.00	\$45.00	\$720.00	\$46.00	\$736.00
Avery Dennison Manilla Ship Tags Strung Size #4	4	500/box	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Reloc Reclosable Poly Bag	10	6 X 9 1000/case	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Reloc Reclosable Poly Bag	6	12 X 12 1000/case	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Garbage Bags Large Clear Flat Property Bags	30	250/case	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Garbage Bags Medium Clear Flat	20	250/case	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Garbage Bags Large Green Flat	45	250/case	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: Sept 26, 2016
Bid/RFP #:16-51 Provide Chem/Supplies

Garbage Bags Medium Green Flat	25	250/case	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Jaguar Red Bio Bag	1	24 X 23 250/case	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Jaguar Red Bio Bag	2	30 X 36 250/case	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Jaguar Red Bio Bag	3	40 X 46 250/case	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Rough Floor Mop Heads	8	12/box	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Seco Rubbermaid Gripper wet Mop Fiberglass handle	15	12/box	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Tampico Black push Broom Head	7	18 inch 12/box	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Fiberglass Broom Handle	15	12/box	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Unison Angle Poly Broom	8	1 loose	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Corn Broom	2	1 loose	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Rubbermaid Security Bucket w/Basket Wringer	3	1/box	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Rubbermaid Bucket w/ Wringer	1	1 set	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Heavy Duty Dust Pan Plastic	2	12/case	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Heavy Duty Cleaning Caddy	1	6/case	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Rubbermaid Soft Wastebasket 8-10 Qt	4	12/case	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Rubbermaid Red Bio Step-On Container	1	1/box	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Rubbermaid Roughneck Totes Bronze	50	14 Gallon 1 loose	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Rubbermaid Trash Cans	3	40 Gallon 1 loose	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: Sept 26, 2016
Bid/RFP #:16-51 Provide Chem/Supplies

Rubbermaid Trash Cans	2	32 Gallon 1 loose	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Rubbermaid Recycle Waste Can	4	14 Gallon 1 loose	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Rubbermaid 4 wheel Flat Bed Cart	1	1 loose	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Squeegee w/Metal Handle	4	18 inch 1 loose	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Squeegee w/Metal Handle	2	14 inch 1 loose	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Squeegee w/Plastic Handle	2	12 inch 1 loose	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Squeegee w/Plastic Handle	2	6 inch 1 loose	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Eye Wash Station solution	3	4/box	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
MDB Nylon 10" Truck Wash Brush	1	6/box	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Red Non-Sequential Numbered Tamper Seals	1	500/box	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Rubbermaid Parts/Cart Wheels/ Bucket Wheels	2	12/loose	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Scott Toilet Paper	1100	80 Rolls/box	\$60.00	\$66,000.00	\$62.00	\$68,200.00	\$64.00	\$70,400.00
Scott C-Fold Paper Towels	450	25pk of 175twl/case	\$47.00	\$21,150.00	\$48.50	\$21,825.00	\$49.75	\$22,387.50
Kimberly Clark Wype-All	20	18pk of 56twl/case	\$73.00	\$1,460.00	\$75.00	\$1,500.00	\$77.00	\$1,540.00
Scott Jumbo Roll Toilet Paper	15	6 X 200/case, 2000'	\$48.00	\$720.00	\$49.00	\$735.00	\$50.00	\$750.00
Scott Toilet Paper Dispenser Metal	1	1 loose as needed	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$26.00	\$26.00	\$27.00	\$27.00
Scott C-Fold Paper Towel Dispenser Plastic	2	1 loose as needed	\$25.00	\$50.00	\$26.00	\$52.00	\$27.00	\$54.00

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: Sept 26, 2016
 Bid/RFP #:16-51 Provide Chem/Supplies

Tuffskin Liners Coreless Roll Bags .62 ml	200	40 X 48 250/case	\$32.00	\$6,400.00	\$33.50	\$6,700.00	\$34.00	\$6,800.00
Essential Industries Drain Opener Non- Acid	4	12 qt./case	\$38.00	\$152.00	\$39.00	\$156.00	\$40.00	\$160.00
Plexi Shine Aerosol Glass Cleaner	8	12 /case	\$29.00	\$232.00	\$30.00	\$240.00	\$31.00	\$248.00
Sani Kleen Aerosol Germicide	8	12 /case	\$38.00	\$304.00	\$39.00	\$312.00	\$40.00	\$320.00
Total Care Aerosol Toilet Bowl Cleaner (not an aerosol)	10	12 qt/case	\$19.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Buckeye Blue Multi- Purpose Floor Soap, "concentrate" to be used in a dilution system	8	5 gal. box	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL			*see notes	\$117,160.10		\$121,534.30		\$125,064.20
EXEPTIONS:		*see bid; size/package.						
What is the number of days after placing order that product will be delivered to dock:	2							
Sent to 12 bidders. Responses from: 5								
			Base Year	\$117,160.10				
			Option Year 2	\$121,534.30				
			Option Year 3	\$125,064.20				
			Total	\$363,758.60				

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: Sept 26, 2016
 Bid/RFP #:16-51 Provide Chem/Supplies

Vendor:	HP Products								
City/State:	Alsip IL								
Original Signature	yes								
Mandatory Pages	yes								
Remove & re-award line 72, 73; Does not meet ACA Hazard Standard									
ITEM	Approx Qty annually	Size Pkg.	UNIT COST Base Year 12/1/16-11/30/17	TOTAL COST Base Year 12/1/16-11/30/17	UNIT COST Year 2 (optional) 12/1/17-11/30/18	TOTAL COST Year 2 (optional) 12/1/17-11/30/18	UNIT COST Year 3 (optional) 12/1/18-11/30/19	TOTAL COST Year 3 (optional) 12/1/18-11/30/19	
Germisept EPA Registered, "concentrate" to be used in a dilution system) 4-1 gallon containers/case	400	Case	\$28.51	\$11,404.00	\$29.24	\$11,696.00	\$29.99	\$11,996.00	
Kleen & Klear, "concentrate" to be used in a dilution system; 4-1 gallon containers/case	100	Case	\$21.24	\$2,124.00	\$21.78	\$2,178.00	\$22.36	\$2,234.00	
Clear Printed Chemical Labeled Quart Bottles	1/ea	50/box ea chem	\$2.69	\$2.69	\$2.76	\$2.76	\$2.83	\$2.83	
Windex Wipes Canister	10	Canister 9/case	\$22.73	\$227.30	\$23.31	\$233.10	\$23.91	\$239.10	
Clorox Wipe Canister	16	Canister 4/pkg	\$28.33	\$453.28	\$29.05	\$464.80	\$29.80	\$636.80	
Toilet Bowl Brushes	60	Each	\$1.49	\$89.40	\$1.53	\$91.80	\$1.57	\$94.20	
Non Para Urinal Block w/Screen	8	12/case	\$14.27	\$114.16	\$14.64	\$117.12	\$15.01	\$120.08	
La Grosse Brothers Plunger w/handle	6	6/case	\$52.31	\$313.86	\$53.66	\$321.96	\$55.03	\$330.18	

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: Sept 26, 2016
Bid/RFP #:16-51 Provide Chem/Supplies

Milwaukee Dustless Poly Multi Level Scrub Brush	4	10 Inch 12/case	\$111.24	\$444.96	\$114.09	\$456.36	\$117.01	\$468.04
Scrub Brush w/24" Handle White	12	12/case	\$96.00	\$1,152.00	\$98.46	\$1,181.52	\$100.99	\$1,211.88
Gojo Moisturizing Hand Cream Refill	3	800 ml 12/case	\$50.08	\$150.24	\$51.36	\$154.08	\$52.68	\$158.04
Gojo Instant Hand Sanitizer Refill	20	800 ml 12/case	\$63.67	\$1,273.40	\$65.30	\$1,306.00	\$66.98	\$1,339.60
Gojo 800 ml Dispensers	6	12/case	\$3.71	\$22.26	\$3.80	\$22.80	\$3.90	\$23.40
Gojo Orange Hand Cleaner	2	4.5 lb Tub 6/case	\$84.96	\$169.92	\$87.13	\$174.26	\$89.37	\$178.74
Foaming Hand Antibacterial Skin Cleanser Refill	45	Foaming Hand Antibacteria 1 Skin Cleanser Refill	\$33.60	\$1,514.70	\$34.53	\$1,553.85	\$35.41	\$1,593.45
800 ml Dispensers	6	12/case	\$3.71	\$22.26	\$3.80	\$22.80	\$3.90	\$23.40
Pour Bottle top	1	48/box	\$13.48	\$13.48	\$13.83	\$13.83	\$14.18	\$14.18
Spray Trigger for Quart Bottles	4	12/box	\$5.26	\$21.04	\$5.39	\$21.56	\$5.53	\$22.12
Tampax Tampons	8	200/case	\$54.89	\$219.56	\$56.30	\$450.40	\$57.74	\$461.92
Feminine Guards	16	250/case	\$28.09	\$449.44	\$28.21	\$460.96	\$29.55	\$472.80
Avery Dennison Manilla Ship Tags Strung Size #4	4	500/box	\$41.24	\$164.96	\$42.29	\$169.16	\$43.38	\$173.52
Reloc Reclosable Poly Bag	10	6 X 9 1000/case	\$19.10	\$191.00	\$19.59	\$195.90	\$20.09	\$200.90
Reloc Reclosable Poly Bag	6	12 X 12 1000/case	\$49.74	\$298.44	\$51.02	\$306.12	\$52.33	\$313.98
Garbage Bags Large Clear Flat Property Bags	30	250/case	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: Sept 26, 2016
Bid/RFP #:16-51 Provide Chem/Supplies

Garbage Bags Medium Clear Flat	20	250/case	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Garbage Bags Large Green Flat	45	250/case	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Garbage Bags Medium Green Flat	25	250/case	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Jaguar Red Bio Bag	1	24 X 23 250/case	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Jaguar Red Bio Bag	2	30 X 36 250/case	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Jaguar Red Bio Bag	3	40 X 46 250/case	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Rough Floor Mop Heads	8	12/box	\$93.30	\$746.40	\$95.70	\$765.60	\$98.15	\$785.20
Seco Rubbermaid Gripper wet Mop Fiberglass handle	15	12/box	\$173.93	\$2,608.95	\$178.39	\$2,675.85	\$182.97	\$1,593.45
Tampico Black push Broom Head	7	18 inch 12/box	\$79.92	\$559.44	\$81.96	\$573.72	\$84.12	\$588.84
Fiberglass Broom Handle	15	12/box	\$104.88	\$1,573.20	\$107.64	\$1,614.60	\$110.40	\$1,656.00
Unison Angle Poly Broom	8	1 loose	\$3.96	\$31.68	\$4.06	\$32.48	\$4.16	\$33.28
Corn Broom	2	1 loose	\$5.60	\$11.20	\$5.74	\$11.48	\$5.89	\$11.78
Rubbermaid Security Bucket w/Basket Wringer	3	1/box	\$54.10	\$162.30	\$55.49	\$166.47	\$56.91	\$170.73
Rubbermaid Bucket w/ Wringer	1	1 set	\$42.24	\$42.24	\$43.32	\$43.32	\$44.43	\$44.43
Heavy Duty Dust Pan Plastic	2	12/case	\$26.70	\$53.40	\$27.38	\$54.76	\$28.08	\$56.16
Heavy Duty Cleaning Caddy	1	6/case	\$44.90	\$44.90	\$46.05	\$46.05	\$47.23	\$47.23
Rubbermaid Soft Wastebasket 8-10 Qt	4	12/case	\$50.70	\$202.80	\$52.00	\$208.00	\$53.33	\$213.32

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: Sept 26, 2016
Bid/RFP #:16-51 Provide Chem/Supplies

Rubbermaid Red Bio Step-On Container	1	1/box	\$59.54	\$59.54	\$61.07	\$61.07	\$62.63	\$62.63
Rubbermaid Roughneck Totes Bronze	50	14 Gallon 1 loose	\$17.45	\$872.50	\$17.90	\$895.00	\$18.36	\$918.00
Rubbermaid Trash Cans	3	40 Gallon 1 loose	\$32.83	\$98.49	\$33.67	\$101.01	\$34.54	\$103.62
Rubbermaid Trash Cans	2	32 Gallon 1 loose	\$19.72	\$39.44	\$20.22	\$40.44	\$20.74	\$41.48
Rubbermaid Recycle Waste Can	4	14 Gallon 1 loose	\$11.57	\$46.28	\$11.87	\$47.48	\$12.17	\$48.68
Rubbermaid 4 wheel Flat Bed Cart	1	1 loose	\$275.12	\$275.12	\$282.18	\$282.18	\$289.41	\$289.41
Squeegee w/Metal Handle	4	18 inch 1 loose	\$12.00	\$48.00	\$12.31	\$49.24	\$12.62	\$50.48
Squeegee w/Metal Handle	2	14 inch 1 loose	\$11.10	\$22.20	\$11.39	\$22.78	\$11.68	\$23.36
Squeegee w/Plastic Handle	2	12 inch 1 loose	\$10.42	\$20.84	\$10.68	\$21.36	\$10.96	\$21.92
Squeegee w/Plastic Handle	2	6 inch 1 loose	\$7.42	\$14.84	\$7.61	\$15.22	\$7.80	\$15.60
Eye Wash Station solution	3	4/box	\$33.26	\$99.78	\$34.11	\$102.33	\$34.99	\$104.97
MDB Nylon 10" Truck Wash Brush	1	6/box	\$123.98	\$123.98	\$127.16	\$127.16	\$130.42	\$130.42
Red Non-Sequential Numbered Tamper Seals	1	500/box	\$157.71	\$157.71	\$161.75	\$161.75	\$168.49	\$168.49
Rubbermaid Parts/Cart Wheels/ Bucket Wheels	2	12/loose	\$149.94	\$299.88	\$156.19	\$318.38	\$160.19	\$320.38
Scott Toilet Paper	1100	80 Rolls/box	\$33.48	\$36,828.00	\$34.34	\$37,774.00	\$35.22	\$38,742.00
Scott C-Fold Paper Towels	450	25pk of 175twl/case	\$18.20	\$8,190.00	\$18.67	\$8,401.50	\$19.14	\$8,613.00

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: Sept 26, 2016
 Bid/RFP #:16-51 Provide Chem/Supplies

Kimberly Clark Wype-All	20	18pk of 56twl/case	\$51.79	\$1,035.80	\$53.11	\$1,062.20	\$54.48	\$1,089.60
Scott Jumbo Roll Toilet Paper	15	6 X 200/case	\$24.82	\$372.30	\$25.46	\$381.90	\$26.11	\$391.65
Scott Toilet Paper Dispenser Metal	1	1 loose as needed	\$11.78	\$11.78	\$12.08	\$12.08	\$12.39	\$12.39
Scott C-Fold Paper Towel Dispenser Plastic	2	1 loose as needed	\$20.08	\$40.16	\$20.59	\$41.18	\$21.12	\$42.24
Tuffskin Liners Coreless Roll Bags .62 ml	200	40 X 48 250/case	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Essential Industries Drain Opener Non-Acid	4	12 qt./case	\$26.36	\$105.44	\$27.04	\$108.16	\$28.16	\$112.64
Plexi Shine Aerosol Glass Cleaner	8	12 /case	\$28.16	\$225.28	\$29.33	\$234.64	\$30.55	\$244.40
Sani Kleen Aerosol Germicide	8	12 /case	\$22.58	\$180.64	\$23.53	\$188.24	\$24.51	\$196.08
Total Care Aerosol-Toilet Bowl Cleaner (not an aerosol)	10	12 qt/case	\$15.47	\$154.70	\$16.12	\$161.20	\$16.79	\$167.90
Buckeye Blue Multi-Purpose Floor Soap, "concentrate" to be used in a dilution system	8	5 gal. box	\$28.51	\$228.08	\$29.69	\$237.52	\$30.39	\$247.44
TOTAL			\$2,713.86	\$76,423.64	\$2,786.87	\$78,635.49	\$2,863.07	\$79,668.36
EXEPTIONS:				\$74,433.25		\$77,299.32		\$79,449.11
What is the number of days after placing order that product will be delivered to dock:	"as requested"							
Sent to 12 bidders. Responses from: 5								

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: Sept 26, 2016
Bid/RFP #:16-51 Provide Chem/Supplies

			Base Year	\$76,423.64				
			Option Year 2	\$78,635.49				
			Option Year 3	\$79,668.36				
			Total	\$234,727.49				

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: Sept 26, 2016
 Bid/RFP #:16-51 Provide Chem/Supplies

Vendor:	Cabay & Co										
City/State:	McHenry IL										
Original Signature	yes										
Mandatory Pages	yes										
	Approx Qty annually	Size Pkg.	UNIT COST Base Year 12/1/16-11/30/17	TOTAL COST Base Year 12/1/16-11/30/17	UNIT COST Year 2 (optional) 12/1/17-11/30/18	TOTAL COST Year 2 (optional) 12/1/17-11/30/18	UNIT COST Year 3 (optional) 12/1/18-11/30/19	TOTAL COST Year 3 (optional) 12/1/18-11/30/19			
ITEM											
Germisept EPA Registered, "concentrate" to be used in a dilution system) 4-1 gallon containers/case	400	Case	\$79.08	\$31,632.00	\$79.08	\$31,632.00	\$79.08	\$31,632.00			
Kleen & Klear, "concentrate" to be used in a dilution system; 4-1 gallon containers/case	100	Case	\$50.42	\$5,042.00	\$50.42	\$5,042.00	\$50.42	\$5,042.00			
Clear Printed Chemical Labeled Quart Bottles	1/ea	50/box ea chem. PER bottle price	\$0.50	\$0.50	\$0.50	\$0.50	\$0.50	\$0.50			
Windex Wipes Canister	10	Canister 9/case	\$55.11	\$551.10	\$55.11	\$551.10	\$55.11	\$551.10			
Clorox Wipe Canister	16	Canister 4/pkg	\$13.48	\$215.68	\$13.48	\$215.68	\$13.48	\$215.68			
Toilet Bowl Brushes	60	Each	\$3.31	\$198.60	\$3.31	\$198.60	\$3.31	\$198.60			
Non Para Urinal Block w/Screen	8	12/case	\$19.85	\$158.80	\$19.85	\$158.80	\$19.85	\$158.80			
La Grosse Brothers Plunger w/handle	6	6/case	\$27.60	\$165.60	\$27.60	\$165.60	\$27.60	\$165.60			
Milwaukee Dustless Poly Multi Level Scrub Brush	4	10 Inch 12/case	\$201.72	\$806.88	\$201.72	\$806.88	\$201.72	\$806.88			

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: Sept 26, 2016
 Bid/RFP #:16-51 Provide Chem/Supplies

Scrub Brush w/24" Handle White	12	12/case	\$114.36	\$1,372.32	\$114.36	\$1,372.32	\$114.36	\$1,372.32
Gojo Moisturizing Hand Cream Refill	3	800 ml 12/case	\$89.92	\$269.76	\$89.92	\$269.76	\$89.92	\$269.76
Gojo Instant Hand Sanitizer Refill	20	800 ml 12/case	\$109.66	\$2,193.20	\$109.66	\$2,193.20	\$109.66	\$2,193.20
Gojo 800 ml Dispensers	6	12/case	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Gojo Orange Hand Cleaner	2	4.5 lb Tub 6/case	\$99.39	\$198.78	\$99.39	\$198.78	\$99.39	\$198.78
Foaming Hand Antibacterial Skin Cleanser Refill	45	Foaming Hand Antibacterial Skin Cleanser Refill	\$82.80	\$3,726.00	\$82.80	\$3,726.00	\$82.80	\$3,726.00
800 ml Dispensers	6	12/case	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Pour Bottle top	1	48/box	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Spray Trigger for Quart Bottles	4	12/box	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Tampax Tampons	8	200/case	\$71.68	\$573.44	\$71.68	\$573.44	\$71.68	\$573.44
Feminine Guards	16	250/case	\$43.90	\$702.40	\$43.90	\$702.40	\$43.90	\$702.40
Avery Dennison Manilla Ship Tags Strung Size #4	4	500/box	\$39.57	\$158.28	\$39.57	\$158.28	\$39.57	\$158.28
Reloc Reclosable Poly Bag	10	6 X 9 1000/case	\$57.08	\$570.80	\$57.08	\$570.80	\$57.08	\$570.80
Reloc Reclosable Poly Bag	6	12 X 12 1000/case	\$72.08	\$432.48	\$72.08	\$432.48	\$72.08	\$432.48
Garbage Bags Large Clear Flat Property Bags	30	250/case	\$22.22	\$666.60	\$22.22	\$666.60	\$22.22	\$666.60
Garbage Bags Medium Clear Flat	20	250/case	\$15.51	\$310.20	\$15.51	\$310.20	\$15.51	\$310.20
Garbage Bags Large Green Flat	45	250/case	\$38.79	\$1,745.55	\$38.79	\$1,745.55	\$38.79	\$1,745.55

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: Sept 26, 2016
 Bid/RFP #:16-51 Provide Chem/Supplies

Garbage Bags Medium Green Flat	25	250/case	\$41.20	\$1,030.00	\$41.20	\$1,030.00	\$41.20	\$1,030.00
Jaguar Red Bio Bag	1	24 X 23 250/case	\$44.58	\$44.58	\$44.58	\$44.58	\$44.58	\$44.58
Jaguar Red Bio Bag	2	30 X 36 250/case	\$44.87	\$89.74	\$44.87	\$89.74	\$44.87	\$89.74
Jaguar Red Bio Bag	3	40 X 46 250/case	\$49.07	\$147.21	\$49.07	\$147.21	\$49.07	\$147.21
Rough Floor Mop Heads	8	12/box	\$128.68	\$1,029.44	\$128.68	\$1,029.44	\$128.68	\$1,029.44
Seco Rubbermaid Gripper wet Mop Fiberglass handle	15	12/box	\$222.36	\$3,335.40	\$222.36	\$3,335.40	\$222.36	\$3,335.40
Tampico Black push Broom Head	7	18 inch 12/box	\$191.64	\$1,341.48	\$191.64	\$1,341.48	\$191.64	\$1,341.48
Fiberglass Broom Handle	15	12/box	\$109.20	\$1,638.00	\$109.20	\$1,638.00	\$109.20	\$1,638.00
Unison Angle Poly Broom	8	1 loose	\$7.58	\$60.64	\$7.58	\$60.64	\$7.58	\$60.64
Corn Broom	2	1 loose	\$8.50	\$17.00	\$8.50	\$17.00	\$8.50	\$17.00
Rubbermaid Security Bucket w/Basket Wringer	3	1/box	\$69.55	\$208.65	\$69.55	\$208.65	\$69.55	\$208.65
Rubbermaid Bucket w/ Wringer	1	1 set	\$49.85	\$49.85	\$49.85	\$49.85	\$49.85	\$49.85
Heavy Duty Dust Pan Plastic	2	12/case	\$27.00	\$54.00	\$27.00	\$54.00	\$27.00	\$54.00
Heavy Duty Cleaning Caddy	1	6/case	\$63.96	\$63.96	\$63.96	\$63.96	\$63.96	\$63.96
Rubbermaid Soft Wastebasket 8-10 Qt	4	12/case	\$83.52	\$334.08	\$83.52	\$334.08	\$83.52	\$334.08
Rubbermaid Red Bio Step-On Container	1	1/box	\$85.35	\$85.35	\$85.35	\$85.35	\$85.35	\$85.35
Rubbermaid Roughneck Totes Bronze	50	14 Gallon 1 loose	\$11.88	\$594.00	\$11.88	\$594.00	\$11.88	\$594.00

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: Sept 26, 2016
 Bid/RFP #:16-51 Provide Chem/Supplies

Rubbermaid Trash Cans	3	40 Gallon 1 loose	\$52.51	\$157.53	\$52.51	\$157.53	\$52.51	\$157.53
Rubbermaid Trash Cans	2	32 Gallon 1 loose	\$37.50	\$75.00	\$37.50	\$75.00	\$37.50	\$75.00
Rubbermaid Recycle Waste Can	4	14 Gallon 1 loose	\$23.97	\$95.88	\$23.97	\$95.88	\$23.97	\$95.88
Rubbermaid 4 wheel Flat Bed Cart	1	1 loose	\$534.94	\$534.94	\$534.94	\$534.94	\$534.94	\$534.94
Squeegee w/Metal Handle	4	18 inch 1 loose	\$16.65	\$66.60	\$16.65	\$66.60	\$16.65	\$66.60
Squeegee w/Metal Handle	2	14 inch 1 loose	\$15.73	\$31.46	\$15.73	\$31.46	\$15.73	\$31.46
Squeegee w/Plastic Handle	2	12 inch 1 loose	\$14.21	\$28.42	\$14.21	\$28.42	\$14.21	\$28.42
Squeegee w/Plastic Handle	2	6 inch 1 loose	\$4.99	\$9.98	\$4.99	\$9.98	\$4.99	\$9.98
Eye Wash Station solution	3	4/box	\$32.20	\$96.60	\$32.20	\$96.60	\$32.20	\$96.60
MDB Nylon 10" Truck Wash Brush	1	6/box	\$63.78	\$63.78	\$63.78	\$63.78	\$63.78	\$63.78
Red Non-Sequential Numbered Tamper Seals	1	500/box	\$102.50	\$102.50	\$102.50	\$102.50	\$102.50	\$102.50
Rubbermaid Parts/Cart Wheels/ Bucket Wheels	2	12/loose	\$96.24	\$192.48	\$96.48	\$192.48	\$96.48	\$192.48
Scott Toilet Paper	1100	80 Rolls/box *sub VonDrehle	\$39.40	\$43,340.00	\$39.40	\$43,340.00	\$39.40	\$43,340.00
Scott C-Fold Paper Towels	450	25pk of 175twl/case* sub VonDrehle	\$21.10	\$9,495.00	\$21.10	\$9,495.00	\$21.10	\$9,495.00
Kimberly Clark Wype-All	20	18pk of 56twl/case *sub VonDrehle	\$44.90	\$898.00	\$44.90	\$898.00	\$44.90	\$898.00

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: Sept 26, 2016
 Bid/RFP #:16-51 Provide Chem/Supplies

Scott Jumbo Roll Toilet Paper	15	6 X 200/case	\$45.59	\$683.85	\$45.59	\$683.85	\$45.59	\$683.85	
Scott Toilet Paper Dispenser Metal	1	1 loose as needed	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Scott C-Fold Paper Towel Dispenser Plastic	2	1 loose as needed	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Tuffskin Liners Coreless Roll Bags .62 ml	200	40 X 48 250/case	\$22.22	\$4,400.00	\$22.22	\$4,400.00	\$22.22	\$4,400.00	
Essential Industries Drain Opener Non-Acid	4	12 qt./case	\$58.10	\$232.40	\$58.10	\$232.40	\$58.10	\$232.40	\$232.40
Plexi Shine Aerosol Glass Cleaner	8	12 /case	\$59.95	\$479.60	\$59.95	\$479.60	\$59.95	\$479.60	\$479.60
Sani Kleen Aerosol Germicide	8	12 /case	\$59.95	\$479.60	\$59.95	\$479.60	\$59.95	\$479.60	\$479.60
Total Care Aerosol Toilet Bowl Cleaner (not an aerosol)	10	12 qt/case	\$49.80	\$498.00	\$49.80	\$498.00	\$49.80	\$498.00	\$498.00
Buckeye Blue Multi-Purpose Floor Soap, "concentrate" to be used in a dilution system	8	5 gal. box	\$69.75	\$558.00	\$69.75	\$558.00	\$69.75	\$558.00	\$558.00
TOTAL			\$4,012.80	\$124,333.97	\$4,013.04	\$124,333.97	\$4,013.04	\$124,333.97	\$
EXEPTIONS:	none								
What is the number of days after placing order that product will be delivered to dock:	no response								
Sent to 12 bidders. Responses from: 5									
			Base Year	\$124,333.97					
			Option Year 2	\$124,333.97					

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: Sept 26, 2016
Bid/RFP #:16-51 Provide Chem/Supplies

			Option Year 3	\$124,333.97					
			Total	\$373,001.91					

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: Sept 26, 2016
 Bid/RFP #:16-51 Provide Chem/Supplies

Vendor:	Interboro Packaging								
City/State:	Montgomery NY								
Original Signature	yes								
Mandatory Pages	yes								
ITEM	Approx Qty annually	Size Pkg.	UNIT COST Base Year 12/1/16-11/30/17	TOTAL COST Base Year 12/1/16-11/30/17	UNIT COST Year 2 (optional) 12/1/17-11/30/18	TOTAL COST Year 2 (optional) 12/1/17-11/30/18	UNIT COST Year 3 (optional) 12/1/18-11/30/19	TOTAL COST Year 3 (optional) 12/1/18-11/30/19	
Germisept EPA Registered	400	Case	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
Kleen & Klear	100	Case	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
Clear Printed Chemical Labeled Quart Bottles	1/ea	50/box ea chem	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
Windex Wipes Canister	10	Canister 9/case	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
Clorox Wipe Canister	16	Canister 4/pkg	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
Toilet Bowl Brushes	60	Each	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
Non Para Urinal Block w/Screen	8	12/case	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
La Grosse Brothers Plunger w/handle	6	6/case	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
Milwaukee Dustless Poly Multi Level Scrub Brush	4	10 Inch 12/case	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
Scrub Brush w/24" Handle White	12	12/case	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
Gojo Moisturizing Hand Cream Refill	3	800 ml 12/case	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
Gojo Instant Hand Sanitizer Refill	20	800 ml 12/case	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
Gojo 800 ml Dispensers	6	12/case	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: Sept 26, 2016
 Bid/RFP #:16-51 Provide Chem/Supplies

Gojo Orange Hand Cleaner	2	4.5 lb Tub 6/case	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Foaming Hand Antibacterial Skin Cleanser Refill	45	Foaming Hand Antibacterial Skin Cleanser Refill	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
800 ml Dispensers	6	12/case	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Pour Bottle top	1	48/box	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Spray Trigger for Quart Bottles	4	12/box	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Tampax Tampons	8	200/case	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Feminine Guards	16	250/case	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Avery Dennison Manilla Ship Tags Strung Size #4	4	500/box	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Reloc Reclosable Poly Bag	10	6 X 9 1000/case	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Reloc Reclosable Poly Bag	6	12 X 12 1000/case	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Garbage Bags Large Clear Flat Property Bags	30	250/case	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Garbage Bags Medium Clear Flat	20	250/case	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Garbage Bags Large Green Flat	45	250/case	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Garbage Bags Medium Green Flat	25	250/case	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Jaguar Red Bio Bag	1	24 X 23 250/case	\$7.48	\$7.48	\$8.08	\$8.08	\$8.73	\$8.73
Jaguar Red Bio Bag	2	30 X 36 250/case	\$18.82	\$37.64	\$20.33	\$40.66	\$21.96	\$43.92

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: Sept 26, 2016
Bid/RFP #:16-51 Provide Chem/Supplies

Jaguar Red Bio Bag	3	40 X 46 250/case	\$28.82	\$86.46	\$31.13	\$93.39	\$33.62	\$100.86
Rough Floor Mop Heads	8	12/box	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Seco Rubbermaid Gripper wet Mop Fiberglass handle	15	12/box	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Tampico Black push Broom Head	7	18 inch 12/box	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Fiberglass Broom Handle	15	12/box	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Unison Angle Poly Broom	8	1 loose	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Corn Broom	2	1 loose	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Rubbermaid Security Bucket w/Basket Wringer	3	1/box	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Rubbermaid Bucket w/ Wringer	1	1 set	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Heavy Duty Dust Pan Plastic	2	12/case	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Heavy Duty Cleaning Caddy	1	6/case	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Rubbermaid Soft Wastebasket 8-10 Qt	4	12/case	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Rubbermaid Red Bio Step-On Container	1	1/box	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Rubbermaid Roughneck Totes Bronze	50	14 Gallon 1 loose	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Rubbermaid Trash Cans	3	40 Gallon 1 loose	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Rubbermaid Trash Cans	2	32 Gallon 1 loose	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: Sept 26, 2016
Bid/RFP #:16-51 Provide Chem/Supplies

Rubbermaid Recycle Waste Can	4	14 Gallon 1 loose	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Rubbermaid 4 wheel Flat Bed Cart	1	1 loose	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Squeegee w/Metal Handle	4	18 inch 1 loose	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Squeegee w/Metal Handle	2	14 inch 1 loose	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Squeegee w/Plastic Handle	2	12 inch 1 loose	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Squeegee w/Plastic Handle	2	6 inch 1 loose	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Eye Wash Station solution	3	4/box	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
MDB Nylon 10" Truck Wash Brush	1	6/box	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Red Non-Sequential Numbered Tamper Seals	1	500/box	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Rubbermaid Parts/Cart Wheels/ Bucket Wheels	2	12/loose	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Scott Toilet Paper	1100	80 Rolls/box	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Scott C-Fold Paper Towels	450	25pk of 175twl/case	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Kimberly Clark Wype-All	20	18pk of 56twl/case	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Scott Jumbo Roll Toilet Paper	15	6 X 200/case	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Scott Toilet Paper Dispenser Metal	1	1 loose as needed	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: Sept 26, 2016
 Bid/RFP #:16-51 Provide Chem/Supplies

Scott C-Fold Paper Towel Dispenser Plastic	2	1 loose as needed	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Tuffskin Liners Coreless Roll Bags .62 ml	200	40 X 48 250/case	\$19.34	\$3,868.00	\$20.89	\$4,178.00	\$22.56	\$4,512.00
Essential Industries Drain Opener Non-Acid	4	12 qt./case	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Plexi Shine Aerosol Glass Cleaner	8	12 /case	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Sani Kleen Aerosol Germicide	8	12 /case	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Total Care Aerosol Toilet Bowl Cleaner	10	12 qt/case	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Buckeye Blue Multi-Purpose Floor Soap	8	5 gal. box	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
TOTAL			\$74.46	\$3,999.58	\$80.43	\$4,320.13	\$86.87	\$4,665.51
EXEPTIONS:	\$500.00 min order to qualify for free shipping							
What is the number of days after placing order that product will be delivered to dock:	5 - 7							
Sent to bidders. Responses from:								
			Base Year	\$3,999.58				
			Option Year 2	\$4,320.13				
			Option Year 3	\$4,665.51				
			Total	\$12,985.22				