

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 2/20/19 2:00PM
Bid#:19-04 Hygiene Products

Vendor:	Amercare Products Inc				Bob Barker				Charm-Tex				Phoenix Supply			
City/State:	Woodinville WA				Fuquay Varina NC				Brooklyn NY				Bloomington MN			
Original Signature	yes				yes				yes				yes			
Mandatory Pages	yes				yes				yes				yes			
Samples	yes				yes				yes				yes			
Item Description & Unit of measur	Year 1: 4/1/19- 11/30/19	Year 2: 12/1/19- 11/30/20	Year 3, optional, 12/1/20- 11/30/21	Year 4, optional, 12/1/21- 11/30/22	Year 1: 4/1/19- 11/30/19	Year 2: 12/1/19- 11/30/20	Year 3, optional, 12/1/20- 11/30/21	Year 4, optional, 12/1/21- 11/30/22	Year 1: 4/1/19- 11/30/19	Year 2: 12/1/19- 11/30/20	Year 3, optional, 12/1/20- 11/30/21	Year 4, optional, 12/1/21- 11/30/22	Year 1: 4/1/19- 11/30/19	Year 2: 12/1/19- 11/30/20	Year 3, optional, 12/1/20- 11/30/21	Year 4, optional, 12/1/21- 11/30/22
5-1/2" toothbrush, ivory color, no cap Bulk pack of 144 pcs	\$7.20	\$7.40	\$7.60	\$7.80	\$6.05	\$6.05	\$6.35	\$6.54	\$6.54	\$6.54	\$6.54	\$6.54	\$6.86	\$7.07	\$7.28	\$7.50
.85 oz Nature Mint flouride toothpaste Bulk pack of 144 pcs	\$16.50	\$16.50	\$16.90	\$17.50	\$21.11	\$21.11	\$22.17	\$22.83	\$15.90	\$15.90	\$15.90	\$15.90	\$20.25	\$20.85	\$21.48	\$22.12
Clear maximum single blade security razors w/removable cap Bulk pack of 1000 razors	\$58.00	\$58.00	\$59.50	\$59.50	\$50.91	\$50.91	\$53.46	\$55.06	\$54.90	\$54.90	\$54.90	\$54.90	\$58.85	\$60.62	\$62.44	\$64.32
Conditioning shampoo, .75 oz-1 oz, plastic container and cap only Bulk pack of 288 pcs	\$57.60	\$57.60	\$57.60	\$57.60	\$70.84	\$70.84	\$74.38	\$76.61	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>	\$42.85	\$44.12	\$45.44	\$46.80
1/2 oz antibacterial, wrapped deodorant soap Bulk pack of 1000 pcs	\$49.50	\$49.50	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.39	\$49.39	\$51.86	\$53.42	\$38.90	\$38.90	\$38.90	\$38.90	\$36.50	\$37.50	\$38.50	\$39.50
5" black plastic comb Bulk pack of 2160 pcs	\$43.20	\$43.20	\$45.00	\$45.50	\$40.02	\$40.02	\$42.02	\$43.28	\$37.90	\$37.90	\$37.90	\$37.90	\$34.25	\$35.30	\$36.35	\$37.50
8 oz FDA approved dishwasher safe orange flexible tumbler w/o handle Bulk pack of 48 pcs	\$14.88	\$14.88	\$14.88	\$14.88	\$52.89	\$52.89	\$55.53	\$57.20	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>	\$133.16	\$138.16	\$143.16	\$148.16
Total	\$246.88	\$247.08	\$251.43	\$252.73	\$291.21	\$291.21	\$305.77	\$314.94					\$332.72	\$343.62	\$354.65	\$365.90
For items not listed, bidder will offer a discount	8.00%	8.00%	8.00%	8.00%	3.00%	5.00%	5.00%	5.00%	10.00%	10.00%	10.00%	10.00%	10.00%	10.00%	10.00%	10.00%
Exeptions:	razor has orange handle w/clear panel & cap; cup is clear, not orange				conditioning shampoo is .65oz				-				shampoo is a 1oz product, Tumbler pricing is based on bulk pack of 72 pcs., and the 10% discount is off online/web prices.			
*note; lowest bid not accepted; product samples did not meet specs																