

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/12/18 2:00PM  
 Bid#:18-73 Sheriff Uniforms

<b>Vendor:</b>			<b>Bob Ridings</b>	<b>Prescott Bros</b>	<b>Napleton</b>	<b>Sunnyside Co</b>
City/State:			<b>Taylorville IL</b>	<b>Mendota IL</b>	<b>Villa Park IL</b>	<b>McHenry IL</b>
Original Signature			yes	yes	yes	yes
Mandatory Pages; Certification, References			yes	yes	yes	yes
	<u>CODE</u>		<u>PRICE</u>	<u>PRICE</u>	<u>PRICE</u>	<u>PRICE</u>
<b>2019 DODGE CHARGER PURSUIT (PPV) AWD</b>	<b>LDEE48 29A</b>		\$24,475.00	\$24,860.00	NO BID	\$24,055.00
5.7 LITER V8 ENGINE, 370 HP, 395 LB-FT. OF TORQUE						
3.07 REAR AXLE RATIO 230MM REAR AXLE						
<b>OPTIONS</b>						
FLEX FUEL VEHICLE – V6 ONLY 220MM REAR AXLE	XKN		n/a			n/a
220MM REAR AXLE	DR3		included	n/a		n/a
FULL SIZE SPARE TIRE	TBW		included	std		\$0.00
DELETE FULL SIZE SPART TIRE, TIRE SERVICE KIT PROVIDED	TBF		-\$89.00	-\$100.00		-\$89.00
FULL SIZE SPARE TIRE RELOCATION BRAK CET, MOVES TIRE FROM ANGLED POSITIONIN TRUNK TO HORIZONTAL POSITION OVER REAR AXLE HUMP	TBH		\$130.00	\$145.00		\$129.00
FULL WHEEL COVERS, RWD ONLY	W8A		\$40.00	n/a		n/a
FULL WHEEL COVERS, AWD ONLY	W8B		\$40.00	\$36.00		\$36.00
P245/55R18 BSW PERFORMANCE TIRES	TYL		\$160.00	\$160.00		\$160.00
HEAVY DUTY CLOTH BUCKET SEATS & CLOTH REAR BENCH (black) INCLUDES 6-WAY POWER DRIVER SEAT	C8		n/c	std		included
REPLACE CLOTH REAR BENCH SEAT W/VINYL REAR BENCH (BLACK)	X5		\$120.00	\$107.00		\$107.00
BLACK VINYL FLOOR COVERING	CKJ		n/c	\$		\$0.00
MINI FLOOR CONSOLE (HALF CONSOLE)	CM8		n/c	\$0.00		\$0.00
BLACK FULL FLOOR COVERING, REPLACES BLACK VINYL FLOOR COVERING, INCLUDED IN AEB STREET	CKD		n/c	\$111.00		\$111.00
FRONT OVERHEAD READING/MAPS LAMPS, MOUNTED BETWEEN SUN VISORS AND INCLU. IN AEB STREET APPEARANCE GROUP LAMPS WILL LIGHT WHEN A DOOR IS OPENED; INTERIOR SWITCH CAN BE SET SO THEY DO NOT	LBG		\$70.00	\$67.00		\$67.00
<b>FLEET SAFETY GROUP, BLIND SPOT &amp; CROSS PATH DETECTION, HEATED POWER MIRRORS</b>	<b>AWC</b>	Unofficial	\$312.00	\$312.00		\$312.00

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/12/18 2:00PM  
 Bid#:18-73 Sheriff Uniforms

<b>CONVENIENCE GROUP; 4-WAY POWER FRONT PASSENGER SEAT AND POWER ADJUSTABLE PEDALS</b>	AHM		\$450.00	\$427.00		\$427.00
<b>STREET APPEARANCE GROUP; FULL WHEEL COVERS OVER 18x7.5 BLACK STEEL WHEELS FRONT READING/MAP LAMPS. ILLUMINATED FRONT CUP HOLDERS, FULL LENGTH CIVILIAN FLOOR CONSOLE, DUAL REMOTE USB PORTS FOR CHARGING REAR CLIMATE CONTROL OUTLETS, FLOOR CARPETING W/FRONT &amp; REAR CARPETED FLOOR MATS, HEATED EXTERIOR MIRRORS</b>	AEB		\$340.00	\$334.00		\$334.00
<b>DELETE FLOOR CARPETING; DELETES FLOOR CARPETING, MATS AND FULL LENGTH CIVILIAN CONSOLE FROM AEB</b>	CK9		n/c	\$0.00		\$0.00
<b>MINI FLOOR CONSOLE WITH AEB; DELETES FULL LENGTH CIVILIAN FLOOR CONSOLE FROM AEB</b>	CM8		n/c	\$0.00		\$0.00
<b>DELETE 'DODGE' GRILLE EMBLEM</b>	MSY		n/c	\$0.00		\$0.00
<b>BASE ENGINE CONTROLLER LIMITS MAX SPEED TO 130 MPG</b>	NZE		n/c	\$0.00		\$0.00
<b>ENGINE BLOCK HEATER</b>	NHK		\$90.00	\$85.00		\$85.00
<b>MAX FLOW PACKAGE</b>	AYJ		\$135.00	\$134.00		\$134.00
<b>SECURITY ALARM</b>	LSA		\$135.00	\$134.00		\$134.00
<b>ADDITIONAL NON FLEET KEY-ALIKE FOBS, INCLUDES 4 ADDITIONAL KEY FOBS FOR A TOTAL OF 6</b>	GXQ		\$135.00	\$134.00		\$134.00
<b>ENTIRE FLEET KEY-ALIKE (FREQ 1) INCLUDES 6 ADDITIONAL KEY FOBS FOR A TOTAL OF 8</b>	GXF		\$135.00	\$125.00		\$125.00
<b>ENTIRE FLEET KEY-ALIKE (FREQ 2) INCLUDES 6 ADDITIONAL KEY FOBS FOR A TOTAL OF 8</b>	GXA		\$135.00	\$125.00		\$125.00
<b>ENTIRE FLEET KEY-ALIKE (FREQ 3) INCLUDES 6 ADDITIONAL KEY FOBS FOR A TOTAL OF 8</b>	GXE		\$135.00	\$125.00		\$125.00
<b>ENTIRE FLEET KEY-ALIKE (FREQ 4) INCLUDES 6 ADDITIONAL KEY FOBS FOR A TOTAL OF 8</b>	GSG		\$135.00	n/a		\$125.00
<b>HEATED EXTERIOR MIRRORS; ADDED TO STANDARD EQUIP. POWER MIRRORS</b>	GUK		\$55.00	\$53.00		\$0.00
<b>INTEGRATED DISPLAY PACKAGE, 12.1" INTEGRATED DISPLAY SCREEN, UCONNECT 3C, 8.4" AM/FM DISPLAY RADIO NAV CAPABLE; DELETES STANDARD EQUIP. MINI FLOOR CONSOLE</b>	AV2		\$2,000.00	\$1,994.00		\$1,994.00
<b>PATROL PACKAGE WIRING PREP; FRONT &amp; REAR WIRE HARNESS, POWER DISTRIBUTION CENTER</b>	AYW		\$1,050.00	\$1,024.00		\$1,024.00

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/12/18 2:00PM  
 Bid#: 18-73 Sheriff Uniforms

PATROL PACKAGE BASE PREP; FRONT & REAR WIRE HARNESS, POWER DISTRIBUTION CENTER, SIREN SPEAKER & BRACKET, TRUNK TRAY & COOLING FAN, INCLUDES TBH SPARE TIRE RELOCATION BRACKET, SPARE TIRE IS POSITIONED HORIZONTALLY UNDER THE TRUNK TRAY	AYE		\$1,800.00	\$1,780.00		\$1,780.00
DEACTIVATE REAR DOOR INTERIOR HANLDES & WINDOW SWITCHES, BAGGED PARTS KIT TO REACTIVATE REAR DOOR INTERIOR HANDLES & WINDOW SWITCHES NOT INCLUDED; BUT CAN BE ORDERED AS A SERVICE KIT; ADDITIONAL COST	CW6		\$70.00	\$67.00		\$67.00
EQUIPMENT MOUNTING BRACKET; MOUNTED OVER STANDARD EQUIPMENT MINI FLOOR CONSOLE	XFX		n/c	\$0.00		\$0.00
HAVIS POLICE FLOOR CONSOLE; NOT AVAILABLE WITH AV2 INTEGRATED DISPLAY PKG	CUG		\$425.00	\$414.00		\$414.00
STEEL SEAT BACK PANEL INSERTS	CBT		\$125.00	\$120.00		\$120.00
DRIVER SIDE BALLISTIC DOOR PANEL	XDV		\$2,200.00	\$2,092.00		\$2,092.00
PASSENGER SIDE BALLISTIC DOOR PANEL	XDG		\$2,200.00	\$2,092.00		\$2,092.00
LEFT HALOGEN SPOT LAMP, BLACK HOUSING	LNF		\$200.00	\$187.00		\$187.00
LEFT LED SPOT LAMP, BLACK HOUSING	LNX		\$325.00	\$134.00		\$134.00
HOUSINGS	LNA		\$400.00	\$187.00		\$187.00
LEFT & RIGHT LED SPOT LAMPS, BLACK HOUSINGS	LNX		\$650.00	\$134.00		\$134.00
WHITE GRAPHICS WRAP; FRONT DOORS	M2B		\$450.00	\$423.00		\$423.00
WHITE GRAPHICS WRAP; ALL FOUR DOORS	M2C		\$850.00	\$841.00		\$841.00
WHITE GRAPHICS WRAP; ENGINE HOOD	M3F		\$250.00	\$231.00		\$231.00
WHITE GRAPHICS WRAP; ROOF	M3G		\$250.00	\$240.00		\$240.00
WHITE GRAPHICS WRAP; TRUNK LID	M3H		\$160.00	\$156.00		\$156.00
BLACK INTERIOR FABRIC	X9		std	\$0.00		\$0.00
BRIGHT WHITE CLEARCOAT	PW7		n/c	\$0.00		\$0.00
PITCH BLACK	PX8		n/c	\$0.00		\$0.00
BRIGHT SILVER METALLIC CLEARCOAT	PS2		n/c	\$0.00		\$0.00
GRANITE CRYSTAL METALLIC PEARLCOAT	PAU		n/c	\$0.00		\$0.00
MAXIMUM STEEL METALLIC CLEARCOAT	PAR		n/c	\$0.00		\$0.00
DESTROYER GREY CLEARCOAT	PDN		n/c	\$0.00		\$0.00
OCTANE RED PEARLCOAT	PRV		n/c	\$0.00		\$0.00
TORRED CLEARCOAT	PR3		n/c	\$0.00		\$0.00
INDIGO BLUE	PBM		\$475.00	\$0.00		\$0.00
ELECTRIC BLUE PEARLCOAT	PB5		\$475.00	\$445.00		\$445.00
RANGER CLEARCOAT	P82		\$475.00	\$445.00		\$445.00
MICHIGAN STATE POLICE BLUE	P79		\$475.00	\$445.00		\$445.00
MIDNIGHT BLUE PEARLCOAT	PB8		\$475.00	\$445.00		\$445.00

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/12/18 2:00PM  
 Bid#:18-73 Sheriff Uniforms

SHERIFFS TAN	P76		\$475.00	\$445.00		\$445.00
WHITE GOLD CLEARCOAT	PWL		\$475.00	\$445.00		\$445.00
<b>2019 DODGE DURANGO PURSUIT AWD - BASE VEHICLE</b>	<b>WDEE75 / 22Z</b>		\$31,325.00	\$31,471.00	\$31,243.00	\$30,666.00
5.7L V8 HEMI MDS VVT ENGINE (EZH)						
8-SPD AUTO 8HP70 TRANS (BUY) (DFD)						
<b>OPTIONS</b>						
3.6L V6 24V VVT ENGINE UPG I W/ESS (ERC), 8-SPD AUTO 850RE TRANS (MAKE) (DFT)	2BZ		-\$2,400.00	-\$2,376.00	-\$2,466.00	-\$2,036.00
BLIND SPOT AND CROSS PATH DETECTION	XAN		\$360.00	\$352.00	\$352.00	\$352.00
DAYTIME RUNNING HEADLAMPS, LOW BEAM	LM1		\$40.00	\$36.00	\$36.00	\$36.00
ENGINE BLOCK HEATER	NHK		\$90.00	\$85.00	\$85.00	\$85.00
SINGLE DISC REMOTE CD PLAYER	RH1		\$450.00	\$441.00	\$441.00	\$441.00
SIRIUS XM SATELLITE RADIO	RSD		\$175.00	\$174.00	\$174.00	\$174.00
SKID PLATE GROUP	ADL		\$275.00	\$263.00	\$263.00	\$263.00
TRAILER TOW GROUP IV	AHX		\$795.00	\$752.00	\$752.00	\$752.00
CLOTH LOW-BACK BUCKET SEATS	H7X9		std	\$0.00	n/c	included
BILLET CLEAR COAT	PSC		n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00
DB BLACK CLEAR COAT	PXJ		n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00
DESTROYER GREY CLEAR COAT	PDN		n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00
GRANITE CLEAR COAT	PAU		n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00
REACTOR BLUE PEARL COAT	PBF		n/c	n/a	n/c	n/a
REDLINE 2 COAT PEARL	PRM		n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00
VICE WHITE; IVORY 3 COAT	PWD		\$575.00	\$530.00	\$530.00	\$530.00
WHITE KNUCKLE CLEAR COAT	PW7		n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00
<b>2019 DODGE RAM 1500 PICKUP SSV, 5'-7" BED - BASE VEHICLE</b>	<b>DS6T98 / 25D</b>		\$23,985.00	\$24,121.00	\$23,901.00	\$23,316.00
5.7L V8 HEMI MDS VVT, 395 HP, 410 LB-FT OF TORQUE, 6-SPEED AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION (65RFE)						
ELECTRONIC STABILITY CONTROL, AIR CONDITIONING, POWER WINDOWS-LOCKS-MIRRORS, CRUISE CONTROL						
PART TIME FOUR WHEEL DRIVE W/ELECTRONIC TRANSFER CASE & AUTO LOCKING HUBS, 3.55 REAR AXLE RATIO, GVWR: 6,800LBS, 4-WHEEL ABS & TRACTION FOUR KEY FOBS, BLACK VINYL FLOOR COVERING, SPRAY-IN BED LINER, CLASS IV HITCH RECEIVER, UPFITTER ELECTRONIC MODULE, REAR VIEW CAMERA, FACTORY DEST. CHG						
<b>OPTIONS</b>						

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/12/18 2:00PM  
 Bid#:18-73 Sheriff Uniforms

3.92 REAR AXLE RATIO	DMH		\$90.00	\$86.00	\$86.00	\$86.00
ANTI-SPIN DIFFERENTIAL REAR AXLE	DSA		\$475.00	\$450.00	\$450.00	\$450.00
WHEELS: 17" X 7" STEEL	WFP		std	std	std	included
TIRES: P265/70R17 BSW AS	TTM		std	std	std	included
TIRES: LT265/70R17E OWL ON/OFF ROAD	TXN		\$235.00	\$	n/a	n/a
LOCKING LUG NUTS	JJC		\$60.00	\$55.00	\$55.00	\$55.00
CLOTH FRONT BUCKET/VINYL REAR SEAT, 40/40 BUCKET SEATS, NO CENTER CONSOLE. SPACE BETWEEN BUCKET SEATS IS BARE PAINTED METAL FLOOR W/EXPOSED WIRING HARNESES AND ELECTRICAL COMPONENTS	D7		std	\$41.00	std	n/a
CLOTH FRONT BENCH/VINYL REAR SEAT, 40/20/40 SPLIT BENCH SEAT W/ARMREST W/3 CUP HOLDERS, CENTER SEAT CUSHION STORAGE, POWER 10-WAY DRIVER SEAT, POWER LUMBAR ADJUST, FOLDING VINYL REAR SEAT 115V AUXILIARY POWER OUTLET	D7		\$45.00	\$41.00	\$41.00	\$41.00
CARPET FLOOR COVERING	CKE		\$100.00	\$100.00	\$100.00	\$100.00
RADIO: UCONNECT 3.0	RA1		std	std	std	included
SIRIUS XM SATELLITE RADIO	RSD		\$190.00	\$177.00	\$177.00	\$177.00
RADIO: UCONNECT 5.0, 5.0" TOUCHSCREEN DISPLAY, GPS ANTENNA INPUT, INTEGRATED VOICE COMMAND W/BLEETOOTH HANDS-FREE, MEDIA HUB (USG, AUX), REAR VIEW MIRROR W/MICROPHONE, CHARGE-ONLY REMOTE USB PORT, TEMP. & COMPASS READINGS, SIRIUS XM SATELLITE RADIO	RA2		\$650.00	\$632.00	\$632.00	\$632.00
MONOTONE PAINT	APA		std	std	std	included
PARKVIEW REAR BACK-UP CAMERA	XAC		std	\$	std	included
32 GALLON FUEL TANK	NFX		\$425.00	\$405.00	\$405.00	\$405.00
BUMPERS, BRIGHT GRILLE, WHEELS 17"X7" ALUMINUM, GVWR 6,900LBS	AED		\$650.00	\$632.00	\$632.00	\$632.00
ENGINE BLOCK HEATER	NHK		\$90.00	\$86.00	\$86.00	\$86.00
LOW BEAM DAYTIME RUNNING HEADLAMPS	LM1		\$40.00	\$36.00	\$36.00	\$36.00
HIGH BEARM DAYTIME RUNNING HEADLAMPS	LMK		\$40.00	\$36.00	\$36.00	\$36.00
POWER ADJUSTABLE PEDALS	XAP		\$120.00	\$114.00	\$114.00	\$114.00
PROTECTION GROUP; FRONT SUSPENSION SKID PLATE, TRANSFER CASE SKID PLATE SHIELD, TOW HOOKS	ADB		\$275.00	\$359.00	\$268.00	\$359.00
SUPPLEMENTAL TURN SIGNALS, MIRROR BODY COURTESY LAMP	GPG		\$170.00	\$164.00	\$164.00	\$164.00

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/12/18 2:00PM  
 Bid#:18-73 Sheriff Uniforms

RAMBOX CARGO MGMT. SYSTEM, LED BED LIGHTING, RAMBOX REMOTE KEYLESS ENTRY, FOUR ADJUSTABLE CARGO TIE-DOWN HOOKS, CARGO BED DIVIDER/EXTENDER	XB9		\$1,200.00	\$1,178.00	\$1,178.00	\$1,178.00
REAR WINDOW DEFROSTER	GFA		\$185.00	\$177.00	\$177.00	\$177.00
REMOTE START & SECURITY ALARM GROUP, REMOTE START, SECURITY ALARM	XHC		\$375.00	\$359.00	\$359.00	\$359.00
TRAILER BRAKE CONTROL	CS7		\$275.00	\$268.00	\$268.00	\$268.00
TRI-FOLD TONNEAU COVER	XF8		\$550.00	\$541.00	\$541.00	\$541.00
DELETE STANDARD EQUIP. CLASS IV RECEIVER HITCH	XM9		-\$75.00	-\$91.00	-\$91.00	\$91.00
DELETE STANDARD EQUIP. SPRAY-IN BEDLINER			-\$175.00	-\$182.00	-\$182.00	-\$182.00
DIESEL GRAY/BLACK	X8		std	n/a	std	included
BRIGHT WHITE CLEARCOAT	PW7		n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00
BRILLIANT BLACK CRYSTAL PEARLCOAT	PXR		\$190.00	\$182.00	\$182.00	\$182.00
BRIGHT SILVER METALLIC CLEARCOAT	PS2		\$190.00	\$182.00	\$182.00	\$182.00
GRANITE CRYSTAL METALLIC CLEARCOAT	PAU		\$190.00	\$182.00	\$182.00	\$182.00
MAXIMUM STEEL METALLIC CLEARCOAT	PAR		\$190.00	\$182.00	\$182.00	\$182.00
BLUE STREAK PEARLCOAT	PCL		\$100.00	\$91.00	\$91.00	\$91.00
TRUE BLUE PEARLCOAT	PBU		\$100.00	\$91.00	\$91.00	\$91.00
FLAME RED CLEARCOAT	PR4		n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00
DELMONICO RED PEARLCOAT	PRV		\$100.00	\$91.00	\$91.00	\$91.00
<b>2019 DODGE PROMASTER 1500 CARGO VAN, 118" WB, LOW ROOF - BASE VEHICLE</b>	<b>VF1L11 / 21A</b>		NO BID	\$20,818.00	NO BID	NO BID
50 STATE EMISSIONS, 3.6L GAS V6 24V VVT						
TRANSMISSION; 6-SPEED AUTOMATIC 62TE						
3.86 AXLE RATION GVWR: 8,550 LBS						
<b>OPTIONS</b>						
UPGRADE BASE VAN TO 1500 136" WB, LOW ROOF, OTHER SPECS SAME AS BASE VAN	VF1L12 / 21A			\$22,487.00		
UPGRADE BASE VAN TO 1500 136" WB, HIGH ROOF, OTHER SPECS SAME AS BASE VAN	VF1L13 / 21A			\$23,021.00		
UPGRADE BASE VAN TO 2500 136" WB, HIGH ROOF, GVWR: 8,900 LBS, OTHER SPECS SAME AS BASE VAN	VF2L13 / 21A			\$23,411.00		
UPGRADE BASE VAN TO 2500 159" WB, HIGH ROOF, GVWR: 8,900 LBS, OTHER SPECS SAME AS BASE VAN	VF2L16 / 21A			\$25.00		
16" X 6.0" STEEL WHEELS	WCS			std		
LT225/75R16E BSW ALL SEASON TIRES	TWA			std		
LT225/75R16C BSW ALL SEASON TIRES	TU5	Unofficial	Results	\$223.00		

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/12/18 2:00PM  
 Bid#:18-73 Sheriff Uniforms

WHEEL CENTER CAP DELETE	WH8			\$0.00		
16" WHEEL COVERS	W6A			\$174.00		
16" X 6.0" WHITE PAINTED STEEL WHEELS, DELETES WHEEL CENTER CAPS	WDW			\$89.00		
SPARE TIRE DELETE, INCLUDES XAH TIRE SEALAND & AIR COMPRESSOR	TBF			-\$27.00		
TIRE SEALANT & AIR COMPRESSOR	XAH			\$85.00		
CLOTH BUCKET SEATS	A7			\$0.00		
VINYL BUCKET SEATS	B7			\$89.00		
DRIVER 6-WAY ADJUSTABLE LUMBAR SEATS; REQUIRES CAA OR CD9	CDL			\$174.00		
DRIVER/PASSENGER 6-WAY ADJUSTABLE LUMBAR SEATS, NOT AVAILABLE W/CAA OR CD9	CDU			\$218.00		
HEATED DRIVER SEAT, REQUIRES CDI OR CDU	CMB			\$174.00		
HEATED PASSENGER SEAT, REQUIRES CDU & CMB	CMC			\$129.00		
PASSENGER SEAT DELETE, DEACTIVATE PASSENGER AIR BAG, DELETE SEAT BELT MOUNT	CD9			-\$267.00		
PASSENGER DOUBLE SEAT	CAA			\$352 (L11)		
FRONT SLUSH MATS	CCK			\$134.00		
RADIO: UCONNECT 3 W/5" TOUCH SCREEN, INTEGRATED VOICE COMMAND W/BLEETOOTH, 4 SPEAKERS, GPS ANTENNA INPUT, MEDIA INPUT HUB, STEERING WHEEL MOUNTED AUDIO CONTROLS	UAA			std		
RADIO: UCONNECT 3 NAV W/5" TOUCH SCREEN, INTEGRATED VOICE COMMAND W/BLEETOOTH, 4 SPEAKERS, GPS ANTENNA INPUT, MEDIA INPUT HUB, STEERING WHEEL MOUNTED AUDIO CONTROLS, VOICE ACTIVATED NAVIGATION	UAB			\$441.00		
SIRIUS XM SATELLITE RADIO; ONE YEAR	RSD			\$174.00		
ELECTRONIC VEHICLE TRACKING	AES			-		
CARGO AREA FLOOR MAT	CKL			\$294.00		
CARGO AREA LED LIGHTING	LCP			\$254.00		
CARGO PARTITION	CWC			\$352.00		
CARTO PARTITION W/SLIDING WINDOW	XJ1			\$441.00		
REAR ASSIST HANDLES	CSR			\$134.00		
REAR HEATER - A/C PREP PKG	HDG			\$129.00		
SIDE WALL PANELING; LOWER	CMG			\$174.00		
SIDE WALL PANELING; UPPER & LOWER	CTE			\$263.00		

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/12/18 2:00PM  
 Bid#:18-73 Sheriff Uniforms

SPARY-ON FLOOR LINER	XMF			\$761.00		
WOOD FLOOR	CME			\$396.00		
MONOTONE PAINT	APA			\$0.00		
TWO ADDITIONAL KEY FOBS, TOTAL OF 4	GXK			\$111.00		
12V REAR AUXILIARY POWER OUTLET	JKP			\$40.00		
220 AMP ALTERNATOR	BAJ			\$263.00		
AIR CONDITIONING DELETE	HCD			-\$165.00		
AUXILIARY BATTERY PREP	BC1			std		
AUXILIARY SWITCHES	LHL			\$85.00		
DAYTIME RUNNING HEADLAMPS	LMK			\$67.00		
DOT CERTIFIED ROADSIDE SAFETY KIT	ACL			\$174.00		
ENGINE BLOCK HEATER	NHK			\$85.00		
LEFT SLIDING CARGO DOOR, NO GLASS, NOT AVAILABLE ON VF1L11 1500 BASE VAN, 118" WB	GKE			\$530.00		
LEFT SLIDING CARGO DOOR, W/FIXED GLASS, NOT AVAILABLE ON VF1L11 1500 BASE VAN, 118" WB	GKD			\$619.00		
FIXED GLASS IN RIGHT SLIDING CARGO DOOR	GSK			\$174.00		
FIXED GLASS IN REAR CARGO DOORS	GLB			\$263.00		
GUARDS FOR REAR CARGO DOOR GLASS, REQUIRES GLB REAR CARGO DOOR GLASS, NOT AVAILABLE ON VF1L11 AND VF1L12 1500 LOW ROOF VANS	XGC			\$338.00		
REAR WINDOW DEFROSTER, REQUIRES GLB REAR CARGO DOOR FIXED GLASS	GFA			\$174.00		
INTERIOR CONVENIENCE GROUP, LOCKING GLOVE BOX SHELF ABOVE ROOF TRIM UNDERSEAT STORAGE TRAY, WINDSHIELD DOCUMENT HOLDER	AJV			\$307.00		
MUD FLAPS, FRONT & REAR	MEP			\$89.00		
SPLASH GUARDS, FRONT & REAR	MKN			\$191.00		
PARKSENSE REAR PARK ASSIST	XAA			\$263.00		
PARKVIEW REAR BACK-UP CAMERA	XAC			-		
POWER FOLDING/HEATED MIRRORS	GTR			\$218.00		
PREMIUM APPEARANCE GROUP, FOG LAMPS, CHROME GRILLE	ALU			\$352.00		
REAR BUMPER STEP EXTENSION, NOT AVAILABLE W/AHT TRAILER TOW GROUP	MDM			\$423.00		
SECURITY ALARM	LSA			\$218.00		
SPEED CONTROL	NHM			\$307.00		
TRAILER TOW GROUP, CLASS V RECEIVER HITCH, 7 & 4 PIN WIRING HARNESS, NOT AVAILABLE W/MDM STEP EXTENSION	AHT			\$521.00		



**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/12/18 2:00PM  
 Bid#:18-73 Sheriff Uniforms

WIDE POWER HEATED MIRRORS, 96" EXTENDED EXTERIOR MIRROR	GTB			\$174.00		
INTERIOR COLOR - BLACK	X9			\$0.00		
BRIGHT WHITE CLEARCOAT, WHITE KNUCKLE	PW7			\$0.00		
BLACK CLEARCOAT, PITCH BLACK	PX8			\$0.00		
BRIGHT SILVER METALLIC CLEARCOAT	PS2			\$178.00		
BROOM YELLOW	P67			\$0.00		
DEEP CHERRY RED CRYSTAL PEARLCOAT	PRP			\$178.00		
FLAME RED CLEARCOAT	PR4			\$0.00		
GRANITE CRYSTAL METALLIC CLEARCOAT	PAU			\$178.00		
SANDSTONE PEARLCOAT	PFS			n/a		
TRUE BLUE PEARLCOAT	PBU			n/a		
<b>2019 JEEP COMPASS SPORT FWD - BASE VEHICLE</b>	<b>MPTL74 28A</b>		<b>\$19,465.00</b>	<b>\$19,742.00</b>	<b>\$19,527.00</b>	<b>\$18,937.00</b>
2.4L I4 ZERO EVAP M-AIR ENGINE W/ESS (EDE)						
6-SPD AISIN F21-250 GEN 3 AUTO TRANS (DF7)						
<b>2019 JEEP COMPASS SPORT 4X4 - BASE VEHICLE</b>	<b>MPJL74 27A</b>		<b>\$20,865.00</b>	<b>\$21,099.00</b>	<b>\$20,884.00</b>	<b>\$20,294.00</b>
2.4L I4 ZERO EVAP M-AIR ENGINE W/ESS (EDE)						
9-SPD 9HP48 AUTO TRANSMISSION (DF5)						
<b>OPTIONS</b>						
COMPACT SPARE TIRE	TBC		\$325.00	\$314.00	\$223.00	\$314.00
SPORT APPEARANCE PLUS	AAK		\$950.00	\$905.00	\$814.00	\$905.00
TECH GROUP	AMV		\$650.00	\$632.00	\$632.00	\$632.00
MOPAR ELECT. VEHICLE TRACKING	XDJ		\$475.00	\$450.00	\$450.00	\$450.00
MOPOAR GRAPHICS PKG	ALB		\$475.00	\$450.00	\$450.00	\$450.00
MOPAR INTERIOR PREMIUM PKG; M/H DF7; N/A W/AD4; N/A W/ADE; N/A W/DE1	ACX		\$325.00	\$314.00	\$314.00	\$314.00
MOPAR INTERIOR PROTECTION PACKAGE; N/A W/ACX; N/A W/ADE	AD4		\$325.00	\$314.00	\$314.00	\$314.00
16X6.5 SILVER PAINTED ALUM WHEELS; INCLUDED W/AAK	WNF		\$475.00	\$450.00	\$450.00	\$450.00
PARKSENSE REAR PARK ASSIST SYSTEM; INCLUDED W/AMV	XAA		\$235.00	\$228.00	\$228.00	\$228.00
PWR 8WAY DR/MANUAL 6WAY PASS SEATS	JPR		\$325.00	\$314.00	\$314.00	\$314.00
CLOTH LOW-BACK BUCKET SEATS, (S)	A7X9		std	\$0.00	n/c	included
BILLET SILVER METALLIC CLEAR COAT	PSC		n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00
DIAMOND BLACK CRYSTAL P/C	PXJ		n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00
GRANITE CRYSTAL MET. CLEAR COAT	PAU		n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00
JAZZ BLUE PEARL COAT	PBX		n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/12/18 2:00PM  
 Bid#: 18-73 Sheriff Uniforms

LASER BLUE PEARL COAT	PBJ		n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00
OLIVE GREEN PEARL COAT	PFP		n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00
REDLINE PEARL COAT	PRM		n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00
SPITFIRE ORANGE CLEAR COAT	PF2		n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00
WHITE CLEAR COAT	PW3		n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00
<b>2019 JEEP COMPASS LATITUDE FWD - BASE VEHICLE</b>	<b>MPTM74</b>					
	<b>28J</b>			<b>\$20,995.00</b>	<b>\$21,286.00</b>	<b>\$21,071.00</b>
2.4L I4 ZERO EVAP M-AIR ENGINE W/ESS (EDE)						
6-SPD AISIN F21-250 GEN 3 AUTO TRANS (DF7)						
<b>2019 JEEP COMPASS LATITUDE 4X4 - BASE VEHICLE</b>	<b>MPJM74</b>					
	<b>27J</b>			<b>\$22,365.00</b>	<b>\$22,606.00</b>	<b>\$22,391.00</b>
2.4L I4 ZERO EVAP M-AIR ENGINE W/ESS (EDE)						
9-SPD 9HP48 AUTO TRANSMISSION (DF5)						
<b>OPTIONS:</b>						
17X7.0 POLISHED/GRANITE PKTS AL WHLS	WAD		\$575.00	\$541.00	\$541.00	\$541.00
18X7.0 POLISHED/BLK PKTS AL WHEELS	WPW		\$950.00	\$905.00	\$905.00	\$905.00
ADVANCED SAFETY GROUP; M/H AJB	ALP		\$1,585.00	\$723.00	n/a	\$723.00
BEATS PREMIUM AUDIO SYSTEM	RCV		\$775.00	\$723.00	\$723.00	\$723.00
COLD WEATHER GROUP	ADE		\$900.00	\$860.00	\$769.00	\$860.00
COMPACT SPARE TIRE	TBC		\$325.00	\$314.00	\$223.00	\$314.00
FULL SUNROOF, PWR FRT, FIXED REAR	GWJ		\$1,500.00	\$1,451.00	\$1,360.00	\$1,451.00
POPULAR EQUIPMENT GROUP	ANF		\$950.00	\$905.00	\$905.00	\$905.00
POWER LIFTGATE	JRC		\$650.00	\$632.00	\$541.00	\$632.00
PREMIUM LIGHTING GROUP	AD6		\$1,500.00	\$632.00	\$632.00	\$632.00
PWR 8WAY DR/MANUAL 6WAY PASS SEATS	JPR		\$325.00	\$314.00	\$314.00	\$314.00
SAFETY AND SECURITY GROUP; W/ADE AND DF7	AJB		\$1,650.00	\$814.00	*	\$814.00
UCONNECT 4C NAV WITH 8.4" DISPLAY; M/H ANF	UAQ		\$2,200.00	\$1,224.00	\$996.00	\$1,224.00
UCONNECT 4 NAV WITH 8.4" DISPLAY	UDQ		n/a	\$	n/a	n/a
MOPAR ELECT. VEHICLE TRACKING SYS	XDJ		\$475.00	\$450.00	\$450.00	\$450.00
MOPAR GRAPHICS PACKAGE	ALB		\$475.00	\$450.00	\$450.00	\$450.00
MOPAR INTERIOR PREMIUM PACKAGE; M/H DF7; N/A W/AD4; N/A W/ADE	ACX		\$325.00	\$314.00	\$314.00	\$314.00
MOPAR INTERIOR PROTECTION PACKAGE; N/A W/ACX; N/A W/ADE	AD4		\$325.00	\$314.00	\$314.00	\$314.00
PREMIUM CLOTH/VINYL BUCKET SEATS	G7X9		std	\$0.00	n/c	included
BILLET SILVER METALLIC CLEARCOAT	PSC		n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00
DIAMOND BLACK CRYSTAL P/C, M/H APA	PXJ		n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00
GRANITE CRYSTAL MET. CLEAR COAT	PAU		n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00
JAZZ BLUE PEARL COAT	PBX		n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/12/18 2:00PM  
 Bid#: 18-73 Sheriff Uniforms

LASER BLUE PEARL COAT	PBJ		n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00
OLIVE GREEN PEARL COAT	PFP		n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00
REDLINE PEARL COAT	PRM		n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00
WHITE CLEAR COAT	PW3		n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00
<b>2019 DODGE GRAND CARAVAN WAGON - BASE VEHICLE</b>				<b>\$21,765.00</b>	<b>\$22,008.00</b>	<b>\$21,789.00</b>
ENGINE: 3.6L V6 24 V VVT						
TRANSMISSION; 6-SPEED AUTOMATIC 62TE						
P225/65R17 BSW A/S TOURING TIRES						
BLACK PREMIUM CLOTH BUCKET SEATS						
<b>OPTIONS</b>						
2ND ROW STOW N GO BUCKET SEATS	CYC		\$1,275.00	\$1,242.00	\$1,242.00	\$1,242.00
WHITE KNUCKLE			n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00
BLACK ONYX			n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00
BILLET CLEARCOAT			n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00
<b>2019 DODGE RAM PROMASTER CITY TRADESMAN CARGO VAN (122.4 IN WB) - BASE VEHICLE</b>	<b>VMDL51 24C</b>		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	<b>\$18,726.00</b>
2.4L I4 MULTIAIR ENGINE (ED6)						
9-SPD 948TE FWD AUTO TRANS (MAKE) (DFH)						
<b>INCLUDES:</b>						
CARGO TIE DOWN LOOPS	CKT					included
CARGO VAN GROUP	AVM					included
DELETE 2ND ROW SIDE CURTAIN AIRBAGS	CJ8					included
DELETE REAR SEATING	CYX					included
LEFT SLIDING DOOR-NO GLASS	GKE					included
REAR DOORS - NO GLASS	MMC					included
RIGHT SLIDING DOOR-NO GLASS	GKA					included
SIDE SLIDING AND REAR DOORS SOLID	GC1					included
SUPP SIDE CURTAIN FRONT AIR BAGS	CJ4					included
<b>2019 DODGE RAM PROMASTER CITY TRADESMAN WAGON (122.4 IN WB) - BASE VEHICLE</b>	<b>VMDL51 24A</b>		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	<b>\$20,546.00</b>
2.4L I4 MULTIAIR ENGINE (ED6)						
9-SPD 948TE FWD AUTO TRANS (MAKE) (DFH)						
<b>OPTIONS FOR BOTH</b>						
16X6.5 BLACK STEEL WHEEL W/FULL CVR	WCS					\$174.00
DAYTIME RUNNING HEADLAMPS	LMK					\$67.00
DEEP TINT SUNSCREEN GLASS; W/24C M/H GC2 or GC3	GEG					\$267.00

Unofficial Results

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/12/18 2:00PM  
 Bid#:18-73 Sheriff Uniforms

FULL SIZE SPARE TIRE	TBB				\$223.00
PARKSENSE REAR PARK ASSIST SYSTEM	XAA				\$307.00
REAR WIPER/WASHER/DEFROSTER GROUP; M/H GEG, W/24C M/H GC2 or GC3	AMF				\$267.00
SIRIUSXM SATELLITE RADIO	RSD				\$174.00
SPARE TIRE & INFLATOR KIT GROUP	ACF				\$307.00
SPEED CONTROL	NHM				\$307.00
UCONNECT 3 NAV WITH 5" DISPLAY	UAB				\$467.00
2 ADDITIONAL KEY FOBS	XCH				\$111.00
CLOTH LOW-BACK BUCKET SEATS	B7X9				included
BLACK METALLIC	PXQ				\$178.00
BLUE NIGHT METALLIC	PBZ				\$178.00
BRIGHT RED	PRS				\$0.00
BRIGHT WHITE	PW7				\$0.00
BROOM YELLOW	P67				\$0.00
DEEP RED METALLIC	PRD				\$178.00
QUARTZ GREY METALLIC	PAJ				\$178.00
SILVER METALLIC	PAF				\$178.00
<b>OPTIONS</b>	<u>WAGON</u>	<u>CARGO VAN</u>			
CARGO PARTITION PACKAGE - SOLID, N/A W/AHA	N/A	AS1			\$356.00
CARGO PARTITION PACKAGE - WINDOW, N/A W/AS1	N/A	AHA			\$441.00
LT SLIDE DR W/VENTED GLASS & GRATE, INCLUDED W/GCY; M/H GC2; N/A W/AHA OR AS1; W/GC2 N/A W/GCY; W/GC2 N/A W/GKP	N/A	GKR			\$196.00
MOPAR CARGO AREA LIGHTING - LED	N/A	LCP			\$254.00
MOPAR DOT ROADSIDE SAFETY KIT	ACL	ACL			\$174.00
MOPAR FRONT & REAR SLUSH MATS, N/A W/CLE	CLF	N/A			\$134.00
MOPAR FRONT CARPET FLOOR MATS, N/A W/CLY	N/A	CLC			\$58.00
MOPAR FRONT SLUSH FLOOR MATS, N/A W/CLC	N/A	CLY			\$76.00
MOPAR FRT AND RR CARPET FLOOR MATS, N/A W/CLF	CLE	N/A			\$89.00
MOPAR REMOTE START SYSTEM	JJL	JJL			\$530.00
MOPAR ROOF RACK CROSSBARS (2) - ADJ., M/H MWE	MWF	MWF			\$231.00
MOPAR ROOF RACK SIDE RAILS, M/H MWF; N/A W/MWM	MWE	MWE			\$280.00
MOPAR ROOF RACK - THREE BAR UTILITY, N/A W/MWE; N/A W/MWF	MWM	MWM			\$530.00
MOPAR SPLASH GUARDS - VEHICLE SET	MKN	MKN			\$129.00
MOPAR TRAILER TOW GROUP	AHT	AHT			\$441.00
MOPAR VEHICLE TRACKING SYSTEM	XDJ	XDJ			n/a

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/12/18 2:00PM  
 Bid#:18-73 Sheriff Uniforms

REAR & SLIDING DOORS W/VENTED GLASS, ONLY 1: GCY OR GC2 OR GC3	N/A	GC3				\$441.00
REAR HINGED DOORS WITH GLASS, ONLY 1: GCY OR GC2 OR GC3; W/GKH N/A W/GKC; W/GKR N/A W/GCY; W/GKR N/A W/GKP	N/A	GC2				\$263.00
RT SLIDE DR W/VENTED GLASS & GRATE, INCLUDED W/GCY; M/H GC2; N/A W/AHA OR AS1	N/A	GKP				\$196.00
VAN RR & SIDE DR GLASS W/GRATE (US), M/H AVM; ONLY 1: GCY OR GC2 OR GC3	N/A	GCY				\$485.00
<b>2019 DODGE JOURNEY SE FWD - BASE VEHICLE</b>	<b>JCDH49 / 22F</b>		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2.4L I4 DOHC 16V DUAL VVT ENGINE (ED3)						
4-SPEED AUTOMATIC VLP TRANSMISSION (DFF)						
<b>2019 DODGE JOURNEY SE AWD - BASE VEHICLE</b>	<b>JCEH49 / 28F</b>		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
3.6L V6 24V VVT ENGINE (ERB)						
6-SPEED AUTOMATIC 62TE TRANSMISSION (DG2)						
<b><u>OPTIONS FOR BOTH</u></b>						
17X6.5 ALUMINUM WHEELS, N/A W/ADX	WFJ					
BLACKTOP PACKAGE, M/H PAU OR PRM OR PSC OR PWH OR PW3 OR PX8; M/H -X9; N/A W/AFE	ADX					
CONNECTIVITY GROUP	AAJ					
ENGINE BLOCK HEATER	NHK					
POPULAR EQUIPMENT GROUP	ALW					
RADIO 4.3S, FLEET ONLY; N/A W/AWX	REB					
UCONNECT VOICE COMMAND W/BLUETOOTH	RSP					
<b>MOPAR OPTIONS (FOR FWD)</b>						
MOPAR ALL WEATHER GROUP	AD9					
MOPAR CHROME ACCENT PKG	AFE					
MOPAR INTERIOR APPEARANCE GROUP	ACX					
MOPAR WI-FI	RTJ					
<b>MOPAR OPTIONS (FOR AWD)</b>						
MOPAR ALL WEATHER GROUP	AD9					
MOPAR CHROME APPEARANCE GROUP, M/H NEL	AEE					
MOPAR INTERIOR APPEARANCE GROUP	ACX					
MOPAR WI-FI	RTJ					
<b>FLEET ONLY (FOR FWD)</b>						
CARGO COMPARTMENT COVER	CSC					
COMFORT/CONVENIENCE GROUP, M/H *E7	AFB					

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/12/18 2:00PM  
 Bid#:18-73 Sheriff Uniforms

PARKSENSE REAR PARK ASSIST SYSTEM, INCLUDED W/AWX	XAA				
SAFE AND SOUND GROUP	AWX				
SECURITY GROUP	AJB				
<b>FLEET ONLY (FOR AWD)</b>					
COMFORT/CONVENIENCE GROUP	AFB				
PARKSENSE REAR PARK ASSIST SYSTEM, INCLUDED W/AWX	XAA				
SAFE AND SOUND GROUP	AWX				
SECURITY GROUP	AJB				
<b>ADDITIONAL OPTIONS FOR BOTH</b>					
17X6.5 ALUMINUM WHEELS, N/A W/ADX	WFJ				
BLACKTOP PACKAGE, M/H PAU OR PRM OR PSC OR PWH OR PW3 OR PX8; M/H -X9; N/A W/AEE	ADX				
CONNECTIVITY GROUP	AAJ				
ENGINE BLOCK HEATER	NHK				
FRT LICENSE PLATE ATTACHMENT SCREWS	MDA				
MANUF STATEMENT OF ORIGIN	YEP				
POPULAR EQUIPMENT GROUP	ALW				
RADIO 4.3S, FLEET ONLY; N/A W/AWX	REB				
UCONNECT VOICE COMMAND W/BLUETOOTH, FLEET ONLY					
PREMIUM CLOTH LOW-BACK BUCKET SEATS	RSP				
BILLET CLEAR COAT	E5X9/E7X9				
CONTUSION BLUE PEARL COAT	PSC				
GRANITE PEARL COAT	PBX				
PITCH BLACK CLEAR COAT	PAU				
<b>BID PAGE THIS PAGE IS MANDATORY</b>	PX8				
REDLINE 2 COAT PEARL	PRM				
VERDE OLIVA (OLIVE GREEN)	PFP				
VICE WHITE	PW3				
WHITE NOISE TRI-COAT	PWH				
<b>2019 DODGE JOURNEY SXT FWD - BASE VEHICLE</b>	<b>JCDE49 / 22E</b>	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2.4L I4 DOHC 16V DUAL VVT ENGINE (ED3)					
4-SPEED AUTOMATIC VLP TRANSMISSION (DFF)					
<b>OPTIONAL POWERTRAIN</b>					
3.6L V6 24V VVT ENGINE (ERB), 6-SPEED AUTOMATIC 62TE TRANSMISSION (DG2)	28E				

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/12/18 2:00PM  
 Bid#:18-73 Sheriff Uniforms

<b>2019 DODGE JOURNEY SXT AWD - BASE VEHICLE</b>	<b>JCEE49 / 28E</b>		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
3.6L V6 24V VVT ENGINE (ERB)						
6-SPEED AUTOMATIC 62TE TRANSMISSION (DG2)						
<b>OPTIONS FOR BOTH VEHICLES</b>						
19X7.0 PAINTED ALUMINUM WHEELS, N/A W/ADX	WPX					
BLACKTOP PACKAGE, M/H -X9; N/A W/AED, N/A with PFP	ADX					
CHROME APPEARANCE GROUP, M/H ANF; ; N/A W/ADX	AED					
CONNECTIVITY GROUP	AAJ					
ENGINE BLOCK HEATER	NJK					
FRT LICENSE PLATE ATTACHMENT SCREWS	MDA					
MANUF STATEMENT OF ORIGIN	YEP					
PREMIUM GROUP, includes package AFB content	ANF					
RADIO 4.3S, INCLUDED W/ANF; N/A W/AWX	REB					
UCONNECT 8.4 TOUCH SCREEN RADIO GRP, includes package AWX content	AMW					
UCONNECT VOICE COMMAND W/BLUETOOTH, FLEET ONLY	RSP					
MOPAR ALL WEATHER GROUP	AD9					
MOPAR CHROME ACCENT PACKAGE, N/A W/ERB	AFE					
MOPAR INTERIOR APPEARANCE GROUP	ACX					
MOPAR WI-FI	RTJ					
COMFORT/CONVENIENCE GROUP, N/A W/ANF	AFB					
PARKSENSE REAR PARK ASSIST SYSTEM, INCLUDED W/AWX	XAA					
SAFE AND SOUND GROUP, includes package AMW content	AWX					
SECURITY GROUP	AJB					
PREMIUM CLOTH LOW-BACK BUCKET SEATS	E5X9/E7X9					
BILLET CLEAR COAT	PSC					
BLOOD ORANGE CLEAR COAT	PF2					
BRUISER GREY CLEAR COAT	PSQ					
CONTUSION BLUE PEARL COAT M/H APA	PBX					
GRANITE PEARL COAT	PAU					
PITCH BLACK CLEAR COAT M/H APA	PX8					
REDLINE 2 COAT PEARL	PRM					
OLIVE GREEN M/H APA	PFP					
VICE WHITE	PW3					
WHITE NOISE TRI-COAT	PWH					
	<b>KLTM74</b>					
<b>2019 JEEP CHEROKEE LATITUDE FWD - BASE VEHICLE</b>	<b>2BJ</b>		<b>\$21,075.00</b>	<b>\$21,332.00</b>	<b>\$21,118.00</b>	<b>\$19,895.00</b>

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/12/18 2:00PM  
 Bid#:18-73 Sheriff Uniforms

2.4L I4 ZERO EVAP M-AIR ENGINE W/ESS (EDE)						
9-SPD 948TE FWD/AWD AUTO TRANS (MAKE (DFH))						
<b>2019 JEEP CHEROKEE LATITUDE 4X4 - BASE VEHICLE</b>	<b>KLJM74 2BJ</b>		<b>\$22,485.00</b>	<b>\$22,697.00</b>	<b>\$22,483.00</b>	<b>\$21,260.00</b>
2.4L I4 ZERO EVAP M-AIR ENGINE W/ESS (EDE)						
9-SPD 948TE FWD/AWD AUTO TRANS (MAKE (DFH))						
<b>UPGRADE: 3.2L V6 24V VVT ENGINE W/ESS (EHK), 9-SPD 948TE FWD/AWD AUTO TRANS (MAKE (DFH))</b>	<b>26J</b>		\$1,600.00	\$836.00	&	\$1,588.00
<b>OPTIONS FOR BOTH</b>						
17X7.0 PAINTED ALUMINUM WHEELS, INCLUDED W/ADC	WFM		\$675.00	\$0.00	n/c	\$450.00
COLD WEATHER GROUP	ADE		\$850.00	\$814.00	\$723.00	\$814.00
COMPACT SPARE TIRE	TBC		std	\$196.00	%	n/a
POPULAR APPEARANCE GROUP, Cherokee Latitude must have ADC Popular Appearance Group	ADC		\$675.00	\$632.00	\$632.00	\$632.00
SAFETYTEC	AC5		\$1,350.00	\$632.00	\$450.00	\$632.00
SIRIUS XM SATELLITE RADIO	RSD		\$200.00	\$196.00	\$196.00	\$196.00
MOPAR INTERIOR PROTECTION PACKAGE, N/A W/ADE, Includes all-weather mats for front and rear seats and Cargo tray that covers the rear cargo area	ACX		\$875.00	\$200.00	n/a	\$200.00
FULL SIZE SPARE TIRE; FLEET ONLY	TBB		\$100.00	\$91.00	#	\$91.00
MOBILE OFFICE GROUP; FLEET ONLY	AFT		\$575.00	\$537.00	\$537.00	\$537.00
SAFETY GROUP; FLEET ONLY	AJ1		\$245.00	\$228.00	\$228.00	\$228.00
CLOTH BUCKET SEATS	S5X9		std	\$0.00	n/c	included
BILLET SILVER METALLIC CLEAR COAT	PSC		n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00
BRIGHT WHITE CLEAR COAT	PW7		n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00
DIAMOND BLACK CRYSTAL P/C	PXJ		n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00
LIGHT BROWNSTONE PEARL COAT	PT6		n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00
OLIVE GREEN PEARL COAT	PFP		n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00
VELVET RED PEARL COAT	PRV		n/c	\$0.00	n/c	\$0.00
<b>EXCEPTIONS</b>			Included delivery to your locations and new Municipal Title & Lic processing Base prices include all standard package equipment & two keys	Ram Promaster City & Dodge Journey are not available yet; no pricing for 2019	* = MPJM74 \$814.00 MPTM74 \$723.00, & = KLJM74 w/26J ADD \$836.00 KLTM74 w/26J ADD \$2,236.00, % = ONLY available on KLTM74 \$196.00, # = KLTM74 \$268.00 KLJM74 \$91.00	*Deep tint sunscreen glass code GEG not available on Promaster City Cargo Van