

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

**Date:** October 26, 2018  
**Bid:** #18-79 Patrol & Court Security Body Armor

		VENDOR				VENDOR				
Vendor City/State		<b>Kiesler Police Supply Jeffersonville IN 47130</b>				<b>Streicher's Inc Butler WI</b>				
Original Signature		Yes				Yes				
References		Yes				Yes				
Certifications Page		Yes				Yes				
Samples provided by		United Shield				Safariland & Streicher's				
			<b>Year 1</b> 12/1/18-11/30/19	<b>Year 2</b> 12/1/19-11/30/20	<b>Year 3, optional</b> 12/1/20-11/30/21	<b>Year 4, optional</b> 12/1/20-11/30/22	<b>Year 1</b> 12/1/18-11/30/19	<b>Year 2</b> 12/1/19-11/30/20	<b>Year 3, optional</b> 12/1/20-11/30/21	<b>Year 4, optional</b> 12/1/20-11/30/22
<b>Description</b>	<b>Size</b>	<b>Male &amp; Female Body Armor</b>				<b>Male &amp; Female Body Armor</b>				
<b>MALE BODY ARMOR: Level II Body Armor</b> - Less than .90 lbs/sq ft. Less than .25 in thick and meet or exceed the minimum specifications for Level II Armor as detailed in NIJ Standard 0101.06 Section 2 – Body Armor Classification. Must meet all specifications as listed in Appendix A – Level II Body Armor	Sm	\$560.00	\$560.00	\$582.00	\$582.00	\$397.00 *Matrix Armor	\$410.00	No Bid	No bid	
	Med	\$560.00	\$560.00	\$582.00	\$582.00	\$397.00*	\$410.00			
	Lg	\$560.00	\$560.00	\$582.00	\$582.00	\$397.00*	\$410.00			
	XL	\$560.00	\$560.00	\$582.00	\$582.00	\$397.00 *Matrix Armor	\$410.00			
<b>FEMALE BODY ARMOR: Level II Body Armor</b> - Less than .90 lbs/sq ft. Less than .25 in thick and meet or exceed the minimum specifications for Level II Armor as detailed in NIJ Standard 0101.06 Section 2 – Body Armor Classification. Must meet all specifications as listed in Appendix A – Level II Body Armor	Sm	\$560.00	\$560.00	\$582.00	\$582.00	\$397.00*	\$410.00			
	Med	\$560.00	\$560.00	\$582.00	\$582.00	\$397.00*	\$410.00			
	Lg	\$560.00	\$560.00	\$582.00	\$582.00	\$397.00*	\$410.00			
	XL	\$560.00	\$560.00	\$582.00	\$582.00	\$397.00*	\$410.00			

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

**Date:** October 26, 2018  
**Bid:** #18-79 Patrol & Court Security Body Armor

<b>MALE BODY ARMOR:</b> <b>Level II Body Armor</b> - Less than .85 lbs/sq ft. Less than .25 in thick and meet or exceed the minimum specifications for Level II Armor as detailed in NIJ Standard 0101.06 Section 2 – Body Armor Classification. Must meet all specifications as listed in Appendix A – Level II Body Armor	Sm	\$560.00	\$560.00	\$582.00	\$582.00	\$495.00 *XT03 Armor	\$510.00	No bid	No bid
	Med	\$560.00	\$560.00	\$582.00	\$582.00	\$495.00*	\$510.00		
	Lg	\$560.00	\$560.00	\$582.00	\$582.00	\$495.00*	\$510.00		
	XL	\$560.00	\$560.00	\$582.00	\$582.00	\$495.00* *XT03 Armor	\$510.00		
<b>FEMALE BODY ARMOR:</b> <b>Level II Body Armor</b> - Less than .85 lbs/sq ft. Less than .25 in thick and meet or exceed the minimum specifications for Level II Armor as detailed in NIJ Standard 0101.06 Section 2 – Body Armor Classification. Must meet all specifications as listed in Appendix A – Level II Body Armor	Sm	\$560.00	\$560.00	\$582.00	\$582.00	\$495.00*	\$510.00		
	Med	\$560.00	\$560.00	\$582.00	\$582.00	\$495.00*	\$510.00		
	Lg	\$560.00	\$560.00	\$582.00	\$582.00	\$495.00*	\$510.00		
	XL	\$560.00	\$560.00	\$582.00	\$582.00	\$495.00	\$510.00		
<b>MALE BODY ARMOR:</b> <b>Level II Body Armor</b> - Less than .80 lbs/sq ft. Less than .25 in thick and meet or exceed the minimum specifications for Level II Armor as detailed in NIJ Standard 0101.06 Section 2 – Body Armor Classification. Must meet all specifications as listed in Appendix A – Level II Body Armor	Sm	\$560.00	\$560.00	\$582.00	\$582.00	\$595.00 *Summit Armor	635.00		
	Med	\$560.00	\$560.00	\$582.00	\$582.00	\$595.00*	635.00		
	Lg	\$560.00	\$560.00	\$582.00	\$582.00	\$595.00*	635.00		
	XL	\$560.00	\$560.00	\$582.00	\$582.00	\$595.00*	635.00		

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

**Date:** October 26, 2018  
**Bid:** #18-79 Patrol & Court Security Body Armor

<b>FEMALE BODY ARMOR:</b> <b>Level II Body Armor</b> - Less than .80 lbs/sq ft. Less than .25 in thick and meet or exceed the minimum specifications for Level II Armor as detailed in NIJ Standard 0101.06 Section 2 – Body Armor Classification. Must meet all specifications as listed in Appendix A – Level II Body Armor	Sm	\$560.00	\$560.00	\$582.00	\$582.00	\$595.00 *Summit Armor	635.00	No bid	No bid
	Med	\$560.00	\$560.00	\$582.00	\$582.00	\$595.00*	635.00		
	Lg	\$560.00	\$560.00	\$582.00	\$582.00	\$595.00*	635.00		
	XL	\$560.00	\$560.00	\$582.00	\$582.00	\$595.00*	635.00		
<b>Male &amp; Female Option 1:</b> Two concealable carriers in navy blue	N/A	\$111.00	\$111.00	\$118.00	\$118.00	\$150.00	\$160.00		
<b>Male &amp; Female Option 2:</b> One concealable navy carrier	N/A	\$57.00	\$57.00	\$61.00	\$61.00	\$75.00	\$80.00		
<b>Male &amp; Female Option 2 with External Carrier:</b> One external carrier, uniform shirt style, in Navy Blue with sown on embroidered badge (to be supplied by MCSO to vendor), custom fit to panels. External Carrier can come with a set (a set being 2 pockets) of either “Chicago pockets” or “Molle attachments” on the lower half at the Deputy’s choice	Sm	\$172.00	\$172.00	\$179.00	\$179.00	\$116.00 **Elbeco Body Shield	\$125.00		
	Med	\$172.00	\$172.00	\$179.00	\$179.00	\$116.00	\$125.00		
	Lg	\$172.00	\$172.00	\$179.00	\$179.00	\$116.00	\$125.00		
	XL	\$172.00	\$172.00	\$179.00	\$179.00	\$116.00	\$125.00		
Exceptions?		none					*Ballistic panels & trauma plate only **: Option 2 external carrier w/3 row MOLLE \$155.00 all sizes Year 1 and \$165.00 all sizes Year 2		

Sent to 6 potential bidders; Received 2