

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: September 28, 2018
Bid: #18-48 Tires for County-Owned

VENDOR				
Vendor	Auto Tech Centers			
City/State	McHenry IL			
Original Signature	Yes			
Certification Page	Yes			
References	Yes			
Tire Description:	Yr 1	Yr 2	Yr 3, optional	Yr 4, optional
	12/1/18-11/30/19	12/1/19-11/30/20	12/1/20-11/30/21	12/1/21-11/30/22
*P225/60R18 99V SL Eagle UG GW3 YSBRPTL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$138.33 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
*P225/60R18 99W SL Eagle RS-A VSBRTPL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$128.32 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
*P225/60R16 91V S2 Eagle UG GW2 BCSRPTL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$107.06 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
*P225/60R16 97V S2 Eagle RS-A VSBRTPL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$101.93 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
*P265/60R17 108VSL Eagle RS-A VSBRTPL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$137.03 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
*P265/60R17 108HSL US GW3 VSBTL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$140.40 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
P265/70R17 113S Wrangler HP BSLRPTL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$116.36	No bid	No bid	No bid
Tire Alignment, four wheel, same day for ABOVE	\$59.95***			
P225/60R16 Goodyear Eagle RSA Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$78.77 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
P225/55R17 Goodyear Eagle RSA Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$97.76 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
P225/65R17 Goodyear Eagle RSA Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$90.64 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
P235/55R18 Goodyear Eagle RSA Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$120.64 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
P235/70R15 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$92.21 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
P235/75R15 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$90.08 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
LT225/75R16 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$118.20 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
P245/70R16 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$106.40 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
LT245/75R16 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$125.17 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
P255/70R16 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$107.74 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: September 28, 2018
Bid: #18-48 Tires for County-Owned

P235/70R17 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$117.16 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
LT245/75R17 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$139.06 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
P265/70R17 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$114.92 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
LT265/70R17 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$146.01 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
P245/60R18 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$129.68 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
LT275/70R18 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$172.95 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
P265/7016 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$97.74 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
ST205/75R15 any make/model for small trailer Make/model Freestar M-108+	\$55.80	No bid	No bid	No bid
ST235/80R16 any make/model for small trailer Make/model Freestar M-108+	\$72.88	No bid	No bid	No bid
ST235/75R17.5 any make/model for small trailer Make/model Milestar BS623 All position Hwy	\$126.61	No bid	No bid	No bid
Small Tires Fees: Installation Valve Stems Disposal State tire fee Delivery	\$8.00 \$2.25 \$2.00 \$2.50 FREE	No bid	No bid	No bid
225/70R19.5 Goodyear G622RSD ULT Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$250.81 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
225/70R19.5 Goodyear G647RSS Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$242.41 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
245/70R19.5 Goodyear G647RSS Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$263.98 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
8R19.5 Goodyear G647RSS Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$243.09 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
11R22.5 Goodyear G661HSA Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$349.96 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
12R22.5 Goodyear G661HSA Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$402.46 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
11R22.5 Michelin XDE M/S 16 Ply Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: Goodyear make/model	\$407.44 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
385/65R22.5 Michelin XZY3 Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: Goodyear make/model	\$599.37 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
315/80R22.5 Michelin XZY3 Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: Goodyear make/model	\$641.84 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
425/65R22.5 Michelin XZY3 Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: Goodyear make/model	\$665.97 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
8.25x15 Low Pro (no special make) for Large Trailers Make/model Multi-mile power king LPT trailer	\$162.50	No bid	No bid	No bid
15X19.5 Solideal Hauler SKZ Solideal: Y or N Equivalent: Hercules Hauler SKZ make/model	\$447.50	No bid	No bid	No bid
14R24 Michelin X Sno Plus Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: Goodyear AS-3A make/model	\$1,503.06 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: September 28, 2018
Bid: #18-48 Tires for County-Owned

17.5R25 Michelin XHA Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: Goodyear TL-3A make/model	\$1,198.24 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
20.5R25 Michelin XHA2 Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: Goodyear TL-3A make/model	\$2,387.46 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
23.5X25 Firestone Super Rock Grip Firestone: Y or N Equivalent: Goodyear GRL D/L-3A make/model	\$1,598.65 Thru 12/31/18	No bid	No bid	No bid
10x16 4 Rib front (no special make) for Tractor Make/model: Carisle Farm Spec. F-2M	\$155.00	No bid	No bid	No bid
11L15 F3 front (no special make) for Tractor Make/model: Hercules F-3 Backhoe	\$136.00	No bid	No bid	No bid
11.2x24 Firestone Super All Traction II 23deg Firestone: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$247.00	No bid	No bid	No bid
16.9x30 Firestone Super All Traction 23 deg TLR1 Firestone: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$527.00	No bid	No bid	No bid
16.9x38 Firestone super All Traction 23deg TTR1 Firestone: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$1,138.00	No bid	No bid	No bid
12.4R24 Goodyear/Titan Dyna Torque TL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: BKT TR-135 make/model	\$241.00	No bid	No bid	No bid
18.4R30 Goodyear/Titan Dyna Torque TL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: BKT TR-135 make/model	\$511.00	No bid	No bid	No bid
380/85R28 (14.9R28) Radial All Traction FWD TLR1 Make/model: BKT Agrimax RT-855	\$621.00	No bid	No bid	No bid
480/80R38 (18.4R38) Radial All traction 23deg TLR1 Make/model: BKT Agrimax RT-855	\$893.00	No bid	No bid	No bid
Large Tire Fees: Installation Valve Stems Disposal State Tire Fee Delivery	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
On site repair / installation Extra Fee Price? Yes or No	Yes No \$	Yes No \$	Yes No \$	Yes No \$
Exceptions?	Pricing only valid through 12/31/18. Goodyear has not yet released 2019 pricing and beyond. See bid for additional exceptions. See bid for Equivalent tires offered on some items.			

VENDOR				
Vendor	Gillespie Ford			
City/State	Gurnee IL			
Original Signature	Yes			
Certification Page	Yes			
References	Yes			
Tire Description:	Yr 1 12/1/18-11/30/19	Yr 2 12/1/19-11/30/20	Yr 3, optional 12/1/20-11/30/21	Yr 4, optional 12/1/21-11/30/22
*P225/60R18 99V SL Eagle UG GW3 YSRPRTL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$150.00	\$150.00	No bid	No bid
*P225/60R18 99W SL Eagle RS-A VSRPRTL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$255.00	\$255.00	No bid	No bid
*P225/60R16 91V S2 Eagle UG GW2 BCSRPTL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$119.00	\$119.00	No bid	No bid
*P225/60R16 97V S2 Eagle RS-A VSRPRTL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$178.00	\$178.00	No bid	No bid
*P265/60R17 108VSL Eagle RS-A VSRPRTL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$264.00	\$264.00	No bid	No bid

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: September 28, 2018
Bid: #18-48 Tires for County-Owned

*P265/60R17 108HSL US GW3 VSBTL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$156.00	\$156.00	No bid	No bid
P265/70R17 113S Wrangler HP BSLRPTL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$137.00	\$137.00	No bid	No bid
Tire Alignment, four wheel, same day for ABOVE	\$119.00	\$119.00	No bid	No bid
P225/60R16 Goodyear Eagle RSA Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
P225/55R17 Goodyear Eagle RSA Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
P225/65R17 Goodyear Eagle RSA Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
P235/55R18 Goodyear Eagle RSA Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
P235/70R15 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
P235/75R15 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
LT225/75R16 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
P245/70R16 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
LT245/75R16 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
P255/70R16 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
P235/70R17 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
LT245/75R17 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
P265/70R17 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
LT265/70R17 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
P245/60R18 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
LT275/70R18 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
P265/7016 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
ST205/75R15 any make/model for small trailer Make/model _____	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
ST235/80R16 any make/model for small trailer Make/model _____	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
ST235/75R17.5 any make/model for small trailer Make/model _____	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: September 28, 2018
Bid: #18-48 Tires for County-Owned

Small Tires Fees: Installation Valve Stems Disposal State tire fee Delivery	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
225/70R19.5 Goodyear G622RSD ULT Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
225/70R19.5 Goodyear G647RSS Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
245/70R19.5 Goodyear G647RSS Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
8R19.5 Goodyear G647RSS Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
11R22.5 Goodyear G661HSA Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
12R22.5 Goodyear G661HSA Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
11R22.5 Michelin XDE M/S 16 Ply Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: _ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
385/65R22.5 Michelin XZY3 Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: _ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
315/80R22.5 Michelin XZY3 Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
425/65R22.5 Michelin XZY3 Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: _ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
8.25x15 Low Pro (no special make) for Large Trailers Make/model: _____	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
15X19.5 Solideal Hauler SKZ Solideal: Y or N Equivalent: _ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
14R24 Michelin X Sno Plus Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
17.5R25 Michelin XHA Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
20.5R25 Michelin XHA2 Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
23.5X25 Firestone Super Rock Grip Firestone: Y or N Equivalent: _ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
10x16 4 Rib front (no special make) for Tractor Make/model: _____	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
11L15 F3 front (no special make) for Tractor Make/model: _____	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
11.2x24 Firestone Super All Traction II 23deg Firestone: Y or N Equivalent: _ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
16.9x30 Firestone Super All Traction 23 deg TLR1 Firestone: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
16.9x38 Firestone super All Traction 23deg TTR1 Firestone: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
12.4R24 Goodyear/Titan Dyna Torque TL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
18.4R30 Goodyear/Titan Dyna Torque TL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: September 28, 2018
Bid: #18-48 Tires for County-Owned

380/85R28 (14.9R28) Radial All Traction FWD TLR1 Make/model:	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
480/80R38 (18.4R38) Radial All traction 23deg TLR1 Make/model:	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
Large Tire Fees: Installation Valve Stems Disposal State Tire Fee Delivery	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
On site repair / installation Extra Fee Price? Yes or No	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
Exceptions?	\$89.00 labor per set to install			

VENDOR				
Vendor	The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company			
City/State	Rockford IL			
Original Signature	Yes			
Certification Page	Yes			
References	Yes			
Tire Description:	Yr 1 12/1/18-11/30/19	Yr 2 12/1/19-11/30/20	Yr 3, optional 12/1/20-11/30/21	Yr 4, optional 12/1/21-11/30/22
*P225/60R18 99V SL Eagle UG GW3 YSBRPTL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$131.58	\$131.58	\$134.21	\$136.90
*P225/60R18 99W SL Eagle RS-A VSRPTL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$117.00	\$117.00	\$119.39	\$121.73
*P225/60R16 91V S2 Eagle UG GW2 BCSRPTL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$104.21	\$104.21	\$106.30	\$108.42
*P225/60R16 97V S2 Eagle RS-A VSRPTL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$90.00	\$90.00	\$91.80	\$93.64
*P265/60R17 108VSL Eagle RS-A VSRPTL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$122.00	\$122.00	\$124.40	\$126.95
*P265/60R17 108HSL US GW3 VSBTL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$126.32	\$126.32	\$128.85	\$131.43
P265/70R17 113S Wrangler HP BSLRPTL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$140.00	\$140.00	\$142.80	\$145.66
Tire Alignment, four wheel, same day for ABOVE	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
P225/60R16 Goodyear Eagle RSA Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$92.00	\$92.00	493.84	\$95.72
P225/55R17 Goodyear Eagle RSA Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$135.00	\$135.00	\$137.70	\$140.45
P225/65R17 Goodyear Eagle RSA Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$95.09	\$95.09	\$96.99	\$98.94
P235/55R18 Goodyear Eagle RSA Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$148.00	\$148.00	\$150.96	\$153.98
P235/70R15 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$92.00	\$92.00	\$93.84	\$95.72
P235/75R15 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$65.80	\$65.80	\$67.12	\$68.46

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: September 28, 2018
Bid: #18-48 Tires for County-Owned

LT225/75R16 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$110.00	\$110.00	\$112.20	\$114.45
P245/70R16 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$107.00	\$107.00	\$109.14	\$111.33
LT245/75R16 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$115.00	\$115.00	\$117.30	\$119.65
P255/70R16 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$108.00	\$108.00	\$110.16	\$112.36
P235/70R17 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$130.00	\$130.00	\$132.60	\$135.25
LT245/75R17 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$138.00	\$138.00	\$140.76	\$143.58
P265/70R17 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$115.00	\$115.00	\$147.30	\$119.65
LT265/70R17 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$160.00	\$160.00	\$163.20	\$166.47
P245/60R18 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$124.89	\$124.89	\$127.39	\$129.94
LT275/70R18 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$176.41	\$176.41	\$179.94	\$183.54
P265/7016 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$99.70	\$99.70	\$101.69	\$103.73
ST205/75R15 any make/model for small trailer Make/model Goodyear Endurance ST	\$99.86	\$99.86	\$101.86	\$103.90
ST235/80R16 any make/model for small trailer Make/model Goodyear Endurance ST	\$135.21	\$135.21	\$137.91	\$140.67
ST235/75R17.5 any make/model for small trailer Make/model Goodyear URLT Regional RHS	\$300.00	\$300.00	\$306.00	\$312.12
Small Tires Fees:				
Installation	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$26.00	\$27.00
Valve Stems	\$5.00	\$5.00	\$5.25	\$5.75
Disposal	\$6.00	\$6.00	\$7.00	\$8.00
State tire fee	\$2.50	\$2.50	\$2.50	\$2.50
Delivery	\$20.00	\$20.00	\$20.00	\$20.00
225/70R19.5 Goodyear G622RSD ULT Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$220.00	\$220.00	\$224.40	\$228.89
225/70R19.5 Goodyear G647RSS Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$220.00	\$220.00	\$224.00	\$228.89
245/70R19.5 Goodyear G647RSS Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$240.00	\$240.00	\$244.80	\$249.70
8R19.5 Goodyear G647RSS Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$192.00	\$192.00	\$195.84	\$195.84
11R22.5 Goodyear G661HSA Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$285.00	\$285.00	\$290.70	\$296.51
12R22.5 Goodyear G661HSA Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$335.00	\$335.00	\$341.70	\$348.53
11R22.5 Michelin XDE M/S 16 Ply Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: Goodyear G182 make/model	\$350.00	\$350.00	\$357.00	\$364.14
385/65R22.5 Michelin XZY3 Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: Goodyear G296 make/model	\$550.00	\$550.00	\$561.00	\$572.22

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: September 28, 2018
Bid: #18-48 Tires for County-Owned

315/80R22.5 Michelin XZY3 Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: Goodyear Workhorse MSA make/model	\$405.00	\$405.00	\$413.10	\$421.36
425/65R22.5 Michelin XZY3 Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: Goodyear G296 make/model	\$595.00	\$595.00	\$606.90	\$616.04
8.25x15 Low Pro (no special make) for Large Trailers Make/model _____	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
15X19.5 Solideal Hauler SKZ Solideal: Y or N Equivalent: Goodyear American Skid Steer_ make/model	\$400.00	\$400.00	\$408.00	\$416.16
14R24 Michelin X Sno Plus Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: Goodyear AS3A make/model	\$1,350.00	\$1,350.00	\$1,377.00	\$1,404.54
17.5R25 Michelin XHA Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: Goodyear GP-2B make/model	\$1,200.00	\$1,200.00	\$1,224.00	\$1,248.48
20.5R25 Michelin XHA2 Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: Goodyear GP-2B make/model	\$1,600.00	\$1,600.00	\$1,632.00	\$1,664.46
23.5X25 Firestone Super Rock Grip Firestone: Y or N Equivalent: Goodyear GGL make/model	\$1,350.00	\$1,350.00	\$1,377.00	\$1,404.54
10x16 4 Rib front (no special make) for Tractor Make/model: Titan 466394	\$254.00	\$254.00	\$260.00	\$268.00
11L15 F3 front (no special make) for Tractor Make/model: Titan 465310	\$214.00	\$214.00	\$218.00	\$223.00
11.2x24 Firestone Super All Traction II 23deg Firestone: Y or N Equivalent: Titan 48D604 make/model	\$368.00	\$368.00	\$376.00	\$383.00
16.9x30 Firestone Super All Traction 23 deg TLR1 Firestone: Y or N Equivalent Titan 47D879 make/model	\$718.00	\$718.00	\$734.00	\$748.00
16.9x38 Firestone super All Traction 23deg TTR1 Firestone: Y or N Equivalent: Titan 48D620 make/model	\$1,058.00	\$1,058.00	\$1,080.00	\$1,102.00
12.4R24 Goodyear/Titan Dyna Torque TL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
18.4R30 Goodyear/Titan Dyna Torque TL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: DT710 make/model	\$1,117.00	\$1,117.00	\$1,140.00	\$1,162.30
380/85R28 (14.9R28) Radial All Traction FWD TLR1 Make/model: Titan	\$1,030.00	\$1,030.00	\$1,051.00	\$1,072.00
480/80R38 (18.4R38) Radial All traction 23deg TLR1 Make/model: Titan	\$1,346.00	\$1,346.00	\$1,373.00	\$1,400.00
Large Tire Fees: Installation Valve Stems Disposal State Tire Fee Delivery **Disposal charge: Rear Farm & OTR	\$38.00 \$10.00 \$10.00 (Medium Truck Casings: see Note**) \$2.50 \$20.00	\$38.00 \$10.00 \$10.00 (Medium Truck Casings: see Note**) \$2.50 \$20.00	\$40.00 \$10.75 \$11.00 \$2.50 \$20.00	\$42.00 \$11.50 \$12.00 \$2.50 \$20.00
On site repair / installation Extra Fee Price? Yes or No	\$25.00 Yes \$110.00/hr	\$25.00 Yes \$110.00/hour	\$26.00 Yes \$115.00/hour	\$27.00 Yes \$120.00/hour
Exceptions?	Please see our cover letter with Attachment #1, giving our requests for exception or change with our reasons.			

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: September 28, 2018
Bid: #18-48 Tires for County-Owned

VENDOR				
Vendor	Jacks Tire Sales & Service Inc			
City/State	South Beloit IL			
Original Signature	Yes			
Certification Page	Yes			
References	Yes			
Tire Description:	Yr 1 12/1/18-11/30/19	Yr 2 12/1/19-11/30/20	Yr 3, optional 12/1/20-11/30/21	Yr 4, optional 12/1/21-11/30/22
*P225/60R18 99V SL Eagle UG GW3 YSBRPTL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$142.47	\$149.59	No bid	No bid
*P225/60R18 99W SL Eagle RS-A VSRPTL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$132.16	\$138.76	No bid	No bid
*P225/60R16 91V S2 Eagle UG GW2 BCSRPTL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$110.27	\$115.78	No bid	No bid
*P225/60R16 97V S2 Eagle RS-A VSRPTL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$110.63	\$116.16	No bid	No bid
*P265/60R17 108VSL Eagle RS-A VSRPTL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$133.15	\$139.80	No bid	No bid
*P265/60R17 108HSL US GW3 VSBTL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$144.61	\$151.84	No bid	No bid
P265/70R17 113S Wrangler HP BSLRPTL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: Trailrunner make/model	\$121.99	\$128.08	No bid	No bid
Tire Alignment, four wheel, same day for ABOVE	\$79.00	\$79.00	No bid	No bid
P225/60R16 Goodyear Eagle RSA Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: Assurance make/model	\$78.03	\$81.93	No bid	No bid
P225/55R17 Goodyear Eagle RSA Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent; Assurance make/model	\$94.17	\$98.87	No bid	No bid
P225/65R17 Goodyear Eagle RSA Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: Assurance make/model	\$94.17	\$98.87	No bid	No bid
P235/55R18 Goodyear Eagle RSA Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: FIRESTONE – SEE BID make/model	\$104.74	\$109.98	No bid	No bid
P235/70R15 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: FIRESTONE – SEE BID make/model	\$94.52	\$99.25	No bid	No bid
P235/75R15 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: FIRESTONE – SEE BID make/model	\$108.09	\$113.50	No bid	No bid
LT225/75R16 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: FIRESTONE – SEE BID make/model	\$103.94	\$109.14	No bid	No bid
P245/70R16 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent FIRESTONE – SEE BID make/model	\$104.84	\$110.09	No bid	No bid
LT245/75R16 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: FIRESTONE – SEE BID make/model	\$117.94	\$123.84	No bid	No bid
P255/70R16 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: FIRESTONE – SEE BID _____ make/model	\$117.54	\$123.42	No bid	No bid

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: September 28, 2018
Bid: #18-48 Tires for County-Owned

P235/70R17 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: FIRESTONE – SEE BID make/model	\$109.20	\$114.66	No bid	No bid
LT245/75R17 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: FIRESTONE – SEE BID make/model	\$129.74	\$136.23	No bid	No bid
P265/70R17 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: FIRESTONE – SEE BID make/model	\$120.88	\$126.93	No bid	No bid
LT265/70R17 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: FIRESTONE – SEE BID make/model	\$143.75	\$150.94	No bid	No bid
P245/60R18 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: FIRESTONE – SEE BID make/model	\$104.06	\$109.27	No bid	No bid
LT275/70R18 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: FIRESTONE – SEE BID make/model	\$138.88	\$145.83	No bid	No bid
P265/7016 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: FIRESTONE – SEE BID make/model	\$117.99	\$123.89	No bid	No bid
ST205/75R15 any make/model for small trailer Make/model Power King Tow Max	\$57.15	\$67.15	No bid	No bid
ST235/80R16 any make/model for small trailer Make/model Power King Tow Max	\$83.18	\$93.18	No bid	No bid
ST235/75R17.5 any make/model for small trailer Make/model Roadmaster	\$200.00	\$225.00	No bid	No bid
Small Tires Fees: Installation Valve Stems Disposal State tire fee Delivery	\$10.00 \$3.00 \$3.00 \$2.50 N/A	\$10.00 \$3.00 \$3.00 \$2.50 N/A	No bid	No bid
225/70R19.5 Goodyear G622RSD ULT Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: FIRESTONE – SEE BID make/model	\$245.55	\$257.83	No bid	No bid
225/70R19.5 Goodyear G647RSS Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: FIRESTONE – SEE BID make/model	\$249.23	\$261.33	No bid	No bid
245/70R19.5 Goodyear G647RSS Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: FIRESTONE – SEE BID make/model	\$269.44	\$282.52	No bid	No bid
8R19.5 Goodyear G647RSS Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$250.39	\$262.91	No bid	No bid
11R22.5 Goodyear G661HSA Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: FIRESTONE – SEE BID make/model	\$328.86	\$345.28	No bid	No bid
12R22.5 Goodyear G661HSA Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: FIRESTONE – SEE BID make/model	\$407.77	\$428.16	No bid	No bid
11R22.5 Michelin XDE M/S 16 Ply Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$481.85	\$505.95	No bid	No bid
385/65R22.5 Michelin XZY3 Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$684.53	\$718.76	No bid	No bid
315/80R22.5 Michelin XZY3 Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$570.21	\$604.43	No bid	No bid
425/65R22.5 Michelin XZY3 Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	\$761.02	\$779.08	No bid	No bid
8.25x15 Low Pro (no special make) for Large Trailers Make/model Power King	\$155.00	\$170.00	No bid	No bid
15X19.5 Solideal Hauler SKZ Solideal: Y or N Equivalent: Power King make/model	\$290.00	\$320.00	No bid	No bid
14R24 Michelin X Sno Plus Michelin: Y or N Equivalent:	\$1,456.01	\$1,528.88	No bid	No bid

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: September 28, 2018
Bid: #18-48 Tires for County-Owned

17.5R25 Michelin XHA Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: make/model	\$1,380.62	\$1,449.66	No bid	No bid
20.5R25 Michelin XHA2 Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: make/model	\$1,840.41	\$1,932.43	No bid	No bid
23.5X25 Firestone Super Rock Grip Firestone: Y or N Equivalent: make/model	\$1,625.01	\$1,706.26	No bid	No bid
10x16 4 Rib front (no special make) for Tractor Make/model: FIRESTONE – SEE BID	\$155.45	\$163.23	No bid	No bid
11L15 F3 front (no special make) for Tractor Make/model: FIRESTONE – SEE BID	\$157.04	\$164.90	No bid	No bid
11.2x24 Firestone Super All Traction II 23deg Firestone: Y or N Equivalent: make/model	\$233.15	\$244.81	No bid	No bid
16.9x30 Firestone Super All Traction 23 deg TLR1 Firestone: Y or N Equivalent: make/model	\$489.88	\$514.38	No bid	No bid
16.9x38 Firestone super All Traction 23deg TTR1 Firestone: Y or N Equivalent: make/model	\$1,037.09	\$1,088.95	No bid	No bid
12.4R24 Goodyear/Titan Dyna Torque TL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: make/model	\$400.00	\$430.00	No bid	No bid
18.4R30 Goodyear/Titan Dyna Torque TL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: make/model	\$960.00	\$1,000.00	No bid	No bid
380/85R28 (14.9R28) Radial All Traction FWD TLR1 Make/model: Firestone	\$832.76	\$874.40	No bid	No bid
480/80R38 (18.4R38) Radial All traction 23deg TLR1 Make/model: Firestone	\$1,381.85	\$1,450.95	No bid	No bid
Large Tire Fees: Installation Valve Stems Disposal State Tire Fee Delivery	\$50.00 \$15.00 \$25.00 N/A	\$50.00 \$15.00 \$25.00 N/A	No bid	No bid
On site repair / installation Extra Fee Price? Yes or No	Yes \$85.00/hour	Yes \$85.00/hour	No bid	No bid
Exceptions?	none			

VENDOR				
Vendor	Wentworth Tire Service			
City/State	Bensenville IL			
Original Signature	Yes			
Certification Page	Yes			
References	Yes			
Tire Description:	Yr 1	Yr 2	Yr 3, optional	Yr 4, optional
	12/1/18-11/30/19	12/1/19-11/30/20	12/1/20-11/30/21	12/1/21-11/30/22
*P225/60R18 99V SL Eagle UG GW3 YSBRPTL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: Firestone – See Bid make/model	\$134.10	No bid	No bid	No bid
*P225/60R18 99W SL Eagle RS-A VSRPTL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: Firestone – See Bid make/model	\$122.84	No bid	No bid	No bid
*P225/60R16 91V S2 Eagle UG GW2 BCSRPTL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: Firestone – See Bid make/model	\$105.33	No bid	No bid	No bid
*P225/60R16 97V S2 Eagle RS-A VSRPTL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: Firestone – See Bid make/model	\$102.85	No bid	No bid	No bid
*P265/60R17 108VSL Eagle RS-A VSRPTL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: Firestone – See Bid make/model	\$129.40	No bid	No bid	No bid

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: September 28, 2018
Bid: #18-48 Tires for County-Owned

*P265/60R17 108HSL US GW3 VSBTL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: Firestone – See Bid make/model	\$126.79	No bid	No bid	No bid
P265/70R17 113S Wrangler HP BSLRPTL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: Firestone – See Bid make/model	\$138.37	No bid	No bid	No bid
Tire Alignment, four wheel, same day for ABOVE	\$130.00	No bid	No bid	No bid
P225/60R16 Goodyear Eagle RSA Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
P225/55R17 Goodyear Eagle RSA Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
P225/65R17 Goodyear Eagle RSA Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
P235/55R18 Goodyear Eagle RSA Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
P235/70R15 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
P235/75R15 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
LT225/75R16 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
P245/70R16 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
LT245/75R16 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
P255/70R16 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
P235/70R17 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
LT245/75R17 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
P265/70R17 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
LT265/70R17 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
P245/60R18 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
LT275/70R18 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
P265/7016 Goodyear Wrangler SRA under 1 Ton Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
ST205/75R15 any make/model for small trailer Make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
ST235/80R16 any make/model for small trailer Make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
ST235/75R17.5 any make/model for small trailer Make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: September 28, 2018
Bid: #18-48 Tires for County-Owned

Small Tires Fees: Installation Valve Stems Disposal State tire fee Delivery	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
225/70R19.5 Goodyear G622RSD ULT Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
225/70R19.5 Goodyear G647RSS Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
245/70R19.5 Goodyear G647RSS Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
8R19.5 Goodyear G647RSS Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
11R22.5 Goodyear G661HSA Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
12R22.5 Goodyear G661HSA Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
11R22.5 Michelin XDE M/S 16 Ply Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
385/65R22.5 Michelin XZY3 Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: _ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
315/80R22.5 Michelin XZY3 Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
425/65R22.5 Michelin XZY3 Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: _ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
8.25x15 Low Pro (no special make) for Large Trailers Make/model: _	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
15X19.5 Solideal Hauler SKZ Solideal: Y or N Equivalent: _ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
14R24 Michelin X Sno Plus Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
17.5R25 Michelin XHA Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
20.5R25 Michelin XHA2 Michelin: Y or N Equivalent: make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
23.5X25 Firestone Super Rock Grip Firestone: Y or N Equivalent: _ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
10x16 4 Rib front (no special make) for Tractor Make/model: _	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
11L15 F3 front (no special make) for Tractor Make/model: _	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
11.2x24 Firestone Super All Traction II 23deg Firestone: Y or N Equivalent: _ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
16.9x30 Firestone Super All Traction 23 deg TLR1 Firestone: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
16.9x38 Firestone super All Traction 23deg TTR1 Firestone: Y or N Equivalent: _____ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
12.4R24 Goodyear/Titan Dyna Torque TL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
18.4R30 Goodyear/Titan Dyna Torque TL Goodyear: Y or N Equivalent: _ make/model	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: September 28, 2018
Bid: #18-48 Tires for County-Owned

380/85R28 (14.9R28) Radial All Traction FWD TLR1 Make/model:	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
480/80R38 (18.4R38) Radial All traction 23deg TLR1 Make/model:	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
<u>Large Tire Fees:</u> Installation Valve Stems Disposal State Tire Fee Delivery	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
On site repair / installation Extra Fee Price? Yes or No	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
Exceptions?	-			

Sent to 6 potential bidders; received: 5