

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 4/23/18 2:00PM
 Bid#:18-26 Air Filters

Vendor:	Filter Services			HP Products			Tri Dim Filter Corp		
City/State:	Elk Grove Village IL			Tinley Park IL			Elgin IL		
Original Signature	Yes			Yes			Yes		
Mandatory Pages	Yes			Yes			Yes		
Air Filters	Year 1: 12/1/18-11/30/19	Year 2: 12/1/19-11/30/20	Year 3, optional, 12/1/20-11/30/21	Year 1: 12/1/18-11/30/19	Year 2: 12/1/19-11/30/20	Year 3, optional, 12/1/20-11/30/21	Year 1: 12/1/18-11/30/19	Year 2: 12/1/19-11/30/20	Year 3, optional, 12/1/20-11/30/21
4x20x20 – 3 PLY - Similar: TRI-DEK 15/40	\$12.98	\$12.98	\$12.98	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$13.05	\$13.05	\$13.38
07.5x17.5x1	\$6.54	\$6.54	\$6.54	\$4.80	\$4.94	\$5.09	\$4.80	\$4.80	\$4.92
08.75x42x1	\$8.82	\$8.82	\$8.82	\$10.17	\$10.48	\$10.80	\$7.89	\$7.89	\$8.09
08x19.75x1	\$6.54	\$6.54	\$6.54	\$4.70	\$4.84	\$4.93	\$4.80	\$4.80	\$4.80
08x20x1	\$5.33	\$5.33	\$5.33	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$4.80	\$4.80	\$4.80
08x28x1	\$5.88	\$5.88	\$5.88	\$5.35	\$5.51	\$5.62	\$7.89	\$7.89	\$7.89
08x44x1	\$8.82	\$8.82	\$8.82	\$10.05	\$10.36	\$10.57	\$7.89	\$7.89	\$7.89
09.5x17.5x1	\$6.54	\$6.54	\$6.54	\$4.80	\$4.94	\$5.04	\$3.94	\$3.94	\$4.04
09.5x27.5x1	\$8.11	\$8.11	\$8.11	\$5.41	\$5.57	\$5.68	\$7.19	\$7.19	\$7.19
10x20x1	\$2.32	\$2.32	\$2.32	\$2.82	\$2.90	\$2.95	\$2.35	\$2.35	\$2.41
10x22x1	\$6.00	\$6.00	\$6.00	\$5.47	\$5.63	\$5.74	\$4.12	\$4.12	\$4.22
10x28x1	\$6.50	\$6.50	\$6.50	\$9.94	\$10.24	\$10.44	\$7.36	\$7.36	\$7.59
10x33x1	\$7.31	\$7.31	\$7.31	\$10.17	\$10.40	\$10.69	\$7.66	\$7.66	\$7.66
10x40x1	\$9.03	\$9.03	\$9.03	\$10.87	\$11.20	\$11.42	\$8.00	\$8.00	\$8.00
11-1/2x 24-1/2x 2	\$8.89	\$8.89	\$8.89	\$7.32	\$7.42	\$7.57	\$7.89	\$7.89	\$8.09

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 4/23/18 2:00PM
Bid#:18-26 Air Filters

12x24x2	\$2.48	\$2.48	\$2.48	\$3.01	\$3.10	\$3.16	\$2.19	\$2.19	\$2.26
12x24x6*	\$40.46	\$40.46	\$40.46	\$5.58	\$5.75	\$5.86	\$33.74	\$33.74	\$33.74
12x25x2	\$3.19	\$3.19	\$3.19	\$5.71	\$5.80	\$6.06	\$7.89	\$7.89	\$7.89
14x24x1	\$4.00	\$4.00	\$4.00	\$3.30	\$3.40	\$3.46	\$2.69	\$2.69	\$2.69
14x25x2	\$2.84	\$2.84	\$2.84	\$3.61	\$3.72	\$3.83	\$2.93	\$2.93	\$2.93
16x18x1	\$6.64	\$6.64	\$6.64	\$5.73	\$5.90	\$6.00	\$4.40	\$4.40	\$4.40
16x18x2	\$7.11	\$7.11	\$7.11	\$5.71	\$5.88	\$6.06	\$4.47	\$4.47	\$4.47
16x20x2	\$2.49	\$2.49	\$2.49	\$2.88	\$2.96	\$3.05	\$2.63	\$2.63	\$2.63
16x20x2**	\$11.20	\$11.20	\$11.20	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$20.55	\$20.55	\$21.25
16x20x6*	\$46.92	\$46.92	\$46.92	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$36.31	\$36.31	\$37.40
16x24x1	\$3.27	\$3.27	\$3.27	\$3.32	\$3.42	\$3.52	\$2.75	\$2.75	\$2.83
16x25x1	\$2.51	\$2.51	\$2.51	\$3.20	\$3.29	\$3.39	\$2.58	\$2.58	\$2.58
16x25x2	\$2.84	\$2.84	\$2.84	\$3.20	\$3.29	\$3.39	\$2.74	\$2.74	\$2.82
16x25x2**	\$13.50	\$13.50	\$13.50	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$23.81	\$23.81	\$24.82
20x20x1	\$2.55	\$2.55	\$2.55	\$3.20	\$3.29	\$3.39	\$2.58	\$2.58	\$2.66
20x20x2	\$2.88	\$2.88	\$2.88	\$3.35	\$3.45	\$3.52	\$2.56	\$2.56	\$2.64
20x20x4	\$5.00	\$5.00	\$5.00	\$7.38	\$7.60	\$7.75	\$4.60	\$4.60	\$4.74
20x20x6*	\$49.80	\$49.80	\$49.80	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$39.14	\$39.14	\$40.31
20x24x2	\$3.37	\$3.37	\$3.37	\$3.97	\$4.09	\$4.21	\$2.97	\$2.97	\$3.06
20x24x6*	\$53.28	\$53.28	\$53.28	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$42.49	\$42.49	\$43.76
20x25x1	\$2.91	\$2.91	\$2.91	\$3.61	\$3.72	\$3.83	\$2.80	\$2.80	\$2.89

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 4/23/18 2:00PM
Bid#:18-26 Air Filters

20x25x2	\$3.29	\$3.29	\$3.29	\$3.82	\$3.93	\$4.05	\$3.03	\$3.03	\$3.12
20x25x2**	\$16.28	\$16.28	\$16.28	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$28.05	\$28.05	\$28.89
20x30x1	\$3.80	\$3.80	\$3.80	\$4.25	\$4.38	\$4.51	\$3.88	\$4.00	\$4.12
20x30x2	\$6.14	\$6.14	\$6.14	\$5.37	\$5.53	\$5.70	\$5.48	\$5.48	\$5.48
20x80 – 3 ply	\$12.98	\$12.98	\$12.98	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$11.39	\$11.39	\$11.73
24x12x5-7/8	\$212.87	\$212.87	\$212.87	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$33.74	\$33.74	\$34.75
24x24x2	\$3.68	\$3.68	\$3.68	\$4.26	\$4.39	\$4.52	\$3.48	\$3.48	\$3.58
24x24x5-7/8	\$212.87	\$212.87	\$212.87	\$35.65	\$36.75	\$37.88	\$46.87	\$46.87	\$48.27
24x24x4 Tri Pl Ultra	\$6.57	\$6.57	\$6.57	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$5.50	\$5.50	\$5.67
24x24x11-1/2	\$166.84	\$166.84	\$166.84	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$139.36	\$139.36	\$139.36
24x24x6*	\$59.35	\$59.35	\$59.35	\$8.25	\$8.50	\$8.76	\$46.87	\$46.87	\$48.28
Charcoal Blend XB-17 Refill 22x24x1 Tray	\$2.40	\$2.40	\$2.40	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$58.75	\$59.88	\$61.08
TOTAL	\$1,085.92	\$1,085.92	\$1,085.92	\$220.23	\$226.57	\$232.44	\$732.85	\$734.10	\$748.07
placed from a web form?	No			Yes			Yes		
Can our filter orders be set to automatically ship each month?	Yes			Yes			Yes		
Lead Time:	Stock/Next day			5 days			2 weeks a.r.o.		
Exceptions:	Item 48 charcoal blend \$80.00 shipping for refill			-			Lines 17, 25, 33, 35, 46, 47, 48=4 weeks		
Sent to 13 potential bidders; Received 3 submittals									