

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: April 3, 2018  
 Bid: #18-24 Paper Products

	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
<b>Vendor City/State</b>	<b>Cabay &amp; Co Inc McHenry IL</b>	<b>Central Poly- Bag Corp Linden NJ</b>	<b>Complete Office LLC Germantown WI</b>	<b>Office Pro Inc DBA Elkhorn Supplies Elkhorn WI</b>	<b>HP Products Alsip IL</b>	<b>Taza Supplies DBA of Tiles in Style LLC Naperville IL</b>	<b>Wipeco Inc Hillside IL</b>	<b>Warehouse Direct Des Plaines IL</b>
ORIGINAL SIGNATURE	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
Mandatory Pages?	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
<b>1. Cascade B201</b> (or equal) Pro Select Standard Bath Tissue, 2 Ply recycled content Rolls are 4.3" x 3.25", 550 sheets per roll, 80 rolls per case								
<b>FOOT COST</b>	<b>\$0.02202</b>	<b>\$0.00457</b>	<b>\$5.177</b>	<b>\$0.00177</b>	<b>\$0.00186</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>\$0.002853</b>	<b>\$0.0021</b>
<b>CASE COST</b>	<b>\$32.30</b>	<b>\$53.66</b>	<b>\$39.40</b>	<b>\$30.56</b>	<b>\$29.76</b>	<b>\$60.75</b>	<b>\$34.00</b>	<b>\$31.95</b>
Manufacturer: Part #: Roll size: Sheets per roll Rolls per case	Mfg.: Von-Cabay Part #: 24480 Roll size: 4 x 4 550 Sheets per roll 80 Rolls per case	Mfg.: Central Poly Part #: B55080 Roll size: 4.1 x 3.2 550 Sheets per roll 80 Rolls per case	Mfg.: Sofidel Part #: SOA410009 Roll size: 4.33 x 204' 700 Sheets per roll 96 Rolls per case	Mfg.: Rose Part #: 42157 Roll size: 4x3.75 500 Sheets per roll 96 Rolls per case	Mfg.: National Tissue Part #: 140565 Roll size: 4 x 3.5 500 Sheets per roll 96 Rolls per case	Mfg.: Cascades Part #: B201 Roll size: 4 5/16x3 1/4 550 Sheets per roll 80 Rolls per case	Mfg.: Cascades pro Part #: B201 Roll size: 4.3"x3.25" 550 Sheets per roll 80 Rolls per case	Mfg.: NPS Part #: WHD12375 Roll size: 4.5x3.75 500 Sheets per roll 96 Rolls per case
<b>2. Cascade B220</b> (or equal) Pro Select JRT Jr Jumbo Bath Tissue, 2 Ply Tissue recycled content Rolls are 3.45" x 750', 12 rolls per case								
<b>FOOT COST</b>	<b>\$0.0213333</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$3.17</b>	<b>\$0.0326</b>	<b>\$0.002037</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>\$0.0019072</b>	<b>\$0.0016</b>
<b>CASE COST</b>	<b>\$19.20</b>		<b>\$22.09</b>	<b>\$24.45</b>	<b>\$18.33</b>	<b>\$54.00</b>	<b>\$16.25</b>	<b>\$19.95</b>
Manufacturer: Part #: Roll size: Sheets per roll Rolls per case Product above will fit Georgia Pacific Dispenser #59209:	Mfg.: Von-Cabay Part #:2750 Roll size:3.45x750' <b>2ply</b> Sheets per roll 12 Rolls per case YES		Mfg.: Sofidel Part #: SOA410051 Roll size: 7.41 x 750' (no response) Sheets per roll 12 Rolls per case YES/NO (no response)	Mfg.: Cascade Part #: B220 Roll size: 3.45x750' 750 Sheets per roll 12 Rolls per case YES	Mfg.: National Tissue Part #: 140570 Roll size: 750 (no response) Sheets per roll 12 Rolls per case YES	Mfg.: Cascades Part #: B220 Roll size: 3 1/2"x750' (no response) Sheets per roll 12 Rolls per case YES/NO (no response)	Mfg.: Bedford Paper Part #: JRT402 Roll size: 3.31" 740' Sheets per roll 12 Rolls per case YES	Mfg.: NPS Part #: WHD19920 Roll size: 1,000' N/A Sheets per roll 12 Rolls per case YES
<b>3. Cascade H170</b> (or equal) Pro Select M, Multi-Fold White Paper Towels recycled content								
<b>FOOT COST</b>	<b>\$0.0044</b>	<b>\$0.0047</b>	<b>\$0.0049025</b>	<b>\$0.004675</b>	<b>\$0.00388</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>\$0.0037375</b>	<b>\$0.0038</b>

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

**Date:** April 3, 2018  
**Bid:** #18-24 Paper Products

Towels are 9.1" x 9.5" (9.1"x3.2" folded size), 250 per pack, 16 packs per case								
<b>TOWEL COST</b>								
<b>CASE COST</b>	<b>\$17.60</b>	<b>\$18.93</b>	<b>\$19.61</b>	<b>\$18.70</b>	<b>\$15.53</b>	<b>\$33.75</b>	<b>\$14.95</b>	<b>\$15.33</b>
Manufacturer: Part #:  Towels per pack Packs per case Product above will fit K/C Dispenser #0990510: Product above will fit Wausau Dispenser #53200:	Mfg.: Von-Cabay Part #: 548W 250 Towels/pack 16 Packs/case YES YES	Mfg.: Central Poly Part #: 200B 250 Towels/pack 16 Packs/case YES YES	Mfg.: Sofidel Part #: SOA410164 250 Towels/pack 16 Packs/case YES YES	Mfg.: Rose Part #: 203R 250 Towels/pack 16 Packs/case YES YES	Mfg.: National Tissue Part #: 100179 250 Towels/pack 16 Packs/case YES YES	Mfg.: Cascades Part #: H170 250 Towels/pack 16 Packs/case YES/NO (no response) YES/NO (no response)	Mfg.: Bedford Paper Part #: MF101 250 Towels/pack 16 Packs/case YES YES	Mfg.: Kruger Part #: KSP1920 334 Towels/pack 12 Packs/case YES YES
<b>4. Cascade H280 (or equal) Pro Select HRT Roll Paper Towel White recycled content.</b> Rolls are 7.8" x 800', 6 rolls per case								
<b>FOOT COST</b>	<b>\$0.0046875</b>	<b>\$0.00495</b>	<b>\$0.0263</b>	<b>\$0.29212</b>	<b>\$0.00431</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>\$0.004427</b>	<b>\$0.0042</b>
<b>CASE COST</b>	<b>\$22.50</b>	<b>\$23.77</b>	<b>\$21.05</b>	<b>\$23.37</b>	<b>\$20.69</b>	<b>\$32.40</b>	<b>\$21.25</b>	<b>\$20.50</b>
Manufacturer: Part #: Roll size Rolls per case Product above will fit G/P Dispenser #54388:	Mfg.: Von-Cabay Part #: 880-B 7.9 x 800 Roll size 6 Rolls/case YES	Mfg.: Marcai Part #: P70806 800' Roll size 6 Rolls/case YES	Mfg.: Sofidel Part #: SOA410816 8 x 800' Roll size 6 Rolls/case YES	Mfg.: Rose Part #: A210CS 800' Roll size 6 Rolls/case YES	Mfg.: National Tissue Part #: 337194 7-7/8 x 800 Roll Size 6 Rolls/case YES/NO (no response)	Mfg.: Cascades Part #: H280 7 7/8"x800ft Roll Size 6 Rolls/case YES/NO (no response)	Mfg.: NPS Corp Part #: 30300 8"x800' Roll size 6 Rolls/case YES	Mfg.: Kruger Part #: 1950 800' Roll size 6 Rolls/case YES
<b>5. Kimberly-Clark 07410 (or equal) Personal Seat Covers 1/2 fold, 125 sheets per pack, 24 packs per case</b>								
<b>SEAT COVER COST</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$0.0233</b>	<b>\$0.0291</b>	<b>\$0.01075</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>\$0.026</b>	<b>\$0.002</b>
<b>CASE COST</b>			<b>\$69.90</b>	<b>\$87.30</b>	<b>\$32.24</b>	<b>\$148.50</b>	<b>\$78.00</b>	<b>\$31.00</b>
Manufacturer: Part #: Sheets per pack Packs per case			Mfg.: Kimberly Clark Part #: KCC07410CT 125 Sheets per pack 24 Packs per case	Mfg.: Kimberly Clark Part #: 07410 125 Sheets per pack 24 Packs per case YES	Mfg.: Kimberly Clark Part #: 114399 125 Sheets per pack 24 Packs per case	Mfg.: Kimberly Clark Part #: 07410 __Sheets per pack 24 Packs per case YES/NO (no response)	Mfg.: Kimberly Clark Part #: 07410 125 Sheets per pack 24 Packs per case YES	Mfg.: Hospeco Part #: HOS DS5000 250 Sheets per pack 20 Packs per case <b>NO</b>

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

**Date:** April 3, 2018  
**Bid:** #18-24 Paper Products

Product above will fit K/C Dispenser #0950620:			YES/NO ( <i>no response</i> )		YES/NO ( <i>no response</i> )			
<b>6. Kimberly-Clark 05812</b> (or equal) Wypall L30 EconoMizer Wiper White, ¼ fold 90 units per pack, 12 packs per case								
<b>TOWEL/UNIT COST</b>	<b>\$0.03188</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$0.0387</b>	<b>\$0.03694</b>	<b>\$0.02836</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>\$0.0324</b>	<b>\$0.0425</b>
<b>CASE COST</b>	<b>\$28.70</b>		<b>\$41.82</b>	<b>\$39.90</b>	<b>\$30.63</b>	<b>\$74.25</b>	<b>\$35.00</b>	<b>\$46.00</b>
Manufacturer: Part #: Towels per pack Packs per case	Mfg.: Von-Cabay Part #: S900 50 Towels per pack 18 Packs per case (900 towels)		Mfg.: Kimberly Clark Part #: KCC05812 90 Towels per pack 12 Packs per case	Mfg.: Sellars Part #: 2010001 90 Towels per pack 12 Packs per case	Mfg.: Kimberly Clark Part #: 114203 90 Towels per pack 12 Packs per case	Mfg.: Kimberly Clark Part #: 05812 90 Towels per pack 12 Packs per case	Mfg.: Cascades Pro Part #: W420 60 Towels per pack 18 Packs per case	Mfg.: Sellars Part #: SVS2010001 135 Towels per pack 8 Packs per case
<b>7. Kimberly-Clark 03086</b> (or equal) Wypall L30 Wiper, pop-up box, Towel is 10" x 9.8", 120 units per box, 10 boxes per case								
<b>TOWEL COST</b>	<b>\$0.03944</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$0.0495</b>	<b>\$0.04011</b>	<b>\$0.044225</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>\$0.03678</b>	<b>\$0.0453</b>
<b>CASE COST</b>	<b>\$35.50</b>		<b>\$59.42</b>	<b>\$43.32</b>	<b>\$53.07</b>	<b>\$94.50</b>	<b>\$48.55</b>	<b>\$49.00</b>
Manufacturer: Part #: Towels per box Boxes per case	Mfg.: Von-Cabay Part #: S901 100 Towels per box 9 Boxes per case		Mfg.: Kimberly Clark Part #: KCC03086 120 Towels per box 10 Boxes per case	Mfg.: Sellars Part #: 2020002 135 Towels per box 8 Boxes per case	Mfg.: Kimberly Clark Part #: 114057 120 Towels per box 10 Boxes per case	Mfg.: Kimberly Clark Part #: 03086 120 Towels per box 10 Boxes per case	Mfg.: Cascades Pro Part #: W431 110 Towels per box 12 Boxes per case	Mfg.: Sellars Part #: SVS2010002 90 Towels per box 12 Boxes per case
<b>8. Kimberly-Clark 05841</b> (or equal) Wypall L30 Jumbo roll, Towel is 12.4" x 13.3", 950 sheets per roll, 1 roll per case								
<b>TOWEL/SHEET COST</b>	<b>\$0.028947</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$0.0487</b>	<b>\$0.03168</b>	<b>\$0.03181</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>\$0.0363</b>	<b>\$0.038</b>
<b>CASE COST</b>	<b>\$27.50</b>		<b>\$46.29</b>	<b>\$30.10</b>	<b>\$30.22</b>	<b>\$67.50</b>	<b>\$34.50</b>	<b>\$37.00</b>
Manufacturer: Part #: Sheets per roll Rolls per case	Mfg.: Von-Cabay Part #: S902 950 Sheets per roll 1 Roll per case		Mfg.: Kimberly Clark Part #: KCC05841 950 Sheets per roll 1 Roll per case	Mfg.: Sellars Part #: 2030001 950 Sheets per roll 1 Roll per case	Mfg.: Kimberly Clark Part #: 114205 950 Sheets per roll 1 Roll per case	Mfg.: Kimberly Clark Part #: 05841 950 Sheets per roll 1 Roll per case	Mfg.: Sellars Part #: 2030001 950 Sheets per roll 1 Roll per case	Mfg.: Sellar Part #: SVS2030001 950 Sheets per roll 1 Roll per case

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

**Date:** April 3, 2018  
**Bid:** #18-24 Paper Products

<b>9. Kimberly-Clark 80596</b> (or equal) Wypall Jumbo roll Portable Dispenser								
<b>DISPENSER</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>FREE</b>	<b>\$35.00</b>	<b>\$25.00</b>	<b>\$74.25</b>	<b>\$25.00</b>	<b>\$45.00</b>
Manufacturer: Part #:			Mfg.: Kimberly Clark Part #: KCC80596	Mfg.: Sellars Part #: 99911	Mfg.: Kimberly Clark Part #: 114074	Mfg.: Kimberly Clark Part #: 80596	Mfg.: Kimberly Clark Part #: 80596	Mfg.: Sellars Part #: SVS99911
<b>10. Kimberly-Clark 80597</b> (or equal) Wypall Jumbo roll Wall mount Dispenser								
<b>DISPENSER</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>FREE</b>	<b>\$27.00</b>	<b>\$23.91</b>	<b>\$3.38</b>	<b>\$25.00</b>	<b>\$40.00</b>
Manufacturer: Part #:			Mfg.: Kimberly Clark Part #: KCC80597	Mfg.: Kimberly Clark Part #: 80579	Part #: 114418	Mfg.: Kimberly Clark Part #: 80579	Mfg.: Kimberly Clark Part #: 80579	Mfg.: Sellars Part #: SVS99914
Exceptions	-----	Item 1: 4.1" x 3.2" Delivery within 14 business days ARO	-----	Pricing is effective 12/1/18. Any increases we will provide documentation with percentage from our suppliers.	No	-----	-----	-----

Sent to 9 potential bidders. Submittals received from 8.