

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/30/2015
Bid/RFP: 15-90 Disposable Gloves

| | | | | | | | |
|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|-------------|---------------------------------------------------------------------|------|-----------------------|------|------------------------|------|
| Vendor City/State | | UNIFIRST FIRST AID dba GREEN GUARD FIRST AID ST LOUIS MO | | | | | |
| Detailed Spec Sheet & SAMPLES: One (1) box for each glove style, or bag of 4 gloves, offered is MANDATORY | | | | | | | |
| Original Signature (copied, faxed, rubberstamped will be disqualified). | | Non Responsive/Non Responsible | | | | | |
| All Mandatory Pages. | | | | | | | |
| Detail Manufacturer Specification Sheet showing exact thickness of each glove | | Changed our specifications | | | | | |
| Samples of each glove (Package of 4 or Box of 100) clearly marked | | No Samples submitted | | | | | |
| Bid On page. | | | | | | | |
| | | Year I | | Option Year II | | Option Year III | |
| | | December 1, 2015 | | December 1, 2016 | | December 1, 2017 | |
| | | November 30, 2016 | | November 30, 2017 | | November 30, 2018 | |
| Description | Size | | | | | | |
| Section I | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Latex, Powder Free 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | | | | | | |
| | XLG | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |
| Section II | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | | | | | | |
| | XLG | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |
| Section III | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | | | | | | |
| | XLG | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |
| Section IV | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | | | | | | |
| | XLG | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |
| Section V | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil - Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | | | | | | |
| | XLG - 3XL | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |
| Section VI | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | M-XLG | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |

Sent to **12** potential bidders. Submittals received from **14**.

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/30/2015
Bid/RFP: 15-90 Disposable Gloves

| Vendor City/State | CPI DIVISIONS WEST CONCORD MN | | | | | | |
|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|----------------------------------|---------|-----------------------|-----|------------------------|-----|------|
| Detailed Spec Sheet & SAMPLES: One (1) box for each glove style, or bag of 4 gloves, offered is MANDATORY | | | | | | | |
| Original Signature (copied, faxed, rubberstamped will be disqualified). | YES | | | | | | |
| All Mandatory Pages. | YES | | | | | | |
| Detail Manufacturer Specification Sheet showing exact thickness of each glove | YES | | | | | | |
| Samples of each glove (Package of 4 or Box of 100) clearly marked | YES | | | | | | |
| Bid On page. | YES | | | | | | |
| | Year I | | Option Year II | | Option Year III | | |
| | December 1, 2015 | | December 1, 2016 | | December 1, 2017 | | |
| | November 30, 2016 | | November 30, 2017 | | November 30, 2018 | | |
| Description | Size | | | | | | |
| Section I | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Latex, Powder Free 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$10.10 | \$9.70 | | | | |
| | XLG | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |
| Section II | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | | | | | | |
| | XLG | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |
| Section III | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$7.15 | \$6.75 | | | | |
| | XLG | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |
| Section IV | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | | | | | | |
| | XLG | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |
| Section V | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil - Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$10.95 | \$10.55 | | | | |
| | XLG - 3XL | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |
| Section VI | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | M-XLG | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |

Sent to 12 potential bidders. Submittals received from 14.

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/30/2015
Bid/RFP: 15-90 Disposable Gloves

| | | | | | | | |
|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|----------------------------------------|------------------|-----------------------|------------------|------------------------|------------------|---------|
| Vendor City/State | ELKHORN CHEMICAL ELKHORN WI | | | | | | |
| Detailed Spec Sheet & SAMPLES: One (1) box for each glove style, or bag of 4 gloves, offered is MANDATORY | | | | | | | |
| Original Signature (copied, faxed, rubberstamped will be disqualified). | YES | | | | | | |
| All Mandatory Pages. | YES | | | | | | |
| Detail Manufacturer Specification Sheet showing exact thickness of each glove | YES | | | | | | |
| Samples of each glove (Package of 4 or Box of 100) clearly marked | YES | | | | | | |
| Bid On page. | YES | | | | | | |
| | Year I | | Option Year II | | Option Year III | | |
| | December 1, 2015 | | December 1, 2016 | | December 1, 2017 | | |
| | November 30, 2016 | | November 30, 2017 | | November 30, 2018 | | |
| Description | Size | | | | | | |
| Section I | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Latex, Powder Free 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$5.50 | \$55.00 | \$5.75 | \$57.50 | \$6.00 | \$60.00 |
| | XLG | \$5.50 | \$55.00 | \$5.75 | \$57.50 | \$6.00 | \$60.00 |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Impact/8622 | | Impact/8622 | | Impact/8622 | |
| Section II | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | | | | | | |
| | XLG | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |
| Section III | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$2.95 | \$29.50 | \$3.10 | \$31.00 | \$3.25 | \$32.50 |
| | XLG | \$2.95 | \$29.50 | \$3.10 | \$31.00 | \$3.25 | \$32.50 |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Impact/8607 | | Impact/8607 | | Impact/8607 | |
| Section IV | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | | | | | | |
| | XLG | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |
| Section V | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil - Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$8.95 | \$89.50 | \$9.25 | \$92.50 | \$9.50 | \$95.00 |
| | XLG – 3XL | \$8.95 | \$89.50 | \$9.25 | \$92.50 | \$9.50 | \$95.00 |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | SAS Raven/RAVENL | | SAS Raven/RAVENL | | SAS Raven/RAVENL | |
| Section VI | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | M-XLG | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |

Sent to 12 potential bidders. Submittals received from 14.

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/30/2015
Bid/RFP: 15-90 Disposable Gloves

| | | | | | | | |
|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|-------------|------------------------------------------------------------------------------|---------|-----------------------|--------|------------------------|--------|
| Vendor City/State | | HENRY SCHEIN MEDICAL a DIVISION OF HENRY SCHEIN MELVILLE NY | | | | | |
| Detailed Spec Sheet & SAMPLES: One (1) box for each glove style, or bag of 4 gloves, offered is MANDATORY | | | | | | | |
| Original Signature (copied, faxed, rubberstamped will be disqualified). | | YES | | | | | |
| All Mandatory Pages. | | YES | | | | | |
| Detail Manufacturer Specification Sheet showing exact thickness of each glove | | YES | | | | | |
| Samples of each glove (Package of 4 or Box of 100) clearly marked | | YES | | | | | |
| Bid On page. | | YES | | | | | |
| | | Year I | | Option Year II | | Option Year III | |
| | | December 1, 2015 | | December 1, 2016 | | December 1, 2017 | |
| | | November 30, 2016 | | November 30, 2017 | | November 30, 2018 | |
| Description | Size | | | | | | |
| Section I | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Latex, Powder Free 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$3.91 | \$39.10 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| | XLG | \$3.91 | \$39.10 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Henry Schein Inc | | | | | |
| Section II | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$3.63 | \$36.30 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| | XLG | \$3.63 | \$36.30 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Dash Medical | | | | | |
| Section III | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$2.39 | \$23.90 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| | XLG | \$2.39 | \$23.90 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Tradex | | | | | |
| Section IV | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$5.13 | \$51.30 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| | XLG | \$5.13 | \$51.30 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | S2S Global | | | | | |
| Section V | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil - Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$7.67 | \$76.70 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| | XLG - 3XL | \$7.67 | \$76.70 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Microflex | | | | | |
| Section VI | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | M-XLG | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| | | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |

*Typical delivery time for all items is next day, max of 3 days

Sent to 12 potential bidders. Submittals received from 14.

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/30/2015
Bid/RFP: 15-90 Disposable Gloves

| | | | | | | | |
|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|---------------------------------|----------------|-----------------------|----------------|------------------------|----------------|----------|
| Vendor City/State | HP PRODUCTS ALSIP IL | | | | | | |
| Detailed Spec Sheet & SAMPLES: One (1) box for each glove style, or bag of 4 gloves, offered is MANDATORY | | | | | | | |
| Original Signature (copied, faxed, rubberstamped will be disqualified). | YES | | | | | | |
| All Mandatory Pages. | YES | | | | | | |
| Detail Manufacturer Specification Sheet showing exact thickness of each glove | YES | | | | | | |
| Samples of each glove (Package of 4 or Box of 100) clearly marked | YES | | | | | | |
| Bid On page. | YES | | | | | | |
| | Year I | | Option Year II | | Option Year III | | |
| | December 1, 2015 | | December 1, 2016 | | December 1, 2017 | | |
| | November 30, 2016 | | November 30, 2017 | | November 30, 2018 | | |
| Description | Size | | | | | | |
| Section I | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Latex, Powder Free 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$5.00 | \$44.20 | \$5.32 | \$47.02 | \$5.66 | \$50.02 |
| | XLG | \$5.00 | \$44.20 | \$5.32 | \$47.02 | \$5.66 | \$50.02 |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Liberty/2800ML | | Liberty/2800ML | | Liberty/2800ML | |
| Section II | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$4.65 | \$41.13 | \$4.95 | \$45.49 | \$5.26 | \$48.40 |
| | XLG | \$4.65 | \$41.13 | \$4.95 | \$45.49 | \$5.26 | \$48.40 |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Liberty/2810ML | | Liberty/2810ML | | Liberty/2810ML | |
| Section III | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$3.20 | \$27.24 | \$3.40 | \$30.05 | \$3.62 | \$31.96 |
| | XLG | \$3.20 | \$27.24 | \$3.40 | \$30.05 | \$3.62 | \$31.96 |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Liberty/2910 | | Liberty/2910 | | Liberty/2910 | |
| Section IV | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$12.39 | \$109.51 | \$13.18 | \$116.50 | \$14.02 | \$123.94 |
| | XLG | \$12.39 | \$109.51 | \$13.18 | \$116.50 | \$14.02 | \$123.94 |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | KC/K500 | | KC/K500 | | KC/K500 | |
| Section V | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil - Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$8.89 | \$103.31 | \$9.45 | \$83.59 | \$10.06 | \$88.93 |
| | XLG - 3XL | \$8.89 | \$103.31 | \$9.45 | \$83.59 | \$10.06 | \$88.93 |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Liberty/2016BK | | Liberty/2016BK | | Liberty/2016BK | |
| Section VI | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | M-XLG | \$11.69 | \$103.31 | \$12.43 | \$109.91 | \$9.35 | \$116.92 |
| | | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |

Sent to 12 potential bidders. Submittals received from 14.

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/30/2015
Bid/RFP: 15-90 Disposable Gloves

| | | | | | | | |
|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|----------------------------------------------|-----------------|-----------------------|-----------------|------------------------|-----------------|---------|
| Vendor City/State | INTERBORO PACKAGING MONTGOMERY NY | | | | | | |
| Detailed Spec Sheet & SAMPLES: One (1) box for each glove style, or bag of 4 gloves, offered is MANDATORY | | | | | | | |
| Original Signature (copied, faxed, rubberstamped will be disqualified). | YES | | | | | | |
| All Mandatory Pages. | YES | | | | | | |
| Detail Manufacturer Specification Sheet showing exact thickness of each glove | YES | | | | | | |
| Samples of each glove (Package of 4 or Box of 100) clearly marked | YES | | | | | | |
| Bid On page. | YES | | | | | | |
| | Year I | | Option Year II | | Option Year III | | |
| | December 1, 2015 | | December 1, 2016 | | December 1, 2017 | | |
| | November 30, 2016 | | November 30, 2017 | | November 30, 2018 | | |
| Description | Size | | | | | | |
| Section I | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Latex, Powder Free 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$4.20 | \$42.00 | \$4.83 | \$48.30 | \$5.55 | \$55.55 |
| | XLG | \$4.20 | \$42.00 | \$4.83 | \$48.30 | \$5.55 | \$55.55 |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Med Pride/Elara | | Med Pride/Elara | | Med Pride/Elara | |
| Section II | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$3.90 | \$39.00 | \$4.49 | \$44.85 | \$5.16 | \$51.58 |
| | XLG | \$3.90 | \$39.00 | \$4.49 | \$44.85 | \$5.16 | \$51.58 |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Med Pride/Elara | | Med Pride/Elara | | Med Pride/Elara | |
| Section III | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$2.90 | \$29.00 | \$3.34 | \$33.35 | \$3.84 | \$38.35 |
| | XLG | \$2.90 | \$29.00 | \$3.34 | \$33.35 | \$3.84 | \$38.35 |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Med Pride/Elara | | Med Pride/Elara | | Med Pride/Elara | |
| Section IV | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$4.20 | \$42.00 | \$4.83 | \$48.30 | \$5.55 | \$55.55 |
| | XLG | \$4.20 | \$42.00 | \$4.83 | \$48.30 | \$5.55 | \$55.55 |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Med Pride/Elara | | Med Pride/Elara | | Med Pride/Elara | |
| Section V | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil - Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$4.90 | \$49.00 | \$5.64 | \$56.35 | \$6.48 | \$64.80 |
| | XLG - 3XL | \$4.90 | \$49.00 | \$5.64 | \$56.35 | \$6.48 | \$64.80 |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Med Pride/Elara | | Med Pride/Elara | | Med Pride/Elara | |
| Section VI | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | M-XLG | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |

Sent to 12 potential bidders. Submittals received from 14.

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/30/2015
Bid/RFP: 15-90 Disposable Gloves

| | | | | | | | |
|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|-------------------------------------------------------|---------------------------------|------------------------|-----|------------------------|-----|------|
| Vendor City/State | MIDWEST MEDICAL SUPPLY (MMS) EARTH CITY MO | | | | | | |
| Detailed Spec Sheet & SAMPLES: One (1) box for each glove style, or bag of 4 gloves, offered is MANDATORY | | | | | | | |
| Original Signature (copied, faxed, rubberstamped will be disqualified). | YES | | | | | | |
| All Mandatory Pages. | YES | | | | | | |
| Detail Manufacturer Specification Sheet showing exact thickness of each glove | YES | | | | | | |
| Samples of each glove (Package of 4 or Box of 100) clearly marked | YES | | | | | | |
| Bid On page. | YES | | | | | | |
| | Year I | | Option Year II | | Option Year III | | |
| | December 1, 2015 | | December 1, 2016 | | December 1, 2017 | | |
| | November 30, 2016 | | November 30, 2017 | | November 30, 2018 | | |
| Description | Size | | | | | | |
| Section I | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Latex, Powder Free 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$5.02 | \$50.20 | | | | |
| | XLG | \$5.02 | \$50.20 | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | IHC | | | | | |
| Section II | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$4.90 | \$4.90 | | | | |
| | XLG | \$4.90 | \$4.90 | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | IHC | | | | | |
| Section III | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$3.18 | \$31.80 | | | | |
| | XLG | \$3.18 | \$31.80 | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | IHC | | | | | |
| Section IV | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$9.69 | \$96.90 | | | | |
| | XLG | \$9.69 | \$96.90 | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Digitcare | | | | | |
| Section V | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil - Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$5.23 | \$52.30 | | | | |
| | XLG – 3XL | \$5.23 | \$52.30 | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | IHC | | | | | |
| Section VI | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | M-XLG | \$15.58 Sold 50/bx \$7.79 | \$155.80 \$77.90/ca | | | | |
| | | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | IHC | | | | | |

Sent to 12 potential bidders. Submittals received from 14.

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/30/2015
Bid/RFP: 15-90 Disposable Gloves

| | | | | | | | |
|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|----------------------------------------|-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|------|-----------------------|------|------------------------|------|
| Vendor City/State | MOORE MEDICAL FARMINGTON CT | | | | | | |
| Detailed Spec Sheet & SAMPLES: One (1) box for each glove style, or bag of 4 gloves, offered is MANDATORY | | | | | | | |
| Original Signature (copied, faxed, rubberstamped will be disqualified). | | Non Responsive/Non Responsible | | | | | |
| All Mandatory Pages. | | | | | | | |
| Detail Manufacturer Specification Sheet showing exact thickness of each glove | | Sent in Bid Exception/Clarification Page stating that Moore Medical cannot agree to the | | | | | |
| Samples of each glove (Package of 4 or Box of 100) clearly marked | | Insurance terms as per the Bid documents | | | | | |
| Bid On page. | | | | | | | |
| | | Year I | | Option Year II | | Option Year III | |
| | | December 1, 2015 | | December 1, 2016 | | December 1, 2017 | |
| | | November 30, 2016 | | November 30, 2017 | | November 30, 2018 | |
| Description | Size | | | | | | |
| Section I | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Latex, Powder Free 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | | | | | | |
| | XLG | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |
| Section II | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | | | | | | |
| | XLG | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |
| Section III | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | | | | | | |
| | XLG | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |
| Section IV | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | | | | | | |
| | XLG | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |
| Section V | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil - Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | | | | | | |
| | XLG – 3XL | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |
| Section VI | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | M-XLG | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |

Sent to 12 potential bidders. Submittals received from 14.

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/30/2015
Bid/RFP: 15-90 Disposable Gloves

| | | | | | | | |
|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|-----------------------------------------|---------------------|-----------------------|-----|------------------------|-----|------|
| Vendor City/State | MEDI EXPRESS INC GARFIELD NJ | | | | | | |
| Detailed Spec Sheet & SAMPLES: One (1) box for each glove style, or bag of 4 gloves, offered is MANDATORY | | | | | | | |
| Original Signature (copied, faxed, rubberstamped will be disqualified). | YES | | | | | | |
| All Mandatory Pages. | YES | | | | | | |
| Detail Manufacturer Specification Sheet showing exact thickness of each glove | YES | | | | | | |
| Samples of each glove (Package of 4 or Box of 100) clearly marked | YES | | | | | | |
| Bid On page. | YES | | | | | | |
| | Year I | | Option Year II | | Option Year III | | |
| | December 1, 2015 | | December 1, 2016 | | December 1, 2017 | | |
| | November 30, 2016 | | November 30, 2017 | | November 30, 2018 | | |
| Description | Size | | | | | | |
| Section I | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Latex, Powder Free 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$4.60 | \$46.00 | | | | |
| | XLG | \$4.60 | \$46.00 | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Medi-Soft/Koon Seng | | | | | |
| Section II | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | | | | | | |
| | XLG | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |
| Section III | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$2.75 | \$27.50 | | | | |
| | XLG | \$2.75 | \$27.50 | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Medi-Soft/Ruberex | | | | | |
| Section IV | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | | | | | | |
| | XLG | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |
| Section V | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil - Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | | | | | | |
| | XLG – 3XL | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |
| Section VI | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | M-XLG | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |

Sent to 12 potential bidders. Submittals received from 14.

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/30/2015
Bid/RFP: 15-90 Disposable Gloves

| Vendor City/State | PROFESSIONAL MEDICAL & SURGICAL SUPPLY NEW LENOX IL | | | | | | |
|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|--------------------------------------------------------|----------------------|-----------------------|----------------------|------------------------|----------------------|---------|
| Detailed Spec Sheet & SAMPLES: One (1) box for each glove style, or bag of 4 gloves, offered is MANDATORY | | | | | | | |
| Original Signature (copied, faxed, rubberstamped will be disqualified). | YES | | | | | | |
| All Mandatory Pages. | YES | | | | | | |
| Detail Manufacturer Specification Sheet showing exact thickness of each glove | YES | | | | | | |
| Samples of each glove (Package of 4 or Box of 100) clearly marked | YES | | | | | | |
| Bid On page. | YES | | | | | | |
| | Year I | | Option Year II | | Option Year III | | |
| | December 1, 2015 | | December 1, 2016 | | December 1, 2017 | | |
| | November 30, 2016 | | November 30, 2017 | | November 30, 2018 | | |
| Description | Size | | | | | | |
| Section I | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Latex, Powder Free 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$3.70 | \$37.00 | \$3.70 | \$37.00 | \$3.81 | \$38.11 |
| | XLG | \$3.70 | \$37.00 | \$3.70 | \$37.00 | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | International Direct | | International Direct | | International Direct | |
| Section II | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | | | | | | |
| | XLG | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |
| Section III | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$2.90 | \$29.00 | \$2.90 | \$29.00 | \$2.99 | \$29.87 |
| | XLG | \$2.90 | \$29.00 | \$2.90 | \$29.00 | \$2.99 | \$29.87 |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | International Direct | | International Direct | | International Direct | |
| Section IV | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$3.15 | \$31.50 | \$3.15 | \$31.50 | \$3.25 | \$32.45 |
| | XLG | \$3.15 | \$31.50 | \$3.15 | \$31.50 | \$3.25 | \$32.45 |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | International Direct | | International Direct | | International Direct | |
| Section V | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil - Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | | | | | | |
| | XLG - 3XL | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |
| Section VI | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | M-XLG | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |

Sent to 12 potential bidders. Submittals received from 14.

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/30/2015
Bid/RFP: 15-90 Disposable Gloves

| | | | | | | | |
|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|------------------------------------|--------------------|-----------------------|--------------------|------------------------|--------------------|---------|
| Vendor City/State | QUADMED JACKSONVILLE FL | | | | | | |
| Detailed Spec Sheet & SAMPLES: One (1) box for each glove style, or bag of 4 gloves, offered is MANDATORY | | | | | | | |
| Original Signature (copied, faxed, rubberstamped will be disqualified). | YES | | | | | | |
| All Mandatory Pages. | YES | | | | | | |
| Detail Manufacturer Specification Sheet showing exact thickness of each glove | YES | | | | | | |
| Samples of each glove (Package of 4 or Box of 100) clearly marked | YES | | | | | | |
| Bid On page. | YES | | | | | | |
| | Year I | | Option Year II | | Option Year III | | |
| | December 1, 2015 | | December 1, 2016 | | December 1, 2017 | | |
| | November 30, 2016 | | November 30, 2017 | | November 30, 2018 | | |
| Description | Size | | | | | | |
| Section I | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Latex, Powder Free 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$7.25 | \$72.47 | \$7.63 | \$46.29 | \$8.03 | \$80.30 |
| | XLG | \$7.25 | \$72.47 | \$7.63 | \$46.29 | \$8.03 | \$80.30 |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Optigrip/Digitcare | | Optigrip/Digitcare | | Optigrip/Digitcare | |
| Section II | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | | | | | | |
| | XLG | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |
| Section III | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | | | | | | |
| | XLG | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |
| Section IV | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$6.99 | \$69.88 | \$7.36 | \$73.56 | \$7.74 | \$77.43 |
| | XLG | \$6.99 | \$69.88 | \$7.36 | \$73.56 | \$7.74 | \$77.43 |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Haylord/KC | | Haylord/KC | | Haylord/KC | |
| Section V | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil - Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | | | | | | |
| | XLG - 3XL | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |
| Section VI | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | M-XLG | \$7.78 | \$77.83 | \$8.19 | \$81.93 | \$8.62 | \$86.24 |
| | | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Innovative | | Innovative | | Innovative | |

Sent to 12 potential bidders. Submittals received from 14.

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/30/2015
Bid/RFP: 15-90 Disposable Gloves

| | | | | | | | |
|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|-----------------------------------------|-------------------|-----------------------|-----|------------------------|-----|------|
| Vendor City/State | SAF-T-GLOVE GRAND PRAIRIE TX | | | | | | |
| Detailed Spec Sheet & SAMPLES: One (1) box for each glove style, or bag of 4 gloves, offered is MANDATORY | | | | | | | |
| Original Signature (copied, faxed, rubberstamped will be disqualified). | YES | | | | | | |
| All Mandatory Pages. | YES | | | | | | |
| Detail Manufacturer Specification Sheet showing exact thickness of each glove | YES | | | | | | |
| Samples of each glove (Package of 4 or Box of 100) clearly marked | YES | | | | | | |
| Bid On page. | YES | | | | | | |
| | Year I | | Option Year II | | Option Year III | | |
| | December 1, 2015 | | December 1, 2016 | | December 1, 2017 | | |
| | November 30, 2016 | | November 30, 2017 | | November 30, 2018 | | |
| Description | Size | | | | | | |
| Section I | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Latex, Powder Free 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$7.60 | | | | | |
| | XLG | \$7.60 | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Hercules/8205 | | | | | |
| Section II | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$5.60 | | | | | |
| | XLG | \$5.60 | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Hercules/7205 | | | | | |
| Section III | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$3.65 | | | | | |
| | XLG | \$3.65 | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | SYN-COR GOLD/4060 | | | | | |
| Section IV | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | | | | | | |
| | XLG | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |
| Section V | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil - Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$10.50 | | | | | |
| | XLG – 3XL | \$10.50 | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | RAVEN/66518 | | | | | |
| Section VI | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | M-XLG | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | |

Sent to 12 potential bidders. Submittals received from 14.

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/30/2015
Bid/RFP: 15-90 Disposable Gloves

| | | | | | | | |
|---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|------------------------------------------------|-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|-----------------------|-------------------|------------------------|-------------------|---------|
| Vendor City/State | SHEPARD MEDICAL PRODUCTS ROSELLE IL | | | | | | |
| Detailed Spec Sheet & SAMPLES: One (1) box for each glove style, or bag of 4 gloves, offered is MANDATORY | | | | | | | |
| Original Signature (copied, faxed, rubberstamped will be disqualified). | YES | | | | | | |
| All Mandatory Pages. | YES | | | | | | |
| Detail Manufacturer Specification Sheet showing exact thickness of each glove | YES | | | | | | |
| Samples of each glove (Package of 4 or Box of 100) clearly marked | YES | | | | | | |
| Bid On page. | YES | | | | | | |
| | Year I | | Option Year II | | Option Year III | | |
| | December 1, 2015 | | December 1, 2016 | | December 1, 2017 | | |
| | November 30, 2016 | | November 30, 2017 | | November 30, 2018 | | |
| Description | Size | | | | | | |
| Section I | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Latex, Powder Free 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$4.09 | \$40.90 | \$4.17 | \$41.70 | \$4.25 | \$42.50 |
| | XLG | \$4.09 | \$40.90 | \$4.17 | \$41.70 | \$4.25 | \$42.50 |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Caremates | | Caremates | | Caremates | |
| Section II | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$3.65 | \$36.50 | \$3.72 | \$37.20 | \$3.79 | \$37.90 |
| | XLG | \$3.65 | \$36.50 | \$3.72 | \$37.20 | \$3.79 | \$37.90 |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Caremates | | Caremates | | Caremates | |
| Section III | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$2.86 | \$28.55 | \$2.91 | \$29.10 | \$2.97 | \$29.70 |
| | XLG | \$2.86 | \$28.55 | \$2.91 | \$29.10 | \$2.97 | \$29.70 |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Caremates | | Caremates | | Caremates | |
| Section IV | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$9.20 Per 100 | \$92.00 | \$9.20 Per 100 | \$92.00 | \$9.20 Per 100 | \$92.00 |
| | XLG | \$9.20 Per 100 | \$92.00 | \$9.20 Per 100 | \$92.00 | \$9.20 Per 100 | \$92.00 |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Ultimates *This product is 8mil and 11 ½ glove. Quoted price = \$92.00 for 1000 gloves = \$9.20/100 ct Product comes in 50ct so there are 2 boxes of 50ct = \$9.20 total for 100 gloves | | | | | |
| Section V | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil - Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | SM-LG | \$4.80 | \$48.00 | \$4.80 | \$48.00 | \$4.80 | \$48.00 |
| | XLG – 3XL | \$4.80 | \$48.00 | \$4.80 | \$48.00 | \$4.80 | \$48.00 |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Workmates | | Workmates | | Workmates | |
| Section VI | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | M-XLG | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Ultimates *This product is 15mil and 12” glove. Quoted price is | | | | | |
| SOLD BY CASES ONLY | | | | | | | |

Sent to 12 potential bidders. Submittals received from 14.

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/30/2015
 Bid/RFP: 15-90 Disposable Gloves

| | | | | | | | | |
|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|-------------------------------------------|------------------------|-------------------|---------|-----------------------|------|------------------------|------|
| Vendor City/State | WTF MARKETING NEW BRUNSWICK NJ | | | | | | | |
| Detailed Spec Sheet & SAMPLES: One (1) box for each glove style, or bag of 4 gloves, offered is MANDATORY | | | | | | | | |
| Original Signature (copied, faxed, rubberstamped will be disqualified). | | | YES | | | | | |
| All Mandatory Pages. | | | YES | | | | | |
| Detail Manufacturer Specification Sheet showing exact thickness of each glove | | | YES | | | | | |
| Samples of each glove (Package of 4 or Box of 100) clearly marked | | | YES | | | | | |
| Bid On page. | | | YES | | | | | |
| | | | Year I | | Option Year II | | Option Year III | |
| | | | December 1, 2015 | | December 1, 2016 | | December 1, 2017 | |
| | | | November 30, 2016 | | November 30, 2017 | | November 30, 2018 | |
| Description | | Size | | | | | | |
| Section I | | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Latex, Powder Free 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | | SM-LG | \$4.74 | \$47.40 | | | | |
| | | XLG | \$4.74 | \$47.40 | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Glove Plus/Ammex GPPFT | | | | | | |
| Section II | | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | | SM-LG | \$4.38 | \$43.80 | | | | |
| | | XLG | \$4.38 | \$43.80 | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Glove Plus/Ammex GP | | | | | | |
| Section III | | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | | SM-LG | \$2.69 | \$26.90 | | | | |
| | | XLG | \$2.69 | \$26.90 | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Ammex VPF | | | | | | |
| Section IV | | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | | SM-LG | No Bid | | | | | |
| | | XLG | No Bid | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | | |
| Section V | | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil - Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | | SM-LG | \$5.70 | \$57.00 | | | | |
| | | XLG – 3XL | \$5.70 | \$57.00 | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | Glove Plus/Ammex GPNB | | | | | | |
| Section VI | | | Box | Case | Box | Case | Box | Case |
| Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant 100/dispenser box. 10 bx/case (No Substitutions) | | M-XLG | No Bid | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | |
| Brand/Mfg #: | | | | | | | | |

Sent to 12 potential bidders. Submittals received from 14.