

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: OCT 17, 2017
 Bid: 17-67 Sheriff Duty & Training Ammunition

	VENDOR				VENDOR			
NAME CITY/STATE	KIESLER POLIC SUPPLY INC JEFFERSONVILLE IN				MATRE ARMS & AMMUNITION HAMILTON OH			
ORIGINAL SIGNATURE	Yes				Yes			
MANDATORY PAGES	Yes				Yes			
Section 1 - Duty Handgun Ammunition	Year 1 12/1/17- 11/30/18	Year 2 12/1/18- 11/30/19	Year 3 (optional) 12/1/19- 11/30/20	Year 4 (optional) 12/1/20- 11/30/21	Year 1 12/1/17- 11/30/18	Year 2 12/1/18-11/30/19	Year 3 (optional) 12/1/19- 11/30/20	Year 4 (optional) 12/1/20- 11/30/21
9mm, Luger, 124gr HydraShok	\$272.55 1000/case	\$277.29 1000/case	TBD	TBD	\$203.00 500/case 135gr Hornaday Critical Duty	\$213.00 500/case 135gr Hornaday Critical Duty	No Bid	No Bid
.40 S&W 165gr HydraShok	\$304.75 1000/case	\$310.05 1000/case	TBD	TBD	\$203.00 500/case 175gr Hornaday Critical Duty	\$203.00 500/case 175gr Hornaday Critical Duty	No Bid	No Bid
.45 ACP, 230gr HydraShok	\$356.50 1000/case	\$362.70 1000/case	TBD	TBD	\$233.00 500/case Hornaday 220+P	\$250.00 500/case Hornaday 220+P	No Bid	No Bid
Section 2 – Duty Rifle Ammunition								
5.56 (.223) 77gr Boat Tail Hollow Point	\$126.50 500/case	\$128.70 500/case	TBD	TBD	\$118.00 200/case	\$118.00 200/case	No Bid	No Bid
.308 168gr Boat Tail Hollow Point Hornaday TAP	\$142.60 500/case	\$145.08 500/case	TBD	TBD	\$189.00	\$189.00	No Bid	No Bid
Section 3 – Federal Ball Type Rifle Ammunition								
55gr FMJ Boat Tail	\$162.40 500/case	\$165.30 500/case	TBD	TBD	\$135.00	\$135.00	No Bid	No Bid
Section 4 - Simunition								
9mm FOF Green Marking Round	\$255.00 500/case	\$255.00 500/case	TBD	TBD	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: OCT 17, 2017
Bid: 17-67 Sheriff Duty & Training Ammunition

Section 5 - GREEN ELITE – Rifle – Copper Tin Lead Free Projectile – Non-Lead Primer								
.223 REM P/N 233-045CTNT	\$525.96 1000/case	\$525.96 1000/case	TBD	TBD	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
.223 REM P/N 233-645HVCTNS	\$525.96 1000/case	\$525.96 1000/case	TBD	TBD	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
.308 WIN P/N 3089125CTNT	\$873.26 1000/case	\$873.26 1000/case	TBD	TBD	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
.308 WIN P/N 125HVCTNT	\$873.26 1000/case	\$873.26 1000/case	TBD	TBD	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section 6 - GREEN ELITE Polymer Lead Free Projectile – Non-Lead Primer								
.223 REM P/N 233-045PNT	\$709.84 1000/case	\$709.84 1000/case	TBD	TBD	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
.223 REM P/N 233-045HVPNT	\$709.84 1000/case	\$709.84 1000/case	TBD	TBD	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
.308 WIN P/N 308-125PNT	\$1010.38 1000/case	\$1010.38 1000/case	TBD	TBD	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
.308 WIN P/N 308-HVPNT	\$1010.38 1000/case	\$1010.38 1000/case	TBD	TBD	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7.62 x 39mm P/N 762-039PNT	\$894.10 1000/case	\$894.10 1000/case	TBD	TBD	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: OCT 17, 2017
Bid: 17-67 Sheriff Duty & Training Ammunition

Section 7 - GREEN ELITE Pistol – Copper Tin Lead Free Projectile – Non-Lead Primer								
.380 Auto FP P/N 380-075CTNT	\$487.69	\$487.69	TBD	TBD	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9mm Luger FP P/N 009-100CTNT	\$464.59	\$464.59	TBD	TBD	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
357 SIG FP P/N 357-100 CTNT	\$560.37	\$560.37	TBD	TBD	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
.40 S&W FP P/N 040-125CTNT	\$559.82	\$559.82	TBD	TBD	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
.45 Auto FP P/N 045-156CTNT	\$631.59	\$631.59	TBD	TBD	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section 8 - GREEN ELITE – Pistol – Polymer Lead Free Projectile – Non-Lead Primer								
.38 Special FP P/N 038-110PNT	\$540.84	\$540.84	TBD	TBD	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
.40 S&W FP P/N 040-125PNT	\$559.82	\$559.82	TBD	TBD	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
.45 Auto FP P/N 045-155PNT	\$631.59	\$631.59	TBD	TBD	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Exceptions	none				none			

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: OCT 17, 2017
 Bid: 17-67 Sheriff Duty & Training Ammunition

VENDOR				
NAME CITY/STATE	STREICHER's INC BUTLER WI			
ORIGINAL SIGNATURE	Yes			
MANDATORY PAGES	Yes			
Section 1 - Duty Handgun Ammunition	Year 1 12/1/17-11/30/18	Year 2 12/1/18-11/30/19	Year 3 (optional) 12/1/19-11/30/20	Year 4 (optional) 12/1/20-11/30/21
9mm, Luger, 124gr HydraShok	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
.40 S&W 165gr HydraShok	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
.45 ACP, 230gr HydraShok	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section 2 - Duty Rifle Ammunition				
5.56 (.223) 77gr Boat Tail Hollow Point	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
.308 168gr Boat Tail Hollow Point Hornaday TAP	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section 3 - Federal Ball Type Rifle Ammunition				
55gr FMJ Boat Tail	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section 4 - Simunition				
9mm FOF Green Marking Round	\$250.63 "Federal Cartridge Force on Force"	\$250.63 "Federal Cartridge Force on Force"	\$258.26 "Federal Cartridge Force on Force"	\$258.26 "Federal Cartridge Force on Force"

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: OCT 17, 2017
Bid: 17-67 Sheriff Duty & Training Ammunition

Section 5 - GREEN ELITE – Rifle – Copper Tin Lead Free Projectile – Non-Lead Primer				
.223 REM P/N 233-045CTNT	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
.223 REM P/N 233-645HVCTNS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
.308 WIN P/N 3089125CTNT	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
.308 WIN P/N 125HVCTNT	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section 6 - GREEN ELITE Polymer Lead Free Projectile – Non-Lead Primer				
.223 REM P/N 233-045PNT	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
.223 REM P/N 233-045HVPNT	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
.308 WIN P/N 308-125PNT	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
.308 WIN P/N 308-HVPNT	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7.62 x 39mm P/N 762-039PNT	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: OCT 17, 2017
Bid: 17-67 Sheriff Duty & Training Ammunition

Section 7 - GREEN ELITE Pistol – Copper Tin Lead Free Projectile – Non-Lead Primer				
.380 Auto FP P/N 380-075CTNT	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9mm Luger FP P/N 009-100CTNT	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
357 SIG FP P/N 357-100 CTNT	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
.40 S&W FP P/N 040-125CTNT	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
.45 Auto FP P/N 045-156CTNT	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section 8 - GREEN ELITE – Pistol – Polymer Lead Free Projectile – Non-Lead Primer				
.38 Special FP P/N 038-110PNT	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
.40 S&W FP P/N 040-125PNT	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
.45 Auto FP P/N 045-155PNT	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Exceptions	Liftgate or inside delivery not included in price			

Sent to 13 potential bidders. Submittals received from .3