
Vendor
City / State

ORGINAL SIGNATURE
MANDATORY PAGES

Year 1 Year 1       Year 2  Year 2 Year 3 Year 3

January 1, 2017 - Senior Discount January 1, 2018 - Senior Discount January 1, 2019 - Senior Discount

December 31, 2017 Quarterly cost (if 
applicable)

December 31, 2018 Quarterly cost (if 
applicable)

December 31, 2019 Quarterly cost (if 
applicable)

95 gallon (approx. size) refuse toter* $94.80 $94.80 $97.64 $97.64 $100.57 $100.57

65 gallon (approx. size) refuse toter* $95.80 $95.80 $98.67 $98.67 $101.63 $101.63

35 gallon (approx. size) refuse toter* $96.80 $96.80 $99.70 $99.70 $102.70 $102.70

By the Bag Option:

Cost per bag no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Quarterly cost for core program services* no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Recycling toter approx. size                               
(CIRCLE TOTER SIZE)                          
(IDENTIFY COLLECTION FREQUENCY)

Sent to 35 potential bidders. Submittals received from 5.

95 gallon (with weekly or every other week collection)        OR     65 gallon (with weekly collection)

65 gallon/weekly

SUMMARY SHEET Date:  9/1/2016 @ 2:00
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept Bid/RFP: BID 16‐72 Residential Waste Hauling

ADVANCED DISPOSAL

Waukegan IL

Yes

yes

OFFICIAL RESULTS



Vendor
City / State

ORGINAL SIGNATURE
MANDATORY PAGES

Year 1 Year 1       Year 2  Year 2 Year 3 Year 3

January 1, 2017 - Senior Discount January 1, 2018 - Senior Discount January 1, 2019 - Senior Discount

December 31, 2017 Quarterly cost (if 
applicable)

December 31, 2018 Quarterly cost (if 
applicable)

December 31, 2019 Quarterly cost (if 
applicable)

95 gallon (approx. size) refuse toter* $59.49 N/A $62.16 N/A $64.95 N/A

65 gallon (approx. size) refuse toter* $57.51 N/A $60.15 N/A $62.88 N/A

35 gallon (approx. size) refuse toter* $55.50 $52.71 $58.14 $55.23 $60.78 $57.74

By the Bag Option:

Cost per bag $3.20 N/A $3.30 N/A $3.40 N/A

Quarterly cost for core program services* $29.40 N/A $30.58 N/A $31.80 N/A

Recycling toter approx. size                               
(CIRCLE TOTER SIZE)                          
(IDENTIFY COLLECTION FREQUENCY)

Sent to 35 potential bidders. Submittals received from 5.

95 gallon (with weekly or every other week collection)        OR     65 gallon (with weekly collection)

95 gallon/every other week

SUMMARY SHEET Date:  9/1/2016 @ 2:00
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept Bid/RFP: BID 16‐72 Residential Waste Hauling

GROOT

Elk Grove Village IL

yes

yes

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS



Vendor
City / State

ORGINAL SIGNATURE
MANDATORY PAGES

Year 1 Year 1       Year 2  Year 2 Year 3 Year 3

January 1, 2017 - Senior Discount January 1, 2018 - Senior Discount January 1, 2019 - Senior Discount

December 31, 2017 Quarterly cost (if 
applicable)

December 31, 2018 Quarterly cost (if 
applicable)

December 31, 2019 Quarterly cost (if 
applicable)

95 gallon (approx. size) refuse toter* $57.45 N/A $59.76 N/A $62.16 N/A

65 gallon (approx. size) refuse toter* $55.35 $51.75 $57.57 $53.82 $59.88 $55.97

35 gallon (approx. size) refuse toter* $52.65 $51.75 $54.75 $53.82 $56.94 $55.97

By the Bag Option:

Cost per bag $3.00 N/A $3.15 N/A $3.30 N/A

Quarterly cost for core program services* $27.00 N/A $28.10 N/A $29.25 N/A

Recycling toter approx. size                               
(CIRCLE TOTER SIZE)                          
(IDENTIFY COLLECTION FREQUENCY)

Sent to 35 potential bidders. Submittals received from 5.

95 gallon (with weekly or every other week collection)        OR     65 gallon (with weekly collection)

95 gallon/weekly

SUMMARY SHEET Date:  9/1/2016 @ 2:00
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept Bid/RFP: BID 16‐72 Residential Waste Hauling

LAKES DISPOSAL

Grayslake IL

yes

yes

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS



Vendor
City / State

ORGINAL SIGNATURE
MANDATORY PAGES

Year 1 Year 1       Year 2  Year 2 Year 3 Year 3

January 1, 2017 - Senior Discount January 1, 2018 - Senior Discount January 1, 2019 - Senior Discount

December 31, 2017
Quarterly cost (if 

applicable) December 31, 2018
Quarterly cost (if 

applicable) December 31, 2019
Quarterly cost (if 

applicable)

95 gallon (approx. size) refuse toter* $57.72 $57.72 $59.45 $59.45 $61.23 $61.23

65 gallon (approx. size) refuse toter* $54.72 $54.72 $56.36 $56.36 $58.05 $58.05

35 gallon (approx. size) refuse toter* $51.72 $49.13 $53.27 $50.60 $54.87 $52.12

By the Bag Option:

Cost per bag $3.10 $3.10 $3.20 $3.20 $3.30 $3.30

Quarterly cost for core program services* $22.65 $22.65 $23.33 $23.33 $24.03 $24.03

Recycling toter approx. size                               
(CIRCLE TOTER SIZE)                          
(IDENTIFY COLLECTION FREQUENCY)

Sent to 35 potential bidders. Submittals received from 5.

95 gallon (with weekly or every other week collection)        OR     65 gallon (with weekly collection)

95 gallon/weekly

SUMMARY SHEET Date:  9/1/2016 @ 2:00
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept Bid/RFP: BID 16‐72 Residential Waste Hauling

PRAIRIELAND

Lake Barrington IL

yes

yes

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS



Vendor
City / State

ORGINAL SIGNATURE
MANDATORY PAGES

Year 1 Year 1       Year 2  Year 2 Year 3 Year 3

January 1, 2017 - Senior Discount January 1, 2018 - Senior Discount January 1, 2019 - Senior Discount

December 31, 2017
Quarterly cost (if 

applicable) December 31, 2018
Quarterly cost (if 

applicable) December 31, 2019
Quarterly cost (if 

applicable)

95 gallon (approx. size) refuse toter* $59.10 $59.10 $60.87 $60.87 $62.70 $62.70

65 gallon (approx. size) refuse toter* $56.70 $56.70 $58.40 $58.40 $60.15 $60.15

35 gallon (approx. size) refuse toter* $54.30 $51.59 $55.93 $53.13 $57.61 $54.73

By the Bag Option:

Cost per bag $3.25 $3.25 $3.35 $3.35 $3.45 $3.45

Quarterly cost for core program services* $30.00 $30.00 $30.90 $30.90 $31.83 $31.83

Recycling toter approx. size                               
(CIRCLE TOTER SIZE)                          
(IDENTIFY COLLECTION FREQUENCY)

Sent to 35 potential bidders. Submittals received from 5.

95 gallon/every other week
95 gallon (with weekly or every other week collection)        OR     65 gallon (with weekly collection)

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date:  9/1/2016 @ 2:00
Bid/RFP: BID 16‐72 Residential Waste Hauling

WASTE MANAGEMENT

McHenry IL

yes

yes

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS


