SUMMARY SHEET

County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 8/17/2016

Bid/RFP: Oxygen Supplies & Related Equipment/Srvs for VH

Vendor Vendor
Vendor ADVACARE LINCARE
City / State CHICAGO IL CLEARWATER FL
ORGINAL SIGNATURE YES YES
MANDATORY PAGES YES YES
EXCEPTIONS? NONE NONE
Delivery is on an “as needed” b Base Year Option Year 2 | Option Year 3 Base Year Option Year 2 Option Year 3
E-TANK 0.00 0.00 0.00 No Rental No Rental No Rental
REGULATORS 0.50 0.50 0.50 26.00 Purchase Item |26.00 Purchase Item| 26.00 Purchase Item
PULL CARTS 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.05/day 0.05/day 0.05/day
RACKS 0.00 0.00 0.00 No Rental No Rental No Rental
REFILL SERVICES 7.75 7.75 7.75 4.50 4.50 4.50
SPECIALTY BEDS| See Attached | See Attached | See Attached N/A N/A N/A
MATTRESSES| See Attached See Attached | See Attached N/A N/A N/A
VWOUND FPRESSURE
EQUIPMENT AND See Attached | See Attached | See Attached 45.00 45.00 45.00
BI-PAP MACHINES 11.00 10.75 10.50 5.00 5.00 5.00
CONCENTRATORS| See Attached | See Attached | See Attached 1.15 1.15 1.15
Description pages of Bid (p11) See Bid See Bid See Bid See Bid See Bid See Bid
ETA 72 Business Hours
TOTAL $19.25 $19.00 $18.75 $55.65 $55.65 $55.65
SAVINGS

Sent to 8 potential bidders. Submittals received from 3.

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS
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SUMMARY SHEET

County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 8/17/2016

Bid/RFP: Oxygen Supplies & Related Equipment/Srvs for VH

Date: 8/17/2016

Bid/RFP: Oxygen Supplies & Related Equipment/Srvs for VH

Vendor Vendor
Vendor PRAXAIR
City / State HILLSIDE IL
ORGINAL SIGNATURE YES
MANDATORY PAGES YES
EXCEPTIONS? NONE
Delivery is on an “as needed” b{  Base Year Option Year 2 | Option Year 3 Base Year Option Year 2 Option Year 3
E-TANK 9.50 9.98 10.47
REGULATORS 109.24 109.24 109.24
PULL CARTS 26.63 26.63 26.63
RACKS 84.60 84.60 84.60
REFILL SERVICES 9.50 9.98 10.47
SPECIALTY BEDS No Bid No Bid No Bid
MATTRESSES No Bid No Bid No Bid
o ee|  NosBid No Bid No Bid
BI-PAP MACHINES No Bid No Bid No Bid
CONCENTRATORS No Bid No Bid No Bid
Description pages of Bid (p11) See Bid See Bid See Bid
ETA 7-10 days
TOTAL $239.47 $240.43 S241.41 $0.00 S0.00 S0.00
SAVINGS

Sent to 8 potential bidders. Submittals received from 3.

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS




