0-201610-10-036

ORDINANCE

ORDINANCE ADOPTING THE 2015 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE WITH REVISED
LOCAL AMENDMENTS AND REPEALING ORDINANCE 0-2016-08-10-027

WHEREAS, the McHenry Gounty Board through Ordinance 0-2016-08-10-027 adopted the
Intarnational Residential Code 2015 with local amendments; and

WHEREAS, in an effort to better serve the citizenry of McHenry County and meet the code

[ 1728

- enforcement ohjectives of the McHenry-County Board it has become necessary 1o revise the-County- - -~ - -

Board adopted local amendmeants as contained in "attachment A", and

WHEREAS; the Planning and Development Commitiee has recommended the following minimum
fines be established for the following violations of the 2015 International Residential Code:

U,8. CENSUS BUILDING CODE CATEGORY MINIMUM FINE

101-105 (Single and Multifamily Bufldings-new construction) $200
213-327 (Commercial Bulldings) | $500
328-328 (various types of residential accessory structures) $100
330(Signal/T fansmission Towers) , $500
434 (Residential additions/alterations) $200
438-908, 918-998 (various types of minor construction) $100
Signs $500 .
;and

WHEREAS, The Planning and Development Commitiee has recommended that the maximum
fine for violation of the International Residential Code 2015 be $500 per offence with each week that the
violation remains uncorrected constituting a separate offence, as provided for in 58 {LCS 5/5-120-17; and

WHEREAS, the local amendments contained in "attachment A" are intended to make the
County's adoption of the International Residential Code consistent with the County adopted Unified
Development Ordinance and the Stormwater Management Ordinance, existing departmental procedures,
and to reduce the burden on property owners for obtaining permits for certain specified construction
activities. ‘

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT ORDAINED, by this County Board of McHenry County, Nlinois, that
the County Board hereby adopts the International Residential Code 2015 with revisad local amendments
as contained in “attachiment A" and that Ordinance 0-2016-08-10-027 adopting the Infernational
Residential Code 2015 with local amendments be repealed except for its application to permit
applications filed prior to the date of adoption of this ordinance; and

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, that the penalty for violation of any of the ;ﬁrovisions of the
International Residential Code 2018 shall be the minimum fines established below:

5370 / APWalien Page 1

' _Packet Pg. 251




0-201610-10-036

U.S. CENSUS BUILDING CODE CATEGORY MINIMUM FINE
101-105 (Single and Multifamily Buildings-new construction) $200

 213-327 (Commercial Bulidings) $500
328-328 (various types of residential accessory siructurss) $100
330 (Signal/Transmission Towers) | : $500
434 (Residential additions/alterations) e $200
438-908, 918-999 (various types of minor construction) $100
Signs _ $500

BE 1T FURTHER QRDAINED, that the maximum fine for violation of the International Residential
Code 2015 with local amendments shall be $500 per offence with each weelk that the violation remains
uncorrected constituting a separate offence; nothing herein, however, shall preclude enforcement
proceedings by means other than a fine, including injunction proceedings; and

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, that if there is any conflict between this cade and other codes
adopted by the County, the most restrictive provision shall prevail; and

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, that this Ordinance shall bacome effective upon passage by the
McHenry County Board; and

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, that the County Clerk is hereby authorized to distribute a certified
copy of this Ordinance to the McHenry County Clerk, the Director of Planning and Development, and the
Building Code Enforcement Officer.

DATED at Woodstack, Hlinois, this 18th day of October, A.D., 2016.

()t ittt

#6seph Gottémoller, Chairman
MecHenry County Board

ATTEST:

UNeg e C U070

Mary E. McElellan, Gounty Clerk

ATTAGHMENTS:

« 2015 IRC_Attachment A_Amendments_R_8.23.2016 (PDF)
¢ Memo_Adopting revised local amendments fo the 2015 IRC Amendments  {(PDF)

- Packet Pg. 252

e T I 1 S G PGEE 0SS 0 I S0 7100 MOyt A NS




ATTACHMENT A
2015 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE

ALL SECTIONS
1) Change all references fo "code official” to “building official.”

2} Change all references to “legal counsel” to “State’s Attorney Office.”
CHAPTER 1 SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION

"3} SECTION R101"GENERAL R

a) Revise section R101.1 *Title” fo read as foliows:

“R101.1 Title, These provisions shall be known as the Residential Code for One- and Two-family Dwellings of
McHenry County, and shall be cited as such and will be referred to herein as “this code.”

4) SECTION R102 APPLICABILITY
a) Revise section R102.7 “Existing structures” fo read as follows:

“R102.7 Existing structures, The legal occupancy of any structure existing on the date of adoption of this
code shall he permitted to continue without change, except as is specifically covered in this code, the
international Fire Code, the Infernational Existing Building Code, or as is deemed necessary by the building
official for the general safety and welfare of the occupants and the public.”

5) SECTION R103 DEPARTMENT OF BUILDING SAFETY
a) Revise section R103.1 “Greation of enforcement agency” to read as follows:

“R103.1 Creation of enforcement agency. The Department of Planning and Development is hereby created
and the officlal In charge thereof shall be known as the Director of Planning and Development.”

b) Revise section R103.2 "Appointment” to read as follows:

“R103.2 Appointment. The building offfcial, also known as the Building Enforcement Officer, shall be
appointed by the Director of Planning and Development.”

6) SECTION R104 DUTIES OF THE BUILDING OFFICIAL
a) Revise section R104.10.1 “Flood hazard areas” to read as follows:

“R104.10.1 Flood hazard areas. The building official shall not grant modifications to any provisions required in
flood hazard areas as established by Table R301.2(() unless a determination has been made that the
development complies with the McHenry County Storinwaler Management Ordinance.”

7) SECTION R1065 PERMITS
a) Revise section R105.2 "Work exempt from permit. Building: Exemption 1.” to read as follows:

“1. One-story detached accessory siructures that have a maximum floor area of one-hundred fiffy (150} square
feet and are not focated in a floodplain or wetland and comply with all requiremenis of the McHenry County
Unified Development Ordinance and McHenry Counly Stormwater Ordinance and are properly anchored in
accordance with this Code or anchored fo a minimum 6" x 8” perimeter congcrete curh or anchored with 3°-0”
guy rods, 3-0" auger rods, or piers.”

b} Revise section R105.2 “Work exempt from permit. Building: Exemption 2." to read as follows:

“2, Open fences that obscure Jess than fifty percent (60%) of the view through the fence and that have a
maximum height of eight (8} feet and are not located in a floodplain or wetland and comply with alf
requirements of the McHenry County Unified Development Ordinance and McHenry County Stormwater
Management Ordinance.”

¢} Revise section R105.2 “Work exempt from permit. Building: Exemption 3." to read as follows:

16 {5370 : 2015 International Residential Code with Révised Local Amendments)

Attachment: 2015 IRC_Atfachment A_Amendments_R_8.23.20

8/28/2016 Page 1 of 11

“Packet Pg, 253




’ McHenry County 2015 International Residential Code Amendments

“3, Retaining walls that are not over 4 feet (1219 mm} in height measured from the adjacent grade to the top of
the wall, unless supporting a surcharge.”

d) Revise section R105.2 “Work exempt from permit. Building: Exemption 5." to read as follows:

5. Sidewalks, patios and driveways that comply with all requirements of the McHenry County Unified
Development Ordinance and McHenry County Stormwater Management Ordinance.”

&) Revise section 105.2 "Work exempt from permit. Bullding: Exemption #10” to read as follows:
“10. Replacement windows and doors of the same size.”
.. f) . .Add section 105.2."Work exempt from permit.-Building: Exemption #11” to read as follows:
"11, Roofing and siding replacements without modification to any existing structural systems.”
g) Add section 105.2 "Work exempt from permit. Building: Exemption #12” to read as follows;

“12. Agricultural Exempt Structures as defined by the McHenry County Unified Development Ordinance
provided they obtain an Agricultural Exempt Structure Construction Card and comply with the building sethack
requirements of the McHenry County Unified Devetopment Ordinance and all requirements of the McHenry
Counly Stormwater Management Ordinance,”

h) Add section 105.2 "Work exempt from permit. Building: Exemption #13" {o read as follows:

“13, Temporary signs and permanent signs that are designated as nof requiring permiits in the MeHenry County
Unified Development Ordinances provided that they comply with all requirements of the McHenry County
Unified Development Ordinance and McHenry County Stormwater Management Ordinance.”

i)  Addsection 105.2 “Work exempt from permit, Building: Exemption #14" fo read as follows;

“14. Ground signs located on park or conservation land provided that the sign down not include an off-premise
commercial advertising message, are non-ifluminated, limited to a maximum sign area of thirty-two square feet,
and comply with all requirements of the McHenry County Unified Development Ordinance and McHenry County
Stormwater Management Ordinanca.”

i) Revise section R105.3 "Application for permit.” to read as follows:

“To obtain a permit, the applicant shall first file an application therefor in writing on a form furnished by the
Department of Planning and Development for that purpese. Such application shal.”

K} Revise section R105.3.1.1.“Determination of substantially improved or substantially damaged existing buildings in
flood hazard areas.” to read as follows:
“R105,3.1.1 “Determination of substantially improved or substantially damaged existing buildings In
flood hazard areas. For applications for reconstruction, rehabilitation, addition, alteration, repair or other
improvement of existing bulldings or structures located in a flood hazard area, refer fo the McHenry County
Stormwater Ordinance.”

I} Add section R105.4.1 “Validity of Permit’ to read as follows:

“Permits for residential construction on platted, non-impraved sfreefs/roads will be issued subject fo providing
access prior to issuance of a Certificate of Occupancy. Access must be provided across the entire frontage of
the lot or parcel in a manner equal to or belfer than the following minimum standards:

2018 (5370 : 2015 International Residential Code with Revised Local Amendments)

(1) Aggregate surface course fo a compacted thickness of ten (10) inches and a width of ninefeen (19) feel.
(2) Adequate provisions for roadway drainage.

For purposes of this section, "non-improved” shall mean streets/roads which have not been constructed fo
stafe, county or township standards.”

m) Revise section R105.5 “Expiration” to read as follows:

Attachment: 2015 IRC_Attachment A Amendments R 8.23.

8/29/2016 , Page 2 of 11
Packet Pg. 254"




+47.2.A.a-

‘ McHenry County 2015 International Residential Code Amendments

"R105.5 Expiration. Every penmit issued shall become invalid unless the work authorized by such permit is
commenced within 180 days after its issuance, or if the work authorized by such permit is suspended or
abandoned for a period of 180 days after the time the work is commenced, The building official is authorized to
grant, in writing, one or more extensions of time, for periods not more than 180 days each. The extension shall
be requested in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated. The permit is valid for a maximum period of (2) two
years from the time of issuance.” '

n) Add section 105.5.1 "Restricted Term Permits” to read as follows:
“105.5.1 Restricted term permits. The building official is authorized to fimit the validity a pérmit fo a period of
" 180-days from the time of issuance if the scope of work involves the cotrective action or does not merita (2)
fwo year period.”

0) Add section R105.10 "After the Fact Permits and Building Code Compliance Inspections” to read as follows:

“R105.10 After the fact permits and building code compliance inspections. Any owner of ptoperty where
work has been done withouf the required permif having been first oblained as required by Section R105.1, shal
make an application to the building official and obtain the required permit after the fact. However, the property
ownar shall be exempt from obtaining an after the fact permit if the work was completed prior to March 1, 2005,
and the property owner allows the Department of Flanning and Development fo conduct a building code
compliance inspection and obtains a building permit to correct any deficlencles nofed during the building code
complianice inspection. Affer the fact permits and building code complfance inspections shall be subject to
payment of regular permit and inspection fees based on the Department of Planning and Development Fee

Ordinance.”
8) SECTION R106 CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS
a) Revise section R108.1.4 “Information for construction in flood hazard areas” {o read as follows:

“R106.1.4 Information for construction in flood hazard areas. For bulldings and sfructures Jocated in whole
orin part in flood hazard areas as established by Table R301.2(1), construction documents shalf be prepared in
accordance with the McHenry County Stormwater Management Ordinance and this code. Where conflicts exist
the more SMO shall supersede.”

b) Add section R106.1.5 “Roofed structures supported by piers” to read as foliows:

“R106.1.5 Roofed structures supported by piers. Construction plans for roofed structures supported by a
structural system other than a continuous footing and aftached fo a primaty sfructure shall be signed and
sealed by a design professional licensed in the State of lllinois.”

9) SECTION R107 TEMPORARY STRUCTURES AND USES
a) Delete section R107 “Temporary Structures and Uses.”
10) SECTION R109 INSPECTIONS ‘
a) Revise section R108.1.1 “Foundation inspection” to read as follows:

"R109.1.1 Footing inspection. Inspection of the foolings shall be made prior fo placement of any piers,
footings, or poles and after the full foundation area is excavated fo the required depth. The footing inspection
shall include excavafions for afl foundation walis, frost walls, thickened sfabs and isolated piers intended for the
support of bearing walls, partifions, structural supports, or equipment.”

Revised Local Amendments)

{5370 : 2015 International Residential Code with

i

ments R 8.23.2016

P,

b) Add section R109.1.1.1 “Backfill inspection” to read as follows:

“R108.1.1.2 Backfill inspection, Inspection made after foundation walls are erected, Prior to backfilling the
following systems or components including, but not limited to, damp/waterproofing, subsurface drainage
system, exterior insulation, and anchoring shall be placed.”

¢) Add section R109.1.1.2 “Service inspection’; to read as follows:

Attachment: 2015 IRC_Attachment A_Amend

8/29/2016 ‘ | Page 3 of 11
Packet Pg. 256




McHenry County . 2015 International Resldential Code Amendments

“R109.1.3 Service Inspection. Service inspection must be conducted prior fo any connection by the ulility
supplier. The service inspection shall include routing of aff utilities from the right of way or the utility source to
the main distribution point for the structure.”

d) Add section R109.1.1.3 "Slab plumbing Inspection” to read as follows:

'R109.1.1.2 Slab plumbing inspections. Inspaction mads prior to the placement of concrete for any and all
Plumbing, Electrical & Mechanical installations propased under concrete stabs.”

e) Revise section R109.1.3 "Floodplain inspections” to read as follows:

-~ "R108.1.3 Site development inspections. inspections as required-and-detailed by the McHenty-County- -
Stormwater Managament Ordinance for bullding permifs.”

f)  Add section R109.1.4.1 “Insulation Inspection” to read as follows:

"R109.1.4.1 Insulation Inspection: Inspection of insulation that makes up the thermal envelope and insulation
at piping, duct, or other system components prior to application of finishes and general concealment, The final
energy performance specifications and tests shall be available during inspection.”

g) Revise section R109.3 Inspection requests to read as follows:

“R104.3 Inspection requests, [t shall be the duty of the permif holder or their agent to notify the building officia
that such work is ready for inspection af least one work day before said inspection. It shall be the duty of the
permit holder requesting any inspections required by this code to provide access to and means for inspection o
such work.

11) SECTION R110 CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY
a) Revise section R110.1 “Use and Occupancy” to read as follows:

“R110.1 Use and occupancy. A building or structure shall not be used or occupied, and a change in the
existing use or oceupancy classification of a building or structure or portion thereof shall not be made, until the
building official has issued a ceriificate of occupansy or certificate of completion therefor as provided herein,
Issuance of a cettificate of occupancy shall not be construed as an approval of a violation of the provisions of
this code or of other ordinances of the jurisdiction. Certificates presuming to give authority to violate or cancel
the provisions of this code or other ordinances of the jurisdiction shall not be valid.”

b} Delete in section R110.3 “Certificate issued” ifern #7.
¢) Delete in section R110.3 “Certificate issued” ifem #8.
d) Delete in section R110.3 "Gertificate issued” jtom #9.
12) SECTION R115 UNSAFE STRUCTURES AND EQUIPMENT

a) Add section R115.1 “Conditions” to read as follows:

“R115.1 Conditions. All Sfructures or existing equipment which are or hereafter become unsafe, unsanitary or
deficient because of inadequate means of egress facilities, inadequate fight and ventilation, or which constitufe
a fire hazard, or are otherwjse dangerous to human life or the public weifare, or which involve jllegal or
impropsr ocoupancy or inadequate maintenance, shall be deemed an unsafe condition. All unsafe structures
shalf be taken down and removed or made safe, as the building official deems necessary and as provided for ir
this section. A vacant structure that is not secured against eniry shall be deemed unsafe. Boarding up of a
structure is considered a termporary measure until a decision can be made as to what remedy the owner will
pursue as provided in this section; but cannot exceed (6) six months or as the building official may deem
necessary.”

b) Add section R115.2 “Record” to read as follows:

{56370 : 2015 International Residential Code with Reévised Local Amendments)

ents_R_8.23.2016

—

Attachment: 2015 IRC Attachment A Amendm

8/29/2016 ‘ ' Page 4 of 11
~ Packet Pg, 256°




“47.2.A.a |

‘ McHenry County . 2015 international Residential Code Amendments

“115.2 Record, The building official shall cause a report to be filed on an unsafe condition. The report shall
state the occupancy of the structure and the nature of the unsafe condition.”

¢} Addsection R115.3 "Notice” to read as follows:

“R115.8 Notice, If an unsafe condition is found, the building official shall serve on the owner, agent or person ii
control of the structure, a written notice that desctibes that condition deemed unsafe. Susch nofice shall require

the person thus notified fo declare immediately fo the building official the specific repairs or improvements that

will be made to abate the unsafe condition or fo demolish the unsafe structure within a stipulated fime.”

d) Add section R115.4 "Method of service to read as follows:.

“R115.4 Method of service. Such notice shall be deemed properly served if a copy thereof is (a) delivered fo
the owner personally or (b) sent by certified or registered mail addressed to the owner af the last known
address with the return receipt requested. If the certified or reglsiered lefter is refurned showing that the letter
was not delivered, a copy thereof shall be posted in a conspicuous place in or about the structure affected by
such notice. Service of such notice in the foregoing manner upon the owner's agent or upon person
responsible for the structure shall constitute service of notice upon the owner.”

e) Add section R115.5 "Restoration” to read as follows:

‘R115.5 Restoration. The structure or equipment defermined fo be upsafe by the building official is permitted
to be restored to a safe condition. The exfent that repairs, alteralions or additions are made or a change of
occupancy occurs during the restoration of the structure, such repalrs, alterations, additions or change of
oceupancy shall comply with the requirements of this code.”

f)  Add section R115.6 "Disregard of notice” fo read as fallows:

“R118.6 Disregard of notice. Upon refusal or neglect of the person served with an unsafe notice fo comply
with the requirements of the order to abate the tunsafe condition, the State’s Attorney Office shall be advised of
aff the facts in order fo pursue recourse provided by law.” '

13) SECTION R116 EMERGENCY MEASURES
a) Add section R116.1 “Imminent danger” to read as follows:

“‘R116.1 Imminent danger. When, in the opinian of the building official, there is imminent danger of failure or
collapse of a building or structure or any part thereof which endangers life, or when any structure or part of a
structure has fallen and life fs endangered by the occupation of the building or structure, the building offivial fs
hereby authorized and empowered to order and require the occupants fo vacate the same forthwith. The
building official shall cause to be posted at each entrance lo such sfructure a notice reading as follows: “This
Structure is Unsafe and its Occupancy has been prohibited by the building official.” It shall be unlawiul for any
person fo enter such stricture except for the purpose of making the required repairs or of demoalishing the
same.” :

.23.2016 (5370 : 2016 International Residential Code with Revised Local Amendments)

b) Add section R116.2 “Temporary safeguards” to read as follows:

“R116.2 Temporary safeguards. When, in the opinion of the building official, there is imminent danger due to
an unsafe condition, the building official shall cause the necessary work o be done to render such structure
temporarily safe, whether or not the legal procedure herein described has been insfituted.”

c) Add section R116.3 “Closing streets” to read as foliows:

“R116.3 Closing streets, When necessary for the public safety, the building official shall temporarily close
structures and elose or order the authorily having jurisdiction to close sidewalks, streets, public ways and
places adjacent fo unsafe structures, and prohibit the same from being used,”

d) Addsection R116.4 "Emergency repairs” to read as follows:

Aftachment: 2015 IRC Atfachment A- Amendments R 8

8/29/2016 Page 5 of 11
" Packet Pg. 257"




| McHenry Gounty 2015 International Residential Code Amendments

"R116.4 Emergency Repairs, For the purpose of this section, the building official inay employ the necessary
labor and materials to perform the required work as expeditlous!y as possible under authority granted by the
goverhing body.”

e) Add section R116.5 “Costs of emergency repairs” to read as follows:

“R116.5 Costs of emergency repairs. Cosis incurred in the performance of emergency work shall be paid
from the Department of Planning and Development. The Stale's Attorney Office shall institute approptiate
action against the owner of the premises where the unsafe structure is or was Jocated for repayment of costs
lncurred g

| ‘f)‘ ” Add sect:on R116.6 “Unsafe equipment” to r ead as fo]lows

“R116.6 Unsafe equipment. Equipment deemed unsafe by the building official shall not be operated after the
date stated in the notice unjess the required repairs or changes have been made and the equipment has been
approved, or unless an extension of time has been secured from the building official in writing.”

¢) Add section R116.6.1 "Authority to seal equipment” to read as follows:

“R116.6.7 Authority to seal equipment. In the case of an emergency, the building official shall have the
authority fo seal out of service immediately any unsafe device or equipment regulated by this code.”

h} Add section R118.6.2 “Unlawful to remove seal” to read as follows:

"R116.6.2 Uniawful to remove seal. Any device or equipment sealed out of service by the building official sha
be plainly identified in an approved manner. The identification shall nof be tampered with, defaced or removed
except by the building official and shall indicate the reason for such sealing.”

CHAPTER 2 DEFINITIONS

1) R202Z BEFINITIONS
a) Revise section R202 Definitions. [RB] BUILDING OFFICIAL to read as follows:

#R202 Definitions. [RB] BUILDING OFFICIAL, Afso known as Building Enforcement Officer. The officer or
other designated authorlty charged with the administration and enforcement of this code.”

CHAPTER 3 BUILDING PLANNING

2015 International Residential Code with Revised Local Amendments)

a

(5370

1} R301 DESIGN CRITERIA
a) Delete Table R301.2(1) and replaced as follows:
TABLE R301.2(1) CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA

SUBJECT 7O DAMAGE
GROUND WIND DESIGN SEISMIC FROM WINTER| 1GE BARRIER FLOGD AIR MEAN
SNOW 1 DESIGN Frost DESIGN | UNDERLAYMENT |, e o| FREEZING | ANNUAL
LOAD |speedi(mph)| 'OPOraphic| CATEGORY [weathering®| Hine |Termite| TEMP® | REQUIRED! INDEX' | TEMP!
effects depth®
a0 15 NO A SEVERE | 42 | M-H -4 YES SMO 2000 50°F

For Sk 1 pound per square foot = 0,0479 kPa, 1 mile per hour = 0.447 mis.

a. Weatharing may require a higher strength concrete or grade of masonry than necessary fo satisfy the structural requirements of this code. The
weathering column shall be filled n with the wsathering index (.e., "negligible,” "moderate” or "severe"} for concrete as determined from the Weathering
Probability Map {Figure R301.2(3)]. The grade of masonry units shall be determined from ASTM C 34, € §5, € 62, C 73,C 90, C 128, C 145, C 216 or G -

652.

b. The frost line depth may require deeper feotings than mdlc;ated in thure R403.1(1). The furisdiction shall fill in the frost line depth column with the
minimum depth of footing below finish grade.

¢. The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table to indicate the need for protection depending on whether there has been a history of local subterranean
termite damage.

Attachment: 2015 !RC__AttachmentA Amendments_R_8.23.2016

8/29/2018 Page 6 of 11
- Packet Pg. 258




17.2.A.a

McHenry County ‘ 2015 infernational Residential Code Amendments

d. The Jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with the wind speed from the basic wind speed map [Figure R301.2(4)A]. Wind exposure category shall

be detsrminad on a site-specific basis in accordance with Section R301.2.1.4.

e. The outdoor design dry-bulb temperature shall be selectad from the columns of 87-percent values for winter from Appendix D of the Inlernational

Plumbing Code. Deviations from the Appendix D temperatures shall be permitted to reflect local climates or local weather experlence as -determined by

the buiiding official. '

{. The jurisdiction shall fiil in this part of the table with the selsmic design category determined from Section R301.2.2.1,

g. The jurisdiction shalf fill in this part of the table with (a) the date of the jurisdiction’s entry into the Natlonal Fload Insurance Program {date of adoption

of the first cotle or ordinance for management of flood hazard areas), (b) the date(s) of the Flood insurance Study and (c) the panel numbers and dates

of ali currently effective FIRMs and FBFMs or other flood hazard map adopted by the autherity having jurisdiction, as amended.

h. In accerdance with Sections R905.2.7.1, R905.4.3.1, RB05.6.3.1, R9045,6.3.1, R905.7.3.1 and R805.8.3,1, where there has heen a history of local

damage from the effects of ice damming, the jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with “YES.” Otherwise, the jurisdiction shall fill In this part of the

table with "NO.”

I. The jurisdiction shalt fill in this part of the table with the 10C-year return period air freezing index (BF-days) from Figure R403.3(2) or from the 100-year

{99 percent) value on the National Climatic Data Center data table "Alr Freezing Index-USA Method (Base 32°F)" at www.ncde.noaa.goviipsfhbtmi,

j. The purisdiction shall filf in this part of the table with the mean annuz} temperature frorn the Natlonat Climatic Data Center data table "Aly Freezing index-
~ USA Method (Base 32°F)" at www,ncdc.noaa.gev/ipsf.himl, ‘

k. In accordance with Section R301.2.1.8, where there is local historleal data documenting structural damage to buildings due te topagraphlc wind spesd-

up effects, the jurigdiction shall fil in this part of the fable with “YES.” Otherwise, the jurisdiction shall indicate "NO" In this part of the table,

b) Revise section R301.2.4 "Floadplain construction” o read as follows:
“R301.2.4 Floodplain construction. Buildings and structures constructed in whole or in part in flood hazard

1 Residential Code with Revised Local Amendments)

areas as established by Table R301.2(1), and substantial improvement and restoration of substantial damage of §
buildings and structures in flood hazard area, shall be designed and constructed in accordance with the w
requirements of the McHenry County Stormwater Management Ordinance.” g

2) R302 FIRE-RESISTANT CONSTRUGTION E
[7y]

¢) Revise section R302.1 "Exterior walis” to read as follows; é
"R302.1 Exterior walls. Construction, projections, openings and penetrations of exterior walls of dwellings and o
accessory buildings shall comply with the McHenry County Unified Development Ordinance. Where the Unified &
Development Ordinance does not apply, such structures shall be regulated by Table R302.1(/)." =

: ©w

d) Delete section R302.1 Exterior Walls. Exception #2. §
-e) Delete section R302.1 Extérior Walls, Exceptfion #4. ﬂ

f}  Delete section R302.1 Exterior Walls. Exception #5.
3} R308 GARAGES AND CARPORTS
g) Revise section R309.3 "Flood hazard areas” to read as follows:

"R309.3 Flood hazard areas. For buildings located in flood hazard areas as established by Table R301.2{({),
garage floors shall be constructed in accordance with the McHenry Counfy Sformwaler Management
Ordinance.”

h)  Add section R309.6 “Service door” io read as follows:
“R308.6 Service Door. One (1) service door leading directly to the exterior is required for attached or detachec
garages.”

i) Add section R309.7 "Gas Curb" to read as follows:

"R309.7 Gas Curh. A concrefe curb extending at least four inches (4") above the garage floor and around all
below gradé openings shall be provided for attached garages.”

4) R311 MEANS OF EGRESS
a) Revise section R311.2 "Egress doot” to read as follows:

Aftachment: 2015 IRC_Attachment A_Amendments_R_8

8/29/2016 ' : Page 7 of 11
"Paqkét Pg.'259 J




McHenry County 2016 international Residential Gotle Amendments

“R311.2 Egress doors, Not fess than two egress doors shall be provided for each dwelling unit, At least one of
the required egress doors shall be side-hinged, and shall provide a clear width of nof less than 32 inches (813
mm) where measured between the face of the door and the stop, with the door open 90 degrees (1.57 rad),
The second required egress door shall be permitted to be a side-hinged door or a slider. The clear height of the
door opening shall be not less than 78 inches (1981 mm) tn height measured from the top of the threshold to
the bottom of the stop. Other doors shall not be required to comply with these minimum dimensions. Egress
doors shall be readily openable from Inside the dwelling without the use of a key or special knowledge or effort,

d Local Amendments}

1se

b) Revise section R311.5.1.1 “Ledger Attachmant” to read as follows: ,

 “R311.5.1 Attachment. Exterlor Iandings, ‘decks, ba}cdﬁiéé:"étairs and similar facilities shall b‘éﬁﬁéiﬁ'\/éfy
anchored to the primary structure to resist both vertical and lateral fosces or shall be designed io be self-
supporting, Attachment shall comply with Table R507.2.”

5} R313 AUTOMATIC FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEMS
a) Revise section R313 "AUTOMATIC FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEMS” fo read as follows:

“R313.1 Townhouse automatic fire sprinkier systems. An automatic residential fire sprinkier system shall
not be required in townhouses.

R313.1.1 Design and Installation. Where provided, automatic residential fire sprinkler systems for fownhouse:
shalt be designed and instalied in accordance with the lllinois Plumbing Code and NFPA 13 D."

R313.2 One- and two-family dwellings automatic fire systems. An automatic residential fire sprinkier systen
shall not be required in one- and two-family dwellings.

R313.2.1 Design and installation. When provided, automatic residential fire sprinkler systems shail be designec
and installed in accordance with the llinois Plumbing Code and NFPA 13D,

R313.3 Other Code Requirements. All structures built without automatic fire sprinkler systems shall comply witl
construction and separation requirements for non-sprinklered construction described in this code.

6) R322 FLOOD RESISTANT CONSTRUCTION

a) Revise section R322.1.5 to read as follows:

“R322.1 General. Buildings and structures constructed in whole or in part in flood hazard areas, including A o
V Zones and Coastal A Zones, as established in Table R301.2(l), and substantial improvement and restoratior
of substantial damage of buildings and sfructures in flood hazard areas, shall be designed and constructed Ir
aceordance with the provisions of the McHenry County Stormwater Management Ordinance and as contained i
this section. Construction dacuments shall be prepared by an architect or 'a_ppropﬁate design professions
licensed in the State of illinois. Buildings and structures that are located in more than one flood hazard area shal
comply with the provisions associated with the most restrictive flood hazard area. Buildings and structures locatet
in whole or in part in identified floodways shall be designed and constructed in accordance with the McHenr
County Stormwater Management Ordinance and ASCE 24."

7) R324 SOLAR ENERGY SYSTEMS

a) Revise section R324.2 to read as follows:

R324.3 Photovoltaic systems. Photovoltaic systems shall be designed and instalied in accordance with the
McHenry County Uniffed Development Ordinance, Sections R324.3.1 through R324.7.2.5 and NFPA 70
Inverters shall be fisfed and /abefed in accordance with UL 1741. Systems connected to the ufility grid shall use
inverters listed for utility interaction.

b) Revise section R324.3 to read as follows:

R324.2 Solar thermal systems. Solar thermal systems shall be designed and installed in accordance with th
McHenry County Unified Development Ordinance, Chapter 23 and the /nternational Fire Code.

6 (5370 : 2015 International Residential Code with Rev

gnfs R 8,23.201

Attachment: 2015 IRC_Attachment A_Amendm

8/29/2016 Page 8 of 11
Packet Pg. 260




| 17.2.A.a ]

x McHenry County 2015 International Residential Code Amendments

c) Revise sectioh R324.4.1 to read as follows:

“R324.4.1 Roof Joad. Roof structures that provide support for photovoltaic panel systems shall be designed fo
applicable roof loads. Portions of roof structures not covered by photovoltaic panels shall be designed for dea
loads and live loads in accordance with R301.4 and R301. 6. Roof structures that provide support for photovoltal
panel systems shall be designed far the following load cases;

{1} Dead Load (including photovoitaic panel weight) plus snow load in accordance with Table R301.2(1)

(2) Dead Load {excluding photovoliaic panel weight) pius roof live load or smow load, whichever is greater, il
. aecordance with Section R301.6.”

d) Revise section R324.6.1 "Fire separation distances” o read as follows:

“R324.8,1 Fire separation distances. Ground-mounted photovoltaic systems shall maintain a fire separatio
distance of 7-0” from any other accessory or principle structure or as aljowed by the McHenry County Unifiet
Development Ordinance.

8) R326 SWIMMING POOLS, SPAS AND HOT TUBS
a) Revise section R326 SWIMMING POOLS, SPAS AND HOT TUBS to read as follows:

‘R326.1 General. The design and construction of pools and spas shail comply with the McHenry County Poc
and Spa Ordinance.”

CHAPTER 4 FOUNDATIONS

8) R403 FOOTINGS
a) Revise section R403.1,1 “Minimum size” to read as follows:

"R403.1.1 Minimum size. The minimum width, W, and thickness, T, far concrete footings shall be no fess thai
16” x 8" for light-frame construction and 26" x 10" for light-frame construction with brick veneer or in accordanc
with Tables R403.1(1) through R403.1(3) and Figure R403.1{l) or R403.1.3, as applicable, The footing width shal
be based on the load-bearing value of the soll i accordance with Table R401.4.1. Footing projections, P, shal
be not Jess than 2 inches (51 mm) and shall not exceed the thickness of the footing. Footing thickness ant
projection for fireplaces shall be in accordance with Sectlon R1001.2. The size of footings supporting piers ant
columns shall be based on ihe tributary load and allowable soil pressure in accordance with Table R401.4,1
Footings for wood foundations shall be in accordance with the details set forth in Section R403.2, and Figures
R403.1{2) and R403,1(3).

b) Add section R403.1.1.1 "Turned down footing” to read as follows:

“R403,1.1.1 Turned down footing. The minimum width, W, of a turned down footing shall be no less than 12
or shall be based on the load-bearing value of the soil in accordance with Table R401.4.1. The minimum dept!
shall be in accordance with Section R403.1.4.”

¢} Delefe section R403,1.4.1 “Frost profection” Exceplions 3.
10) R404 FOUNDATION AND RETAINING WALLS
a) Revise section R404.1.2,1 "Masonry foundation walls” to read as follows:

‘R4A04.1.2.1 Masonry foundation walls. Concrete masonry and cfay masonry foundation walls shall have
minimum nominal thickness of 8” or as set forth in Table R404.1.1(1), R404.1.1(2), R404.1.1(3) or R404.1.1(4
and shall also comply with applicable provisions of Section R806. In buildings assigned to Seismic Desigr
Categories D0, D, and D2, concrete masonry and clay masonry foundation-walls shall also comply with Sectiot
R404.1.4.1. Rubble stone masonry foundation walls shall be constructed in accordance with Sections R404,1.4
and R606.3.2. Rubble stone masonry walls shall not be used in Seismic Design Categories DO, D, and D2."

11} R405 FOUNDATION DRAINAGE

2015 International Residential Code with Revised Local Amendments}

{5370

dments_R_8.23.2016

Attachment: 2015 JRC_Attachment A_Amen

8/29/2016 Page 9 of 11
~.Packet Pg. 261 -




. b, Snow load shall not be assumed to act concurrently with live Joad.

' McHenry County 2015 International Residential Code Amendments

b) Add section R405.2.4 "Paint of discharge” to read as follows:

“R405.2.4 Point of discharge, The point of discharge otthe drainage system shall be diverted in such a manne
so as to not create a hazard and shall be no closer than one half (1/2) the distance betwsen the required yart
setback and the property fine or five (5) feet, whichever is greater.”

12) R408 UNDER-FLOOR SPACE
a) Revise section R408.5 “Removal of debris® to read as follows:

“R408.5 Removal of debris, The under-floor grade shall be cleaned of all vegetation and organic material and
granularfifl, pea gravel-ara concrete siab placed over a vapar-barrier that complies with-R508.2.3. All wood
farms used for placing concrete shall be removed before a building is occupied or used for any purpose. Al
construction materials shalf be removed before a bullding is occupied or used for any purpose.”

b} Revise section R408.7 “Flood resistance” fo read as follows:

“R408.7 Flood resistance. For buildings located in the flood hazard areas refer to the requirements of tht
McHenry County Stormwater Management Ordinance.”

CHAPTER 5 FLOORS

1) R507 EXTERIOR DECKS
a) Revise Table R507.2 Deck Ledger connection to Band Joist to read as follows:
Table R507.2 DECK LEDGER CONNECTION TO BAND JOIST »? {Deck live load = 40 psf, deck dead load =10 psf} -

2016 (5370 : 2015 International Residential Code with Revised Local Amendments)

JOIST SPAN 6'andless | 61" ta 8 | 871”10 10" [10°1"t0 12'[12' 1" t0 14" 14' 1" 10 16| 16' 1" to 18

Connection details . On-center spacing of fasteners®®
Ye-inch diameter lag screw with %-inch ‘
maximum sheathing @9 16 18 18 8 B 8 8
Vz-inph diameter boit t:Ni'(h Y-inch 15 16 16 8 8 8 8
maximum sheathing .
YaInch diameter bolt with 1-inch 16 16 16 8 8 8 8
maximum sheathing ®

For S): 1 inch = 25.4 mm, 1 foot = 304.8 mm. 1 pound per square foot = 0.0479 kPa.
a, Ledgers shall be flashed in secordance with Section R703.8 to prevent water from contacting the house band joist.

. The tip of the lag screw shall fully extend beyond the inside face of the band joist.
. Sheathing shall be wood structural panel or solid sawn [umber.,

&, Sheathing shall be permitied to be wood structural panel, gypsum board, fiberboard, lumber or foam sheathing. Up to 1/2-Inch thickness of stacked
washers shall be permitted to substitute for up fo 1/2 inch of allowable sheathing thickness where combined with wood structural pane! or jurnber

sheathing.

b} Revise section R507.2.4 “Deck lateral load connection” o read as follows:

R507.2.4 Deck lateral Joad connection. Where a lateral load connection is provided, the connection shall be
permitted to be i accordance with Figure R507.2.3(1) or R607.2.3(2). Where the lateral load connection is
provided in accordance with Figure R507.2.3(1), hold-down tension devices shall be installed in not less than
two locations per deck, within 24 inches of each end of the deck. Each device shall have an allowable stress
design capacity of not less than 1,500 pounds (6672 N). Where the lateral load connections are provided in
accardance with Figure R507.2.3(2), the hold-down tension devices shall be installed in not less than four
locations per deck, and each device shall have an aliowable stress design capacity of not less than 750 pounds
(3338 N).

CHAPTER 11 ENERGY EFFICIENCY

Attachment; 2018 {RC_Attachment A_Amendmenis R 8.23

8/29/2016 Page 10 of 11
 Packet Pg. 262




[' 17:2A.2 |

McHenry County 2015 International Residential Code Amendments

1) Delete "CHAPTER 11 [RE] ENERGY EFFICIENCY” and replace as follows:

"The provisions of the lllinois Enerqy Conservation Code as adopted separately by the McHenry Cotnty Board
shall requlate the design and construction of buiidings for the ef‘ecnve use and conservation of energy over the
useful fife of each building.”

PART VIl -~ Plumbing

1) Delete CHAPTER 25 THROUGH 32 and replace as follows:
“The provisions of the llfinois Plumbing Code as adopted separately by the McHenry County Board shall goverr

the erection, installation, alteration, repairs, relocation, replacement addition to, use or maintenance of
‘plumbing equipment”

PART Vil - Electrical

1) Delete CHAPTER 34 THROUGH 43 and replace as‘follows:

"The provisions of the National Electrical Code as adopted separately by the MocHenry County Board shall
govern the instaliation of electrical systems, equipment and components indoors and outdoors that are within
the scope of this code, including services, power, distribution systems, fixtures, appliances, devices and
appurtenances.”

PART [X - Reference Standards

1) Delete Appendix A "SIZING CAPACITIES OF GAS PIPING"

2) Delete Appendices B "SIZING OF VENTING SYSTEMS SERVING APPLIANCES EQUIPPED WITH DRAFT HOODS,
CATEGORY | APPLIANCES, AND APPLIANCES LISTED FOR USE W|TH TYPE B VENTS"

3) Add Appendix C “EXIT TERMINALS OF MECHANICAL DRAFT AND DIRECT-VENT VENTING SYSTEMS” as part of
this code,

4) Deslete Appendix D “RECOMMENDED PROCEDURE FOR SAFETY INSPECTION OF AN EXISTING APPLIANCE
INSTALLATION”

5) Delefe Appendix E “MANUFACTURED HOUSING USED AS DWELLINGS”

8) Add Appendix F "PASSIVE RADQN GAS CONTRQLS” as part of this code.

7) Delete Appendix G “PIPING STANDARDS FOR VARIOUS APPLICATIONS"

B) Defete Appendix H "PATIO COVERS'

9) Delefe Appendix ] "PRIVATE SEWAGE DISPOSAL”

10) Delete Appendix J "EXISTING BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES”

11) Delete Appendix K “SOUND TRANSMISSION”

12} Add Appendix L "PERMIT FEES” fo read as follows:

APPENDIX L PERMIT FEES '
Permit fees shall be in accordance to the Fee Ordinance as adopted by the McHenry County Board.

13) Delete Appendix M “HOME DAY CARE —~ R-3 OCCUPANCY” '

14} Delete Appendix N “VENTING METHODS"

15) Delete Appendix O "AUTOMATIC VERICULAR GATES®

18) Delefe Appendix P “SIZING OF WATER PIPING SYSTEM”

17} Delete Appendix Q "RESERVED"

18} Delete Appendix R “LIGHT STRAW-CLAY CONSTRUCTION®

18) Delate Appendix 8 "STRAWBALE CONSTRUCTION"

20) Delete Appendix T "RECOMMENDED PROCEDURE FOR WORST-CASE TESTING OF ATMOSPHERIC VENTING
SYSTEMS UNDER N1102.4 OR N1105 CONDITIONS <5ACH’

21} Defete Appendix U “SCLAR-READY PROVISIONS — DETACHED ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, MULTPLE
SINGLE-FAMILY DWELLINGS (TOWNHOUSES)"

2015 International Residential Code with Révised Locai Amendments}

*
«

.23.2016 (5370

Attachment: 2015 IRC_Attachment A_Amendments R 8

8/29/20416 ‘ Page 11 of 11

Packet Pg. 263




4 McHenry County
*""’“’" Department of F‘Ianning and Developm ent www.co.mchenry.Lus/plandev

orsIce: McHenry Coundy Admin. Bldg. MAIL: 2200 N, Seminary Ave, EMAIL plandev@co.mahanry.il.us
667 Waute Read, Woodstock, lilinois Woodsfock, llinois 60098 P 815-334-4560  F: B15-334-4546

August 24, 2018
To:  Members of the Planning & Development Committes

From: Adam Wallen, Building Enforcement Officer
Dennis Sandquist, Director of Planning and Development

Re:  Adoption of the 2015 International Residential Code with revisions to the
County’s local amendments.

. 17.2.A.b

Board / Committee Action Requested:
Adopt the 2015 International Residential Code with revised local amendments, as
contained in Attachment A.

Background and Discussion:

On August 2, 2016, the County Board adopted the 2015 International Residential Code
(IRC) with certain local amendments. Prior to adopting the IRC, the County Board
removed two proposed local amendments and returned them to the P&D Committee for
further consideration. In addijtion, upon review of the local amendments, staff has
identified a typographical error in one provision.

The provisions returned to committee for further review, included:

» Add section R309.6 “Service door” to read as follows: “R309.8 Service Door. Ohe
(1) service door leading directly to the exterior is required for attached or
detached garages.”

s Delete “CHAPTER 11 [RE] ENERGY EFFICIENCY” and replace as follows: "The
provisions of the lllincis Energy Conservation Code as adopted separately by the
MecHenry County Board shall regulate the design and construction of buildings for
the effective use and conservation of energy over the useful fife of each building.”

The typographical error to be corrected:
~ «  Delete Add Appendix F “PASSIVE RADON GAS CONTROLS" as part of this
code.

On August 23, 2016, the P&D Commitiee reviewed the two local amendments that were
returned to the Committee as well as the typographical error, The Committee directed
staff to prepare an ordinance (re)adopting the 2015 International Residential Cods, with
revised local amendments including the two amendments returned by the County Board
and correcting the typographical error.

pting revised local amendments to the 2015 IRC Amendments (5370 : 2015 International Re%identiai Code with Revised

Atftachment: Memo Ado

" Packet Pg. 264




McHenry County
Department of Planning and Development www.co.mchenry.hus/plandev

oFFice: McHenry County Acimin, Bidig, MAIL: 2200 N, Seminary Ave, fMAlL: plandev@comchentydlus
667 Ware Road, Woodstock, illinois Woodstock, linols 800978 7. 815-334-4560 £ B15-334-4546

Service Door Requirement
The County began requiring one service door to be installed when constructing detached
or attached garages under 1983 CABO adopted by the County in 1983. The requirement
has been in place and is largely accepted by owners and the construction community for
its health and life safety benefits. The service door provides egress directly to the '
_exterior in the event that the overhead garage door becomes inoperabie through power
or mechanical failure. The door becomes increasingly beneficial if the entry door to the
residence is not functional or its use is ovetly hazardous due to fire or related
emergency. ' ‘

The installation of a service door does impose additional costs to owners and
contractors. A 3'-0" x 8’-8" steel service door retails for approximately $265.00,
installation costs can be approximated based upon-labor and miscellaneous materials,
$250.00, netting an approximated cost of the service deor installation at $515,

The requirement has been required for new construction and reconstruction only.
Renovation work does not trigger the requirement. The construction costs per square
foot of a new single family residence of standard construction is between $120-$150/sf,
The construction cost of a 2250-sf residence would be range between $270,000 and
$337,500. The cost of installing a service door to meet this requirement represents
0.15% to 0.18% of the total cost of construction

Chapter 11 Energy Efficiency Requirement

The State of lllinois requires all municipalities and counties to adopt the lllinois Energy
Conservation Code. Section 600.400[a] of the illinois Energy Conhservation Cade
identifies the 2015 International Energy Conservation Code as the applicable standard
for Residential Buildings. The State Statute precludes the county from enforcing energy
efficient building standards for residential construction in a manner that is either less or
more stringent that the state standards. The County Board adopted the llinois Energy
Conservation Code, on May 5, 2015 via County Board Ordinance 0-201505-10-016,

The County’s local amendments to the 2015 International Residential Code should direct
property owners and builders to the correct energy efficiency standards. Not doing so
will result in construction projects being designed or constructed to the incorrect
standards. If the County Board disagrees with any standards contained in the lllinois
Energy Conservation Code, the Board should direct staff to request that the state
consider an amendment to jts code,

Appendix F
The loeal amendment should property indicated that Appendix F "PASSIVE RADON
GAS CONTROLS" is added (not deleted) as part of the International Residential Code.

17.2.A.0

Aftachment: Memo Ado

pting revised local amendments to the 2015 IRC Amendments {5370 : 2015 International Residential Code with Revised

* Packet Pg. 265

Ate e b




STATE OF ILLINOIS )
' ) §S
COUNTY OF MCHENRY ) 172 A

I, Mary £, McClelfan, County Clerk within and for said Comnty and State aforesaid, do hereby
certify the attached o be a true and complete copy of Ordinance 0-201610-10-036 Adopting the 2015
International Residential Code with revised local amendments and repealing Ordinance O-201608-10-027
WHEREOF I have hereunto subscribed my hand and affixed the official seal of said County, at my office
in Woodstock, 1llinois this 18th day of October, 2016

ey € INC ot

McHenty County Clerk




