llinois Department

of Transportation Tabulation of Bids
Township: Chemung
Local Public Agency: McHenry County Date: 4/6/2016 Name of Bidder:| Arrow Road Construction Curran Contracting Co. Lorig Construction Co.
County: McHenry Time: 2:00 PM Address of Bidder: 3401 Busse Road 286 Memorial Court 250 E. Touhy Avenue
Section: 16-04000-00-GM Appropriation: Mt. Prospect, IL 60056 Crystal Lake, IL 60014 Des Plaines, IL 60018
Estimate: $47,500.00
Proposal Guarantee:
Attended By: Terms:
Approved Engineer's
Estimate
Item No. Iltem Delivery Unit Quantity | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1 HMA SURFACE COURSE IL 9.5, N50 TON 250 60.00 $ 15,000.00 $ - 41.0000 | $ 10,250.00 43.7500 | $ 10,937.50
FOB PLANT ($0.50/TON/MI) X MILES $ - $ 9.7500 | $ 2,437.50 125000 | $ 3,125.00
PLANT LOCATION (MILES) $ - $ MCHENRY, IL (19.5 MI) ALGONQUIN, IL (25.0)

2 HMA BINDER COURSE IL 19.0, N50 TON 500 65.00 $ 32,500.00 $ 39.0000 | $ 19,500.00 39.7500 | $ 19,875.00
FOB PLANT ($0.50/TON/MI) X MILES $ - $ 9.7500 | $ 4,875.00 12,5000 | $ 6,250.00
PLANT LOCATION (MILES) $ $ MCHENRY, IL (19.5 MI) ALGONQUIN, IL (25.0)

$ $ $ - $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ - $ - $ $
. As Read: NO BID
Total Bid: s Calculated:| § - s 37,06250 | $ 40,187.50

Engineer's Estimate:
$47,500.00

Printed 4/7/2016 1of2 BLR 12315 (Rev. 07/16/13)



llinois Department
of Transportation

Township

Local Public Agency:
County

Section

Estimate:

: Chemung

McHenry County

: McHenry

: 16-04000-00-GM

$47,500.00

Date: 4/6/2016

Tabulation of Bids

Time: 2:00 PM

Appropriation:

Name of Bidder:
Address of Bidder:

Payne & Dolan, Inc.

Peter Baker & Son Co.

28435 W. Route 173

1349 Rockland Road

Antioch, IL 60002

P.O. Box 187

Lake Bluff, IL 60044

Proposal Guarantee:

Printed 4/7/2016

Engineer's Estimate:
$47,500.00

20f2

Attended By: Terms:
Approved Engineer's
Estimate
Item No. Iltem Delivery Unit Quantity | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1 HMA SURFACE COURSE IL 9.5, N50 TON 250 60.00 $ 15,000.00 53.50000 | $ 13,375.00 39.0000 | $ 9,750.00
FOB PLANT ($0.50/TON/MI) X MILES $ - 12.15000 | $ 3,037.50 8.0500 | $ 2,012.50
PLANT LOCATION (MILES) $ - ANTIOCH, IL (24.3 MI) MARENGO, IL (16.1 MI)

2 HMA BINDER COURSE IL 19.0, N50 TON 500 65.00 $ 32,500.00 $ 4800|$ 24,000.00 $ 3500|% 17,500.00
FOB PLANT ($0.50/TON/MI) X MILES $ - 12.15000 | $ 6,075.00 8.0500 | $ 4,025.00
PLANT LOCATION (MILES) $ ANTIOCH, IL (24.3 MI) MARENGO, IL (16.1 MI)

$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ - $ $
. As Read:
Total Bid: s Calculated: § 4648750 | $ 33,287.50
LOW BIDDER

BLR 12315 (Rev. 07/16/13)



llinois Department
of Transportation

Township: Greenwood

Tabulation of Bids

Local Public Agency: McHenry County Date: 4/6/2016 Name of Bidder:| Arrow Road Construction Curran Contracting Co. Geske & Sons, Inc
County: McHenry Time: 2:00 PM Address of Bidder: 3401 Busse Road 286 Memorial Court 400 E. Terra Cotta Avenue
Section: 16-09000-00-GM Appropriation: Mt. Prospect, IL 60056 Crystal Lake, IL 60014 Crystal Lake, IL 60014

Estimate: $60,000.00
Proposal Guarantee:
Attended By: Terms:
Approved Engineer's
Estimate
Item No. Iltem Delivery Unit Quantity | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 HMA SURFACE COURSE IL 9.5, N50 TON 1000 60.00 $ 60,000.00 $ 40.2000 | $ 40,200.00 38.4000 | $ 38,400.00
FOB PLANT ($0.50/TON/MI) X MILES $ - $ 41500 | $ 4,150.00 8.7000 | $ 8,700.00
PLANT LOCATION (MILES) $ $ MCHENRY, IL (8.3 MI) CRYSTAL LAKE, IL (17.4 MI)
$ $ $ $ -
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ - $ - $ $
. As Read: NO BID
Total Bid: s Calculated:| § - 5 44,350.00 47,100.00
LOW BIDDER

Printed 4/7/2016

Engineer's Estimate:
$60,000.00

lof2

BLR 12315 (Rev. 07/16/13)



llinois Department

of Transportation Tabulation of Bids
Township: Greenwood
Local Public Agency: McHenry County Date: 4/6/2016 Name of Bidder: Lorig Construction Co. Payne & Dolan, Inc. Peter Baker & Son Co.
County: McHenry Time: 2:00 PM Address of Bidder: 250 E. Touhy Avenue 28435 W. Route 173 1349 Rockland Road
Section: 16-09000-00-GM Appropriation: Des Plaines, IL 60018 Antioch, IL 60002 P.O. Box 187
Estimate: $60,000.00 Lake Bluff, IL 60044
Proposal Guarantee:
Attended By: Terms:
Approved Engineer's
Estimate
Item No. Iltem Delivery Unit Quantity | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 HMA SURFACE COURSE IL 9.5, N50 TON 1000 60.00 $ 60,000.00 43.75000 | $ 43,750.00 53.5000 | $ 53,500.00 38.0000 | $ 38,000.00
FOB PLANT ($0.50/TON/MI) X MILES $ - 8.05000 | $ 8,050.00 7.3000 | $ 7,300.00 7.8500 | $ 7,850.00
PLANT LOCATION (MILES) $ ALGONQUIN, IL (16.1 MI) ANTIOCH, IL (14.6 MI) LAKEMORE, IL (15.7 MI)
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ - $ $ $
. As Read:
Total Bid: — o= culated: $ 51,800.00 | $ 60,800.00 | $ 45,850.00

Printed 4/7/2016

Engineer's Estimate:
$60,000.00

20f2

BLR 12315 (Rev. 07/16/13)



llinois Department
of Transportation

Township: Hartland

Tabulation of Bids

Local Public Agency: McHenry County Date: 4/6/2016 Name of Bidder:| Arrow Road Construction Curran Contracting Co. Geske & Sons, Inc
County: McHenry Time: 2:00 PM Address of Bidder: 3401 Busse Road 286 Memorial Court 400 E. Terra Cotta Avenue
Section: 16-10000-00-GM Appropriation: Mt. Prospect, IL 60056 Crystal Lake, IL 60014 Crystal Lake, IL 60014

Estimate: $60,000.00
Proposal Guarantee:
Attended By: Terms:
Approved Engineer's
Estimate
Item No. Iltem Delivery Unit Quantity | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 HMA SURFACE COURSE IL 9.5, N50 TON 1000 60.00 $ 60,000.00 $ 39.8000 | $ 39,800.00 38.0000 | $ 38,000.00
FOB PLANT ($0.50/TON/MI) X MILES $ - $ 5.2000 | $ 5,200.00 8.9000 | $ 8,900.00
PLANT LOCATION (MILES) $ $ MCHENRY, IL (10.4 MI) CRYSTAL LAKE, IL (17.8 MI)
$ $ $ $ -
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ - $ - $ $
. As Read: NO BID
Total Bid: s Calculated:| § R 45,000.00 46,900.00
LOW BIDDER

Printed 4/7/2016

Engineer's Estimate:
$60,000.00

lof2

BLR 12315 (Rev. 07/16/13)



llinois Department

of Transportation Tabulation of Bids
Township: Hartland
Local Public Agency: McHenry County Date: 4/6/2016 Name of Bidder: Lorig Construction Co. Payne & Dolan, Inc. Peter Baker & Son Co.
County: McHenry Time: 2:00 PM Address of Bidder: 250 E. Touhy Avenue 28435 W. Route 173 1349 Rockland Road
Section: 16-10000-00-GM Appropriation: Des Plaines, IL 60018 Antioch, IL 60002 P.O. Box 187
Estimate: $60,000.00 Lake Bluff, IL 60044
Proposal Guarantee:
Attended By: Terms:
Approved Engineer's
Estimate
Item No. Iltem Delivery Unit Quantity | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 HMA SURFACE COURSE IL 9.5, N50 TON 1000 60.00 $ 60,000.00 43.75000 | $ 43,750.00 53.5000 | $ 53,500.00 39.0000 | $ 39,000.00
FOB PLANT ($0.50/TON/MI) X MILES $ - 8.60000 | $ 8,600.00 11.6000 | $ 11,600.00 8.0500 | $ 8,050.00
PLANT LOCATION (MILES) $ ALGONQUIN, IL (17.2 MI) ANTIOCH, IL (23.2 MI) MARENGO, IL (16.1 MI)
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ - $ $ $
. As Read:
Total Bid: — o= culated: $ 52,350.00 | $ 65,100.00 | $ 47,050.00

Printed 4/7/2016

Engineer's Estimate:
$60,000.00

20f2

BLR 12315 (Rev. 07/16/13)



Local Public Agency:

llinois Department
of Transportation

Township: Hebron

McHenry County

Date: 4/6/2016

Tabulation of Bids

Name of Bidder:

Arrow Road Construction

Curran Contracting Co. Lorig Construction Co.

Printed 4/7/2016

County: McHenry Time: 2:00 PM Address of Bidder: 3401 Busse Road 286 Memorial Court 250 E. Touhy Avenue
Section: 16-11000-00-GM Appropriation: Mt. Prospect, IL 60056 Crystal Lake, IL 60014 Des Plaines, IL 60018
Estimate: $30,000.00
Proposal Guarantee:
Attended By: Terms:
Approved Engineer's
Estimate
Item No. Iltem Delivery Unit Quantity | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 HMA BINDER COURSE IL 19.0, N50 TON 500 60.00 $ 30,000.00 $ 3980 $ 19,900.00 3975|$ 19,875.00
FOB PLANT ($0.50/TON/MI) X MILES $ - $ 745]$ 3,725.00 12.10 | $ 6,050.00
PLANT LOCATION (MILES) $ $ MCHENRY, IL (14.9 MI) ALGONQUIN, IL (24.2 MI)
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ - $ - $ $
. As Read: NO BID
Total Bid: s Calculated:| § - [ 23,625.00 | $ 25,925.00

Engineer's Estimate:
$30,000.00

lof2

BLR 12315 (Rev. 07/16/13)



llinois Department
of Transportation

Township: Hebron

Local Public Agency: McHenry County

Date: 4/6/2016

Tabulation of Bids

Name of Bidder:

Payne & Dolan, Inc.

Peter Baker & Son Co.

Printed 4/7/2016

Engineer's Estimate:
$30,000.00

20f2

County: McHenry Time: 2:00 PM Address of Bidder: 28435 W. Route 173 1349 Rockland Road
Section: 16-11000-00-GM Appropriation: Antioch, IL 60002 P.O. Box 187
Estimate: $30,000.00 Lake Bluff, IL 60044
Proposal Guarantee:
Attended By: Terms:
Approved Engineer's
Estimate
Item No. Iltem Delivery Unit Quantity | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 HMA BINDER COURSE IL 19.0, N50 TON 500 60.00 $ 30,000.00 5350 $ 26,750.00 3400 $ 17,000.00
FOB PLANT ($0.50/TON/MI) X MILES $ - 6.65| $ 3,325.00 1050 | $ 5,250.00
PLANT LOCATION (MILES) $ ANTIOCH, IL (13.3 MI) LAKEMORE, IL (21.0 MI)
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ - $ $
. As Read:
Total Bid: s Calculated: § 30,075.00 | $ 22,250.00
LOW BIDDER

BLR 12315 (Rev. 07/16/13)



Local Public Agency:

llinois Department
of Transportation

Township: Riley

McHenry County

Date: 4/6/2016

Tabulation of Bids

Name of Bidder:

Arrow Road Construction

Curran Contracting Co. Lorig Construction Co.

Printed 4/7/2016

County: McHenry Time: 2:00 PM Address of Bidder: 3401 Busse Road 286 Memorial Court 250 E. Touhy Avenue
Section: 16-16000-00-GM Appropriation: Mt. Prospect, IL 60056 Crystal Lake, IL 60014 Des Plaines, IL 60018
Estimate: $15,000.00
Proposal Guarantee:
Attended By: Terms:
Approved Engineer's
Estimate
Item No. Iltem Delivery Unit Quantity | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 HMA SURFACE COURSE IL 9.5, N50 TON 250 60.00 $ 15,000.00 $ 45.00 | $ 11,250.00 4375| $ 10,937.50
FOB PLANT ($0.50/TON/MI) X MILES $ - $ 1355 $ 3,387.50 10.80 | $ 2,700.00
PLANT LOCATION (MILES) $ $ MCHENRY, IL (27.1 MI) ALGONQUIN, IL (21.6 MI)
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ $ $ $
$ - $ - $ $
. As Read: NO BID
Total Bid: s Calculated:| § - s 1463750 | $ 13,637.50

Engineer's Estimate:
$15,000.00

lof2

BLR 12315 (Rev. 07/16/13)



llinois Department
of Transportation

Township: Riley

Local Public Agency: McHenry County

Date: 4/6/2016

Tabulation of Bids

Name of Bidder:

Payne & Dolan, Inc.

Peter Baker & Son Co.

Printed 4/7/2016

Engineer's Estimate:
$15,000.00

20f2

County: McHenry Time: 2:00 PM Address of Bidder: 28435 W. Route 173 1349 Rockland Road
Section: 16-16000-00-GM Appropriation: Antioch, IL 60002 P.O. Box 187
Estimate: $15,000.00 Lake Bluff, IL 60044
Proposal Guarantee:
Attended By: Terms:
Approved Engineer's
Estimate
Item No. Iltem Delivery Unit Quantity | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 HMA SURFACE COURSE IL 9.5, N50 TON 250 60.00 $ 15,000.00 5350 $ 13,375.00 44.00| $ 11,000.00
FOB PLANT ($0.50/TON/MI) X MILES $ - 19.35| $ 4,837.50 025]$ 62.50
PLANT LOCATION (MILES) $ ANTIOCH, IL (38.7 MI) MARENGO, IL (0.5 MI)
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ $ $
$ - $ $
. As Read:
Total Bid: s Calculated: § 1821250 | $ 11,062.50
LOW BIDDER

BLR 12315 (Rev. 07/16/13)
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