

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 11/19/15
 Bid/RFP: 15-105 Petroleum Prods

Vendor City/State		KELLEY WILLIAMSON ROCKFORD IL		PETROLIANCE ELGIN IL	
Original Signature		YES		YES	
Mandatory Pages Included?		YES		YES	
Motor Oils		I	II	I	II
15W40 (CJ-4) 495 gal	Unit Cost	\$6.50	\$6.50	\$6.85	No Bid
	Total Cost	\$2,217.50	\$2,217.50	\$3,390.75	No Bid
Brand Name		Mobil		Mobil Fleet	
10w30 110 gal	Unit Cost	\$4.75	\$4.75	\$5.65	No Bid
	Total Cost	\$522.50	\$522.50	\$621.50	No Bid
Brand Name		KW Performance		Medallion Plus	
5w30 110 gal	Unit Cost	\$4.75	\$4.75	\$5.65	No Bid
	Total Cost	\$522.50	\$522.50	\$621.50	No Bid
Brand Name		KW Performance		Medallion Plus	
10w20 110 gal	Unit Cost	\$7.04	\$7.04	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Cost	\$774.40	\$774.40	No Bid	No Bid
Brand Name		KW Performance		Medallion Plus	
5w20 Synthetic Blend 110 gal	Unit Cost	\$4.75	\$4.75	\$5.65	No Bid
	Total Cost	\$522.50	\$522.50	\$621.50	No Bid
Brand Name		KW Performance		Medallion Plus	
10w30 CJ4 1595 gal	Unit Cost	\$12.49	\$12.49	\$9.99	No Bid
	Total Cost	\$19,921.55	\$19,921.55	\$15,934.05	No Bid
Brand Name		Mobil		Mobil Delvac	
10w30 1595 gal	Unit Cost	\$4.75	\$4.75	\$4.95	No Bid
	Total Cost	\$7,576.25	\$7,576.25	\$7,895.25	No Bid
Brand Name		KW Performance		Medallion Plus	
5w20 1595 gal	Unit Cost	\$4.75	\$4.75	\$4.95	No Bid
	Total Cost	\$7,576.25	\$7,576.25	\$7,895.25	No Bid
Brand Name		KW Performance		Medallion Plus	
10w20 1595 gal	Unit Cost	\$7.04	\$7.04	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Cost	\$11,228.80	\$11,228.80	No Bid	No Bid
Brand Name		KW Performance		Medallion Plus	
55-100 gallon+ storage containers	Supplied by Vendor: Y/N	Yes	Yes		
	Indicate size of tank	Current Tanks	Current Tanks		
NOTES					

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 11/19/15
Bid/RFP: 15-105 Petroleum Prods

Miscellaneous Products		I	II	I	II
Grease Cartridge (Moly)	Unit Cost	\$2.45	\$2.45	\$33.73 (10x1)	No Bid
	Total Cost	\$441.00	\$441.00	\$607.14	No Bid
Brand Name		Mobil		Mobil	
Hydraulic Oil 10wHTF	Unit Cost	\$6.99	\$6.99	\$7.75	No Bid
	Total Cost	\$3,075.65	\$3,075.65	\$3,410.00	No Bid
Brand Name		Mobil		Mobil	
Gear Lube 75w90	Unit Cost	\$2.49	\$2.49	\$20.14-Keg \$17.94-Drum	No Bid
	Total Cost	\$1,245.00	\$1,245.00	\$10,070.00-Keg \$8,970.00-Drum	No Bid
Brand Name		KW Performance		Mobil Delvac	
Gear Lube 80w140	Unit Cost	\$1.00	\$1.00	\$28.17-Keg \$23.07-Drum	No Bid
	Total Cost	\$500.00	\$500.00	\$14,085.00-Keg \$11,535.00-Drum	No Bid
Brand Name		KW Performance		Mobil	
Synthetic Hi-Temp Grease	Unit Cost	\$6.55	\$6.55	\$71.54 (10x1)	No Bid
	Total Cost	\$65.50	\$65.50	\$71.54	No Bid
Brand Name		Mobil		Mobil	
Windshield Washer Fluid, Blue 55gal drums	Unit Cost	\$1.45	\$1.45	\$2.25	No Bid
	Total Cost	\$478.50	\$478.50	\$742.50	No Bid
Brand Name		Champion		Peak Pre Mix	
Windshield Washer Fluid, Red 55gal drums	Unit Cost	\$1.95	\$1.95	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Cost	\$429.00	\$429.00	No Bid	No Bid
Brand Name		Champion			
Windshield Washer Fluid, 55gal drums	Unit Cost	\$1.45	\$1.45	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Cost	\$319.00	\$319.00	No Bid	No Bid
Brand Name		Champion			
55-100 gallon+ storage containers	Supplied by Vendor: Y/N	Yes	Yes	Yes	
	Indicate size of tank	Current Tanks	Current Tanks	330gal or 275gal	
Brand Name				With Graco Pump	
Transmission Fluid	Unit Cost	\$4.75	\$4.75	\$5.38	No Bid
	Total Cost	\$1,045.00	\$1,045.00	\$1,183.60	No Bid
Brand Name		KW Performance		Medallion Plus	
Anti-freeze HD low silicate meets ASTM4985 50/50 mix.	Unit Cost	\$8.35	\$8.35	\$5.56	No Bid
	Total Cost			\$305.80	No Bid
Brand Name		Mobil		Global Auto	

Sent to _ potential bidders. Submittals received from 4.

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 11/19/15
 Bid/RFP: 15-105 Petroleum Prods

Vendor City/State	RILCO INC ROCK ISLAND IL	FEECE OIL MINOOKA IL
Original Signature		YES
Mandatory Pages Included?		YES
Motor Oils	I	II
15W40 (CJ-4) 495 gal	Unit Cost Total Cost	\$7.47 \$3,697.65
Brand Name		Peak
10w30 110 gal	Unit Cost Total Cost	\$6.42 \$706.20
Brand Name		Peak
5w30 110 gal	Unit Cost Total Cost	\$6.45 \$709.50
Brand Name		Peak
10w20 110 gal	Unit Cost Total Cost	No Bid No Bid
Brand Name		
5w20 Synthetic Blend 110 gal	Unit Cost Total Cost	\$6.47 \$711.70
Brand Name		Peak
10w30 CJ4 1595 gal	Unit Cost Total Cost	\$8.11 \$12,935.45
Brand Name		Conoco
10w30 1595 gal	Unit Cost Total Cost	\$5.92 \$9,442.40
Brand Name		Peak
5w20 1595 gal	Unit Cost Total Cost	\$5.97 \$9,522.15
Brand Name		Peak
10w20 1595 gal	Unit Cost Total Cost	No Bid No Bid
Brand Name		
55-100 gallon+ storage containers	Supplied by Vendor: Y/N Indicate size of tank	Yes *
		Yes *
NOTES		*Several sizes available, depends on space

**Non Responsive/Non Responsible
 Turned in canceled Bid 15-81 Documents
 instead of Bid 15-105**

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 11/19/15
Bid/RFP: 15-105 Petroleum Prods

Miscellaneous Products		I	II	I	II
Grease Cartridge (Moly)	Unit Cost			\$2.58	\$2.58
	Total Cost			\$464.40	\$464.40
Brand Name				Conoco	
Hydraulic Oil 10wHTF	Unit Cost			\$7.52	\$7.52
	Total Cost			\$3,308.80	\$3,308.80
Brand Name				Conoco	
Gear Lube 75w90	Unit Cost			\$27.11	\$27.11
	Total Cost			\$13,555.00	\$13,555.00
Brand Name				Conoco	
Gear Lube 80w140	Unit Cost			\$27.47	\$27.47
	Total Cost			\$13,735.00	\$13,735.00
Brand Name				Conoco	
Synthetic Hi-Temp Grease	Unit Cost			\$570.00	\$570.00
	Total Cost			\$570.00	\$570.00
Brand Name				Conoco	
Windshield Washer Fluid, Blue 55gal drums	Unit Cost			\$3.05	\$3.05
	Total Cost			\$1,006.50	\$1,006.50
Brand Name				Peak	
Windshield Washer Fluid, Red 55gal drums	Unit Cost			\$3.50	\$3.50
	Total Cost			\$770.00	\$770.00
Brand Name				Peak	
Windshield Washer Fluid, 55gal drums	Unit Cost			\$3.05	\$3.05
	Total Cost			\$671.00	\$671.00
Brand Name				Peak	
55-100 gallon+ storage containers Supplied by Vendor: Y/N Indicate size of tank				Yes	Yes
				*	*
Brand Name				Peak	
Transmission Fluid	Unit Cost			\$11.16	\$11.16
	Total Cost			\$2,455.70	\$2,455.70
Brand Name				Peak	
Anti-freeze HD low silicate meets ASTM4985 50/50 mix.	Unit Cost			\$6.64/55gal	\$6.64/55gal
	Total Cost			\$365.20	\$365.20
Brand Name				Peak	
				*Several sizes available, depends on space	

Sent to _ potential bidders. Submittals received from 4.