

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 04/07/2015 @ 2:00
Bid/RFP: 15-25 Bulk Enhanced Rock Salt & Bulk Rock Salt

	VENDOR		VENDOR		VENDOR		VENDOR	
VENDOR NAME CITY & STATE	American Rock Salt Mt. Morris, NY		Cargill Deicing Technology North Olmsted, OH.		Central Salt, LLC Elgin, IL.		Detroit Salt, Co. Detroit, MI.	
ORIGINAL SIGNATURE	Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes	
MANDATORY PAGES/BID BOND	No		Yes		Yes		Yes	
<u>BULK ROCK SALT (UNTREATED)</u>								
	BASE YEAR 12/01/15 – 5/01/16	OPTION YEAR 2 12/01/16 – 5/01/17	BASE YEAR 12/01/15 – 5/01/16	OPTION YEAR 2 12/01/16 – 5/01/17	BASE YEAR 12/01/15 – 5/01/16	OPTION YEAR 2 12/01/16 – 5/01/17	BASE YEAR 12/01/15 – 5/01/16	OPTION YEAR 2 12/01/16 – 5/01/17
Village of Lake in the Hills Bid Unit Price	NO BID	NO BID	74.62	78.62	109.00	NO BID	87.58	89.58
City of McHenry Bid Unit Price			74.62	78.62	109.00		87.58	89.58
City of Woodstock Bid Unit Price			74.62	78.62	109.00		87.58	89.58
Village of Oakwood Bid Unit Price			74.62	78.62	109.00		87.58	89.58
City of Crystal Lake Bid Unit Price			74.62	78.62	109.00		87.58	89.58
Village of Algonquin Bid Unit Price			74.62	78.62	109.00		87.58	89.58
Village of Huntley Bid Unit Price			74.62	78.62	109.00		87.58	89.58
Village of Greenwood Bid Unit Price			74.62	78.62	109.00		87.58	89.58

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 04/07/2015 @ 2:00
Bid/RFP: 15-25 Bulk Enhanced Rock Salt & Bulk Rock Salt

ENHANCED (TREATED) BULK ROCK SALT								
	BASE YEAR 12/01/15 – 5/01/16	OPTION YEAR 2 12/01/16 – 5/01/17	BASE YEAR 12/01/15 – 5/01/16	OPTION YEAR 2 12/01/16 – 5/01/17	BASE YEAR 12/01/15 – 5/01/16	OPTION YEAR 2 12/01/16 – 5/01/17	BASE YEAR 12/01/15 – 5/01/16	OPTION YEAR 2 12/01/16 – 5/01/17
McHenry County Division of Transportation Bid Unit Price	* NO BID	* NO BID	79.26	83.26	116.95	** NO BID	*** NO BID	** NO BID
City of Cary Bid Unit Price			79.26	83.26	116.95			
GRAND TOTAL			755.48	795.48	1,105.90		700.64***	716.64***
Savings			442.44	402.44	92.02		497.28***	481.28***

- * No Bid
- ** No Bid Option Year Two
- *** No Bid for Enhanced Salt

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 04/07/2015 @ 2:00
Bid/RFP: 15-25 Bulk Enhanced Rock Salt & Bulk Rock Salt

	VENDOR		VENDOR		VENDOR		VENDOR	
VENDOR NAME CITY & STATE	Morton Salt Chicago, IL.		North American Salt Co. Overland Park, KS.					
ORIGINAL SIGNATURE	Yes		Yes					
MANDATORY PAGES/BID BOND	Yes		Yes					
<u>BULK ROCK SALT (UNTREATED)</u>								
	BASE YEAR 12/01/15 – 5/01/16	OPTION YEAR 2 12/01/16 – 5/01/17	BASE YEAR 12/01/15 – 5/01/16	OPTION YEAR 2 12/01/16 – 5/01/17	BASE YEAR 12/01/15 – 5/01/16	OPTION YEAR 2 12/01/16 – 5/01/17	BASE YEAR 12/01/15 – 5/01/16	OPTION YEAR 2 12/01/16 – 5/01/17
Village of Lake in the Hills Bid Unit Price	149.74	149.74	73.80	76.01				
City of McHenry Bid Unit Price	149.74	149.74	70.51	72.63				
City of Woodstock Bid Unit Price	149.74	149.74	71.51	73.66				
Village of Oakwood Bid Unit Price	149.74	149.74	72.98	75.17				
City of Crystal Lake Bid Unit Price	149.74	149.74	72.24	74.41				
Village of Algonquin Bid Unit Price	149.74	149.74	72.98	75.17				
Village of Huntley Bid Unit Price	149.74	149.74	72.98	75.17				
Village of Greenwood Bid Unit Price	149.74	149.74	71.51	73.66				

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 04/07/2015 @ 2:00
Bid/RFP: 15-25 Bulk Enhanced Rock Salt & Bulk Rock Salt

ENHANCED (TREATED) BULK ROCK SALT								
	BASE YEAR 12/01/15 – 5/01/16	OPTION YEAR 2 12/01/16 – 5/01/17	BASE YEAR 12/01/15 – 5/01/16	OPTION YEAR 2 12/01/16 – 5/01/17	BASE YEAR 12/01/15 – 5/01/16	OPTION YEAR 2 12/01/16 – 5/01/17	BASE YEAR 12/01/15 – 5/01/16	OPTION YEAR 2 12/01/16 – 5/01/17
McHenry County Division of Transportation Bid Unit Price	** NO BID ** **	** NO BID ** **	83.56	86.07				
City of Cary Bid Unit Price			85.03	87.58				
GRAND TOTAL	1,197.92***	1,197.92***	747.10	769.53				
Savings			450.82	428.39				

Sent to **21** potential bidders
 Submittals received from **6**.