

*[Handwritten Signature]*

# SUMMARY SHEET

DATE: 20141117

McHENRY COUNTY PURCHASING

BID: 14-98 BREAKROOM

	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
Signed Pages	Associated Electrical Contractors, Inc. [Woodstock, IL] YES	Boller Constriction Company, Inc. [Waukegan, IL] YES	Carmichael Construction, Inc. [Marengo, IL] YES
Mandatory Pages	YES	YES	YES
Bond/Check	YES	YES	YES
<b>AREA A</b>			
Base Bid A General Contractor	NO BID	\$8,650.00	\$830.00
Alt A-GC-1: Paint	NO BID	\$1,000.00	\$760.00
Alt A-GC-2: Flooring	NO BID	\$4,250.00	\$2,060.00
Alt A-GC-3: Casework	NO BID	\$7,000.00	\$6,800.00
Base Bid A Mechanical Contractor	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Base Bid A Electrical Contractor	\$6,100.00	NO BID	NO BID
Base Bid A Plumbing Contractor	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID



# SUMMARY SHEET

DATE: 20141117

McHENRY COUNTY PURCHASING

BID: 14-98 BREAKROOM

<u>AREA B</u>				
Base Bid <b>B</b> General Contractor	NO BID		\$28,300.00	\$16,949.00
Alt <b>B</b> -GC-1: Paint	NO BID		\$1,400.00	\$1,392.00
Alt <b>B</b> -GC-2: Flooring	NO BID		\$7,500.00	\$2,730.00
<hr/>				
Base Bid <b>B</b> Mechanical Contractor	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
Base Bid <b>B</b> Electrical Contractor	\$5,400.00		NO BID	NO BID
Base Bid <b>B</b> Plumbing Contractor	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
<b>Grand Total</b>	<b>\$11,500.00</b>	<b>ON: Base Bid A Electrical Contractor + Base Bid B Electrical Contractor</b>	<b>\$58,100.00</b>	<b>\$31,521</b>
				<b>ON: Base Bid A General Contractor + Paint (a) + Flooring (a) + Casework (a) + Base Bid B General Contractor + Paint (b) +Flooring (b)</b>

# SUMMARY SHEET

DATE: 20141117

McHENRY COUNTY PURCHASING

BID: 14-98 BREAKROOM

	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	MG Mechanical Contracting, Inc. [Woodstock, IL]	Jensen's Plumbing & Heating, Inc. [Woodstock, IL]	WM Tonyan & Sons, Inc. [McHenry, IL]
Signed Pages	YES	YES	YES
Mandatory Pages	YES	YES	YES
Bond/Check	YES	YES	YES
<b>AREA A</b>			
Base Bid A General Contractor	NO BID	NO BID	\$48,000.00
Alt A-GC-1: Paint	NO BID	NO BID	\$4,250.00
Alt A-GC-2: Flooring	NO BID	NO BID	\$14,100.00
Alt A-GC-3: Casework	NO BID	NO BID	\$8,900.00
Base Bid A Mechanical Contractor	\$11,150.00	\$9,874.00	NO BID
Base Bid A Electrical Contractor	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Base Bid A Plumbing Contractor	NO BID	\$11,700.00	NO BID

# SUMMARY SHEET

DATE: 20141117

McHENRY COUNTY PURCHASING

BID: 14-98 BREAKROOM

<b>AREA B</b>		
Base Bid <b>B</b> General Contractor	NO BID	NO BID
Alt <b>B</b> -GC-1: Paint	NO BID	NO BID
Alt <b>B</b> -GC-2: Flooring	NO BID	NO BID
<hr/>		
Base Bid <b>B</b> Mechanical Contractor	\$1,900.00	NO BID
Base Bid <b>B</b> Electrical Contractor	NO BID	NO BID
Base Bid <b>B</b> Plumbing Contractor	NO BID	NO BID
<b>Grand Total</b>	<b>\$13,400.00</b> <u>ON:</u> Base Bid <b>A</b> Mechanical Contractor + Base Bid <b>B</b> Mechanical Contractor	<b>\$21,574.00</b> <u>ON:</u> Base Bid <b>A</b> Mechanical Contractor + Base Bid <b>A</b> Plumbing Contractor
		<b>\$75,250.00</b> <u>ON:</u> Base Bid <b>A</b> General Contractor + Paint (a) + Flooring (a) + Casework (a)