

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date:
Bid/RFP: 14-39 Linens VH

		VENDOR			VENDOR		
Vendor City/State		HP PRODUCTS INDIANAPOLIS IN			PHOENIX TEXTILES O'FALLON MO		
ORIGINAL SIGNATURE		YES					
Description	UM	I	II	III	I	II	III
Pillowcase T/180 White – 55 Ctn/45 Poly Ambassador	EA	\$1.24	\$1.38	\$1.53	\$1.103 Sold only by the dozen		
Patient Gown Overlap Ties – Blue Snowflake On White – Drill - Medium	EA	\$2.24	\$2.49	\$2.77	\$3.496 Sold only by the dozen		
Underpad Pebble Beach – Twill Bonded – All 1 Ply	DOZ	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$77.93		
Wheelchair Pad Fenix – Brushed Top/Boradcloth Vinyl	DOZ	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$41.33		
Clothing Protectoe White – Terry Ex Tie Closure	DOZ	\$28.80	\$32.00	\$35.56	\$28.74		
Hand Towel Ever-Dri White – 86/14 Cot/Poly	DOZ	\$7.43	\$8.26	\$9.18	\$12.99		
Washcloth Ever-Dri White – 86/14 Cot/Poly	DOZ	\$8.00	\$8.89	\$9.88	\$3.25 Case pack 5dz		
Bar Mop- White Ribbed	DOZ	\$5.68 100 doz per case	\$6.30 100 doz per case	\$7.00 100 doz per case	\$5.30		
Blankets – Microloft or Vellux (twin)	DOZ	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$154.20		
Flat Sheets – 100% Cotton Unbleached (twin)	DOZ	\$44.63	\$49.59	\$55.10	\$58.95		
Draw Sheet Sateen – 100% Cotton Unbleached	DOZ	\$56.26	\$62.51	\$69.46	\$83.00		
Bath Towel White – 86/14 Blend “Ambassador”	DOZ	\$16.43	\$18.26	\$20.29	\$16.98		
Stretch Sheet- 55/45 Cotton/Poly 19 Oz	DOZ	\$58.13	\$64.59	\$71.77	\$68.54		
Pillow Nylon Wipeable – Fluid Resistant Lt Beige	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.25 Case pack of 12		
Does your company have a formal safety policy and your employees participate in safety training?		Yes			Yes		
Upon request, would you be able to provide the County with a copy of your safety policy?		Yes			Yes		
Samples Included?		No			No		
Savings							

Sent to 6 potential bidders. Submittals received from 2.

INTERNAL USE ONLY