

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 9/26/13  
 Bid/RFP: 13-69

SPECIFICATIONS		VENDOR		VENDOR	
		AL WARREN OIL CO		CONSERV FS	
<b>ORIGINAL SIGNATURE</b>		SUMMIT IL		WOODSTOCK IL	
<b>Group I: 225,000 gallons (approx) Lead Free Regular Grade Gasoline with 10% Ethanol.</b>		I	II	I	II
<b>Refiner:</b>		Multiple		Various	
<b>Product Terminal Location:</b>		Multiple		Des Plaines	
<b>PRICE DIFFERENTIAL</b>		OPIS	OPIS	OPIS	OPIS
<b>A</b>	Plus \$ or Minus \$	+\$0.0808	+\$0.0808	+\$0.020	+\$0.020
<b>B</b>	Indicate applicable taxes and amount of taxes which are included in price differential bid:	0.1900	0.1900	0.190	0.190
		0.0110	0.0110	0.012	0.012
		\$0.2010	\$0.2010	0.2020	0.2020
<b>C</b>	Indicate transportation cost and from what terminal if not included in A & B above:	Included	Included	Des Plaines \$0.0385	Des Plaines \$0.0385
<b>D</b>	To allow for charge in transportation cost over the life of the contract, vendor may quarterly adjust up or down the transportation cost. Adjustment to be made on basis of fuel cost increase or deduction from time of bid.	0	0	Des Plaines	Des Plaines
<i>Terminal</i>		Daily Chicago		Des Plaines	
<b>E</b>	*Indicate price guide using	OPIS Rack Chicago Daily		Chicago OPIS Low	
*Transport Loads(daily price) 7000gal; short loads flat \$350.00 + OPIS + .0388				Akro Gold Additive + \$0.026	
<b>Group II: 50,000 gallons (approx) Premium Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel</b>		I	II	I	II
<b>Refiner:</b>		Multiple		Various	
<b>Product Terminal Location:</b>		Multiple		Des Plaines	
<b>PRICE DIFFERENTIAL</b>		OPIS	OPIS	OPIS	OPIS
<b>A</b>	Plus \$ or Minus \$	+\$0.0808	+\$0.0808	+\$0.025	+\$0.025
<b>B</b>	Indicate applicable taxes and amount of taxes which are included in price differential bid:	0.2150	0.2150	0.215	0.215
		0.0110	0.0110	0.012	0.012
		\$0.2260	\$0.2260	0.2270	0.2270
<b>C</b>	Indicate transportation cost and from what terminal if not included in A & B above:	Included	Included	0.0425	0.0425
<b>D</b>	To allow for charge in transportation cost over the life of the contract, vendor may quarterly adjust up or down the transportation cost. Adjustment to be made on basis of fuel cost increase or deduction from time of bid.	0	0		
<i>Terminal</i>		Daily Chicago		Des Plaines	
<b>E</b>	*Indicate price guide using	OPIS Rack Chicago Daily		Chicago OPIS Low	
*Transport Loads(daily price) 7000gal; short loads flat \$350.00				See Bid for additive fees	
<b>Group III: Motor Oils</b>		I	II	I	II
15W40 (CJ-4)	Unit Cost	\$8.62	\$8.62		
495 gal	Total Cost	\$4,266.90	\$4,266.90		
<b>Brand Name</b>					
5w30	Unit Cost	\$7.33	\$7.33		
110 gal	Total Cost	\$806.30	\$806.30		
<b>Brand Name</b>					
10w30	Unit Cost	\$7.18	\$7.18		
110 gal	Total Cost	\$789.80	\$789.80		
<b>Brand Name</b>					
5w20	Unit Cost	\$7.33	\$7.33		
110 gal	Total Cost	\$806.30	\$806.30		
<b>Brand Name</b>					
10w20	Unit Cost	No Bid			
110 gal	Total Cost	No Bid			
<b>Brand Name</b>					
5w30	Unit Cost	\$7.33	\$7.33		
1595 gal	Total Cost	\$11,691.35	\$11,691.35		
<b>Brand Name</b>					

NO BID

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 9/26/13  
 Bid/RFP: 13-69

10w30 1595 gal	Unit Cost	\$7.18	\$7.18		
	Total Cost	\$11,452.10	\$11,452.10		
<b>Brand Name</b>					
5w20 1595 gal	Unit Cost	\$7.33	\$7.33		
	Total Cost	\$11,691.35	\$11,691.35		
<b>Brand Name</b>					
10w20 1595 gal	Unit Cost	No Bid			
	Total Cost				
<b>Brand Name</b>					
Storage containers & pumps 55-100 gals	Unit Cost	\$95.00	\$95.00		
	Total Cost	\$95.00	\$95.00		
<b>NOTES</b>		Delivery fees see Proposal			
<b>Group IV: Miscellaneous</b>		<b>I</b>	<b>II</b>	<b>I</b>	<b>II</b>
Transmission Fluid ATF III Mobil Multipurpose ATF or equal Synthetic ATF – Must be multi vehicle type that meets the OEM specifications for use in all 2005 model and later GM, Ford and Dodge vehicles.	Unit Cost	\$7.43	\$7.43		
	Total Cost	\$5,201.00	\$5,201.00		
<b>Brand Name</b>					
Grease Cartridge (Moly)	Unit Cost	\$133.34/cs	\$133.34/cs		
	Total Cost	\$800.04	\$800.04		
<b>Brand Name</b>					
Hydraulic Oil 10wHTF	Unit Cost	\$8.10	\$8.10		
	Total Cost	\$3,564.00	\$3,564.00		
<b>Brand Name</b>					
Gear Lube 75w90	Unit Cost	\$10.69	\$10.69		
	Total Cost	\$5,345.00	\$5,345.00		
<b>Brand Name</b>					
Gear Lube 80w140	Unit Cost	\$11.02	\$11.02		
	Total Cost	\$5,510.00	\$5,510.00		
<b>Brand Name</b>					
Synthetic Hi-Temp Grease	Unit Cost	\$234.03/cs	\$234.03/cs		
	Total Cost	\$234.03	\$234.03		
<b>Brand Name</b>					
Windshield Washer Fluid, Blue 55gal drums	Unit Cost	0	0		
	Total Cost	0	0		
<b>Brand Name</b>					
Windshield Washer Fluid, Red 55gal drums	Unit Cost	0	0		
	Total Cost	0	0		
<b>Brand Name</b>					
55-100 gallon+ storage containers	Unit Cost	\$95.00	\$95.00		
	Total Cost	\$95.00	\$95.00		
<b>Brand Name</b>					
Transmission Fluid	Unit Cost	\$7.43	\$7.43		
	Total Cost	\$1,634.60	\$1,634.60		
<b>Brand Name</b>					
Anti-freeze HD low silicate meets ASTM4985 50/50 mix.	Unit Cost	\$4.2947	\$4.2947		
	Total Cost	\$429.47	\$429.47		
<b>Brand Name</b>					

**NO BID**

**NO BID**

Sent to 14 potential bidders. Submittals received from 6.

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

**Date: 9/26/13**  
**Bid/RFP: 13-69**

SPECIFICATIONS		VENDOR		VENDOR	
<b>ORIGINAL SIGNATURE</b>		KELLEY WILLIAMS CO		LUKE OIL	
		ROCKFORD IL		HOBART IN	
<b>Group I: 225,000 gallons (approx) Lead Free Regular Grade Gasoline with 10% Ethanol.</b>		YES		YES	
<b>Refiner:</b>		I	II	I	II
<b>Product Terminal Location:</b>				Various	
				Des Plaines Forestview/Lemont	
<b>PRICE DIFFERENTIAL</b>				OPIS Des Plaines	
<b>A</b>	Plus \$ or Minus \$			\$-0.0096	+\$0.0186
<b>B</b>	Indicate applicable taxes and amount of taxes which are included in price differential bid:			None	None
<b>C</b>	Indicate transportation cost and from what terminal if not included in A & B above:			None	None
<b>D</b>	To allow for charge in transportation cost over the life of the contract, vendor may quarterly adjust up or down the transportation cost. Adjustment to be made on basis of fuel cost increase or deduction from time of bid.			None All taxes will be on a separate line	
<i>Terminal</i>				OPIS Des Plaines	
<b>E</b>	*Indicate price guide using			OPIS Des Plaines Daily	
<b>Group II: 50,000 gallons (approx) Premium Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel</b>		I	II	I	II
<b>Refiner:</b>				Various	
<b>Product Terminal Location:</b>				Des Plaines Forestview/Lemont	
<b>PRICE DIFFERENTIAL</b>				OPIS Des Plaines	
<b>A</b>	Plus \$ or Minus \$			+\$0.0401	+\$0.0401
<b>B</b>	Indicate applicable taxes and amount of taxes which are included in price differential bid:			None	None
<b>C</b>	Indicate transportation cost and from what terminal if not included in A & B above:			None	None
<b>D</b>	To allow for charge in transportation cost over the life of the contract, vendor may quarterly adjust up or down the transportation cost. Adjustment to be made on basis of fuel cost increase or deduction from time of bid.			0	0
<i>Terminal</i>				OPIS Des Plaines Daily	OPIS Des Plaines Daily
<b>E</b>	OPIS Rack Chicago Daily				
<b>Group III: Motor Oils</b>		I	II	I	II
15W40 (CJ-4)		\$7.70	\$7.70		
495 gal		\$3,811.50	\$3,811.50		
<b>Brand Name</b>		Mobil Fleet			
5w30		\$6.99	\$6.99		
110 gal		\$768.90	\$768.90		
<b>Brand Name</b>		KW			
10w30		\$6.99	\$6.99		
110 gal		\$768.90	\$768.90		
<b>Brand Name</b>		KW			
5w20		\$6.99	\$6.99		
110 gal		\$768.90	\$768.90		
<b>Brand Name</b>		KW			
10w20		\$12.00	\$12.00		
110 gal		\$1,320.00	\$1,320.00		
<b>Brand Name</b>		Mobil			
5w30		\$6.65	\$6.65		
1595 gal		\$10,606.75	\$10,606.75		
<b>Brand Name</b>		KW			

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 9/26/13  
 Bid/RFP: 13-69

10w30 1595 gal	Unit Cost	\$6.65	\$6.65		
	Total Cost	\$10,606.75	\$10,606.75		
<b>Brand Name</b>		KW			
5w20 1595 gal	Unit Cost	\$6.65	\$6.65		
	Total Cost	\$10,606.75	\$10,606.75		
<b>Brand Name</b>		KW			
10w20 1595 gal	Unit Cost	\$12.00	\$12.00		
	Total Cost	\$19,140.00	\$19,140.00		
<b>Brand Name</b>		Mobil			
Storage containers & pumps 55-100 gals	Unit Cost	0	0		
	Total Cost	0	0		
<b>NOTES</b>					
<b>Group IV: Miscellaneous</b>		<b>I</b>	<b>II</b>	<b>I</b>	<b>II</b>
Transmission Fluid ATF III Mobil Multipurpose ATF or equal Synthetic ATF – Must be multi vehicle type that meets the OEM specifications for use in all 2005 model and later GM, Ford and Dodge vehicles.	Unit Cost	\$6.65	\$6.65		
	Total Cost	\$4,655.00	\$4,655.00		
<b>Brand Name</b>		KW			
Grease Cartridge (Moly)	Unit Cost	\$2.56	\$2.56		
	Total Cost	\$460.80	\$460.80		
<b>Brand Name</b>		Mobil			
Hydraulic Oil 10wHTF	Unit Cost	\$7.55	\$7.55		
	Total Cost	\$3,322.00	\$3,322.00		
<b>Brand Name</b>		Mobil			
Gear Lube 75w90	Unit Cost	\$3.60/lb	\$3.60/lb		
	Total Cost	\$12,270	\$12,270		
<b>Brand Name</b>		Mobil			
Gear Lube 80w140	Unit Cost	\$3.69/lb	\$3.69/lb		
	Total Cost	\$12,579.55	\$12,579.55		
<b>Brand Name</b>		Mobil			
Synthetic Hi-Temp Grease	Unit Cost	\$69.50	\$69.50		
	Total Cost	\$69.50	\$69.50		
<b>Brand Name</b>		Mobil			
Windshield Washer Fluid, Blue 55gal drums	Unit Cost	\$1.45	\$1.45		
	Total Cost	\$478.50	\$478.50		
<b>Brand Name</b>		Champion			
Windshield Washer Fluid, Red 55gal drums	Unit Cost	\$1.95	\$1.95		
	Total Cost	\$429.00	\$429.00		
<b>Brand Name</b>		Champion			
55-100 gallon+ storage containers	Unit Cost	0	0		
	Total Cost	0	0		
<b>Brand Name</b>		KW			
Transmission Fluid	Unit Cost	\$6.65	\$6.65		
	Total Cost	\$1,463.00	\$1,463.00		
<b>Brand Name</b>		KW			
Anti-freeze HD low silicate meets ASTM4985 50/50 mix.	Unit Cost	\$8.85	\$8.85		
	Total Cost	\$486.75	\$486.75		
<b>Brand Name</b>		Deterdall			

Sent to 14 potential bidders. Submittals received from 6.

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 9/26/13  
 Bid/RFP: 13-69

SPECIFICATIONS		VENDOR		VENDOR	
		PARENT PETROLEUM		PETROLEUM TRADERS	
		ST CHARLES IL		FORT WAYNE IN	
<b>ORIGINAL SIGNATURE</b>		YES		YES	
<b>Group I: 225,000 gallons (approx) Lead Free Regular Grade Gasoline with 10% Ethanol.</b>		I	II	I	II
<b>Refiner:</b>		Various			
<b>Product Terminal Location:</b>		Des Plaines or Argo			
PRICE DIFFERENTIAL					
<b>A</b>	Plus \$ or Minus \$			+ \$0.0578	+ \$0.0578
<b>B</b>	Indicate applicable taxes and amount of taxes which are included in price differential bid:				
<b>C</b>	Indicate transportation cost and from what terminal if not included in A & B above:			N/A	N/A
<b>D</b>	To allow for charge in transportation cost over the life of the contract, vendor may quarterly adjust up or down the transportation cost. Adjustment to be made on basis of fuel cost increase or deduction from time of bid.				
<i>Terminal</i>				Des Plaines or Argo	
<b>E</b>	*Indicate price guide using			OPIS Daily Low	
<b>Group II: 50,000 gallons (approx) Premium Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel</b>		I	II	I	II
<b>Refiner:</b>		Various			
<b>Product Terminal Location:</b>		Des Plaines or Argo			
PRICE DIFFERENTIAL					
<b>A</b>	Plus \$ or Minus \$			+ \$0.0673	+ \$0.0673
<b>B</b>	Indicate applicable taxes and amount of taxes which are included in price differential bid:				
<b>C</b>	Indicate transportation cost and from what terminal if not included in A & B above:			N/A	N/A
<b>D</b>	To allow for charge in transportation cost over the life of the contract, vendor may quarterly adjust up or down the transportation cost. Adjustment to be made on basis of fuel cost increase or deduction from time of bid.				
<i>Terminal</i>				Des Plaines or Argo	
<b>E</b>	OPIS Rack Chicago Daily			OPIS Daily Low	
<b>Group III: Motor Oils</b>		I	II	I	II
15W40 (CJ-4) 495 gal		Unit Cost \$9.66	\$9.91		
		Total Cost \$4,781.70	\$4,905.45		
<b>Brand Name</b>		Dominion 3			
5w30 110 gal		Unit Cost \$9.46	\$9.71		
		Total Cost \$1,040.60	\$1,068.10		
<b>Brand Name</b>		Dominion 3			
10w30 110 gal		Unit Cost \$8.39	\$8.64		
		Total Cost \$922.90	\$950.40		
<b>Brand Name</b>		Dominion 3			
5w20 110 gal		Unit Cost \$8.46	\$8.71		
		Total Cost \$930.60	\$958.10		
<b>Brand Name</b>		Dominion 3			
10w20 110 gal		Unit Cost			
		Total Cost			
<b>Brand Name</b>		Dominion 3			
5w30 1595 gal		Unit Cost \$7.16	\$7.41		
		Total Cost \$11,420.20	\$11,818.95		
<b>Brand Name</b>		Dominion 3			
10w30 1595 gal		Unit Cost \$7.09	\$7.34		
		Total Cost \$11,308.55	\$11,707.30		
<b>Brand Name</b>		Dominion 3			

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

**Date: 9/26/13**  
**Bid/RFP: 13-69**

5w20 1595 gal	Unit Cost	\$7.16	\$7.41		
	Total Cost	\$11,420.20	\$11,818.95		
<b>Brand Name</b>		Dominion 3			
10w20 1595 gal	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
<b>Brand Name</b>					
Storage containers & pumps 55-100 gals	Unit Cost	On loan	On loan		
	Total Cost				
<b>NOTES</b>					
<b>Group IV: Miscellaneous</b>		<b>I</b>	<b>II</b>	<b>I</b>	<b>II</b>
Transmission Fluid ATF III Mobil Multipurpose ATF or equal Synthetic ATF – Must be multi vehicle type that meets the OEM specifications for use in all 2005 model and later GM, Ford and Dodge vehicles.	Unit Cost		\$7.61		
	Total Cost		\$5,327.00		
<b>Brand Name</b>		Dominion 3			
Grease Cartridge (Moly)	Unit Cost		\$3.12		
	Total Cost		\$561.60		
<b>Brand Name</b>		Conoco Philips			
Hydraulic Oil 10wHTF	Unit Cost		\$14.20		
	Total Cost		\$6,248.00		
<b>Brand Name</b>		Conoco Philips			
Gear Lube 75w90	Unit Cost		\$24.23		
	Total Cost		\$12,115.00		
<b>Brand Name</b>		Conoco Philips			
Gear Lube 80w140	Unit Cost		\$27.45		
	Total Cost		\$13,725.00		
<b>Brand Name</b>		Conoco Philips			
Synthetic Hi-Temp Grease	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
<b>Brand Name</b>					
Windshield Washer Fluid, Blue 55gal drums	Unit Cost		\$3.45		
	Total Cost		\$1,380.50		
<b>Brand Name</b>		Dominion 3			
Windshield Washer Fluid, Red 55gal drums	Unit Cost		\$5.45		
	Total Cost		\$1,199.00		
<b>Brand Name</b>		Dominion 3			
55-100 gallon+ storage containers	Unit Cost		On loan		
	Total Cost				
<b>Brand Name</b>					
Transmission Fluid	Unit Cost		\$18.75		
	Total Cost		\$4,125.00		
<b>Brand Name</b>		Conoco Philips			
Anti-freeze HD low silicate meets ASTM4985 50/50 mix.	Unit Cost		Market Price		
	Total Cost				
<b>Brand Name</b>					

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS