Sheriff’s Dept.

SUMMARY SHEET Date: 6/06/2013
County of McHenry Purchasing BID #13-42 PROVIDE POLICE VEHICLE
ACCESSORIES
VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
ADAMSON AUTO TRUCK GROUP GALLS LUND CHICAGO PARTS & | RAY O’'HERRON
SPECIFICATIONS Los Alamitos CA Bartlett IL Lexington KY Northbrook IL SOUND/POLICE Danwville IL
DEPT SYSTEMS
Mokena IL
ORIGINAL SIGNATURE YES YES YES YES YES YES
MANDATORY PAGES YES YES YES YES YES YES
8-S-L Setina partition for 2013 Cost ea.: $472.50 Cost ea.:$416.00 Cost ea.:$435.54 Cost €a.:$435.00 Cost ea.:$589.30 Cost ea.:$414.50
Cha rger; Total Cost: 53,30750
Qty. 7 Total Cost:$2,912.00 Total Cost:$3,048.78 Total Cost:$3,045.00 Total Cost: $4,125.10 Total Cost:$2,901.50

PKG-PSM-144 Havis Laptop Mount
kit;
Qty. 7

Cost €a.$195.85

Total Cost:$1,370.95

Cost ea.:$213.00

Total Cost:$1,491.00

NO BID

Cost ea.:$280.00

Total Cost:$1,960.00

Cost ea.:$218.00

Total Cost:$1,526.00

Cost ea.:$202.95

Total Cost:$1,420.65

ES100 Federal Signal 100wt.
Speaker
Qty. 11

Cost ea.:$162.25

Total Cost:$1,784.75

Cost ea.:$194.00

Total Cost:$2,134.00

Cost ea.:$162.48

Total Cost:$1,787.28

Cost ea.:$195.00

Total Cost:$2,145.00

Cost ea.$139.00

Total Cost:$1,529.00

Cost ea.:$142.50

Total Cost:$1,567.50

ESB-TAR11 Federal Signal Speaker
Bracket
Qty. 11

Cost ea.:$162.25

Total Cost:$1,784.75

Cost ea.:$22.00

Total Cost:242.00

Cost ea.:$17.92

Total Cost:$197.12

Cost ea.:$24.00

Total Cost:$264.00

Cost ea.:$15.00

Total Cost:$165.00

Cost ea.:$21.50

Total Cost:$236.50

EP2SGS1R Sound Off Predator LED
Red; Qty. 4

Cost ea.:$104.85

Total Cost:$419.40

Cost ea.:$97.00

Total Cost:$388.00

Cost ea.:$102.37

Total Cost:$409.48

Cost ea.:$129.00

Total Cost:$516.00

Cost ea.:$139.45

Total Cost:$557.80

Cost ea.:$97.95

Total Cost:$391.80

EP2SGS1B Sound Off Predator Led
Blue
Qty. 4

Cost ea.:$104.85

Total Cost:$419.40

Cost ea.:$97.00

Total Cost:$388.00

Cost ea.:$102.37

Total Cost:$409.48

Cost ea.:$129.00

Total Cost:$516.00

Cost ea.:$139.45

Total Cost:$557.80

Cost ea.:$97.95

Total Cost:$391.80

LI-VC-2613 LUND 12in. Consol for
Tahoe
Qty. 4

NO BID

Cost ea.:$179.00

Total Cost:$716.00

NO BID

Cost ea.:$188.47

Total Cost:$753.88

Cost ea.:$183.50

Total Cost:$734.00

Cost €a.:176.50

Total Cost:$706.00
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Sheriff’s Dept.

SUMMARY SHEET

County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 6/06/2013
BID #13-42 PROVIDE POLICE VEHICLE
ACCESSORIES

LI-SUTA10-BASE Lund seat bolt
mounting base for Tahoe

Cost ea.:$133.00

Cost ea.:$140.56

Cost ea.:$156.00

Cost ea.:$150.50

Qty. 4 NO BID Total Cost:$532.00 NO BID Total Cost:$562.24 Total Cost:$624.00 Total Cost:$602.00
LI-HD-ARM-9 LUND Flip Up Cost €a.:$113.00 Cost €a.:$118.58 Cost €a.:$123.00 Cost ea.:$115.50
Armrest w/ 9-1/4' Pole
Qty. 11 NO BID Total Cost:$1,243.00 NO BID Total Cost:$1,304.38 Total Cost:$1,353.00 Total Cost:$1,270.50
LI-VH-CGR2410 LUND 2011 Cost ea.:$252.00 Cost ea.:$255.48 Cost ea.:$235.00 Cost ea.:$207.00
up Charger Console
Qty. 7 NO BID Total Cost:$1,764.00 NO BID Total Cost:$1,788.36 Total Cost:$1,645.00 Total Cost:$1,449.00
LI-CHB-2EN LUND Cupholder for Cost ea.:$32.00 Cost ea.:$30.88 Cost ea.:$38.50 Cost ea.:$27.75
above
Qty. 7 NO BID Total Cost:$224.00 NO BID Total Cost:$216.16 Total Cost:$269.50 Total Cost:$194.25
LI-CGR-BPE LUND VH-Charger base Cost €a.:$28.00 Cost €a.:$26.62 Cost ea.:$31.00 Cost ea.:$34.45
plate ext.
Qty. 7 NO BID Total Cost:$196.00 NO BID Total Cost:$186.34 Total Cost:$217.00 Total Cost:$241.15
CG-X Havis Charge guard Cost ea.:$59.25 Cost ea.:$76.00 Cost ea.:$71.60 Cost ea.:$66.00 Cost ea.:$64.30
Qty. 11

Total Cost:$651.75 Total Cost:$836.00 NO BID Total Cost:$787.60 Total Cost:$726.00 Total Cost:$707.30

21TRPL47A2RBAS-N3 Code 3 LED
lightbar w/arrow, pre-emption and
Black covers and 2013 Charger
mounting brackets

Qty. 7

Cost ea.:$1,466.00

Total Cost:$10,262.00

Cost ea.:$1,129.00

Total Cost:$7,903.00

Cost ea.:$1,064.82

Total Cost:$7,453.74

Cost ea.:$1,078.00

Total Cost:$7,546.00

Cost ea.:$1,295.00

Total Cost:$9,065.00

Cost ea.:$1,125.00

Total Cost:$7,875.00

21TRPL47A2RBAS-N3 Code 3 LED
lightbar w/arrow, pre-emption and
Black covers and 2013 Tahoe
mounting brackets; Qty. 4

Cost ea.:$1,466.00

Total Cost:$5,864.00

Cost ea.:$1,129.00

Total Cost:$4,516.00

Cost ea.:51,064.82

Total Cost:$4,259.28

Cost ea.:$1,078.00

Total Cost:$4,312.00

Cost ea.:$1,295.00

Total Cost:$5,180.00

Cost ea.:$1,125.00

Total Cost:$4,500.00

C-MD-202 Havis swivel mount
Qty.11

Cost ea.:$62.50

Total Cost:$687.50

Cost ea.:$53.00

Total Cost:$583.00

NO BID

Cost ea.:$71.00

Total Cost:$781.00

Cost ea.:$56.00

Total Cost:$616.00

Cost ea.:$50.00

Total Cost:$550.00

SETINA partition for 2013 Tahoe
Qty. 1

NO BID

Cost ea.:$496.00

Total Cost:$496.00

Cost ea.:$462.18

Total Cost:$462.18

Cost ea.:$495.00

Total Cost:4495.00

NO BID

Cost ea.:$452.00

Total Cost:$452.00
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Sheriff’s Dept.

SUMMARY SHEET Date: 6/06/2013
County of McHenry Purchasing BID #13-42 PROVIDE POLICE VEHICLE
ACCESSORIES
SK156 Galls siren controller Cost ea.:$429.00 Cost ea.:$317.15 Cost ea.: $429.00 Cost ea.:$429.00
Q- 11 NO BID Total Cost:$4,719.00 Total Cost:$3,488.65 NO BID Total Cost:$4,719.00 Total Cost:$4,719.00

8-VS-L Setina partition for 2013
Tahoe

Cost ea.:$532.00

Total Cost:$532.00

Cost ea.:$496.00

Total Cost:$496.00

Cost ea.:$462.18

Total Cost:$462.18

Cost ea.:$495.00

Total Cost:$495.00

Cost ea.:$590.00

Total Cost:$590.00

Cost ea.:$452.40

Total Cost:$452.40

Qty. 1
GRAND TOTAL n/a $31,779.00 $21,978.52 $27,673.96 $34,199.20 $30,628.35
Does your company have a formal YES YES YES NO YES YES
safety policy and your employees
participate in safety training?
Upon request, would you be able YES YES YES NO YES YES
to provide the County with a copy
of your safety policy?
Date of delivery after receipt of N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

purchase order.

Sent to 8 potential bidders
Submittals received from 6.
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